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(NAPSA)—What was once
thought to be an unavoidable con-
sequence of certain kinds of
surgery, including C-sections, can
now actually be prevented. 

Almost one-third of all U.S.
births are now performed via
cesarean section—and to most
women, it comes as a surprise.
Unfortunately, recovery can be
difficult, even when delivery is
performed by an experienced
OB/GYN doctor. Internal scar tis-
sue commonly forms after a C-sec-
tion and can be a major cause of
complications; however, it can be
avoided—if OB/GYNs choose to
employ preventative measures
now available. 

Adhesions are fibrous bands, or
scar tissues that form between
internal tissues and organs as a
result of injury during surgery,
and can complicate subsequent
procedures including C-sections.
In a recent study, adhesions were
found in over one-half of patients
having a C-section who did not
receive an adhesion barrier.
Women undergoing C-sections,
whether planned or unexpected,
are typically unaware of the risk
of adhesion formation from this
procedure. Studies suggest that
adhesions can delay delivery of
the newborn as well as adversely
affect fetal well-being. In other
types of surgery, adhesions
account for up to 20 percent of
infertility cases, up to 20 to 50
percent of chronic pelvic pain
cases and up to 74 percent of
bowel obstructions. 

Although surgical technique
can reduce the formation of adhe-
sions, this may not be enough and
is no longer the only preventative
measure. Adhesion barriers, such
as Seprafilm, are now available to

prevent adhesions from forming
following C-sections and other
gynecologic and abdominal sur-
geries. Adhesion barriers work to
separate surfaces while injured
tissues in the pelvis and abdomen
heal, and have been effective in
reducing the incidence, extent and
severity of adhesions following
surgery.

Seprafilm Adhesion Barrier is
composed of chemically modified
carbohydrates, or complex sugars,
that occur naturally within the
body and are common components
of food, cosmetic and pharmaceu-
tical products. The absorbable
barrier is placed on the surgical
wound site before closure to pre-
vent adhesions from forming. The
film becomes a gel and is slowly
absorbed by the body within a
week, while normal tissue healing
takes place. Components are
passed from the body in less than
28 days. 

In a recent study, patients
treated with Seprafilm demon-
strated a significant decrease in
the incidence of adhesions at
repeat C-section, as well as a
decrease in delivery time. Learn
more at www.seprafilm.com. 

Better Healing After C-Section

Sheets of Seprafilm, shown here,
are used to reduce the formation
of adhesions resulting from open
pelvic and abdominal procedures.

(NAPSA)—No matter the sea-
son, there always seems to be a
reason to celebrate. In fact, the
National Retail Federation esti-
mates that consumers spend over
$546 billion planning for different
holiday celebrations throughout
the year—and that doesn’t even
include such events as bache-
lorette parties, football get-togeth-
ers and baby showers.

With a plethora of different
social gatherings to attend, trying
to remember the perfect party eti-
quette for each occasion can take
the fun out of any fiesta. Here are
a few hints to help you survive
any engagement:

• Make sure to respond by the
given RSVP date, as this will help
the hostess plan accordingly for
the exact number of guests
attending. If you plan to decline,
be honest in the reason you can-
not attend. 

• When choosing the proper
hostess gift, make sure it is some-
thing that doesn’t require work to
appreciate. A bouquet of flowers
forces the hostess to find a place to
set them, but a bottle of wine or
premixed drinks, such as Cocktails
by Jenn—a collection of ready-to-
drink, naturally flavored, premium
vodka martinis—can be enjoyed by
guests or set aside for later use.

• Make sure to arrive on time,
as not to hold up the festivities. If
you wish to bring a guest and
were not formally invited with a
date, check with the hostess
before arriving with an unan-
nounced “plus-one.” The hostess
will appreciate your consideration
and it will diffuse any uncomfort-
able situations before they arise.

• Party conversation should be
kept light and fun—avoid any
uncomfortable or controversial top-
ics. Pick up a magazine, watch the
news or read the latest headlines
before attending an event—this
will provide additional fodder to
help keep a conversation flowing.

• If you are attending a dinner
party, make sure to stay a mini-
mum of one hour after the main
course is finished so it doesn’t
appear that you just came to “eat
and run.” When you are ready to
leave, make your exit gracefully,
acknowledging the remaining
guests and thanking your hosts
one more time.

Whatever the occasion and
wherever the party, the point is to
relax and have a good time. If you
follow that advice, proper party
etiquette is sure to fall into place.
To find out more entertaining and
etiquette tips, visit www.cocktails
byjenn.com.

Party Etiquette Deciphered: Tips To Survive Any Soiree

Ideal hostess gifts are ones that
enhance the party and help the
hostess, such as new ready-to-
drink vodka martinis sold in fun,
colorful totes.

Protecting Your Eyes 
In Winter

(NAPSA)—Even with cold
weather upon us, don’t pack up
your sunglasses just yet. The sun
can be damaging to your eyes all
year-round, especially in winter
when ultraviolet radiation bounces
off of snow, water and even clouds. 

According to Dr. Dean Edell, a
licensed ophthalmologist and host
of America’s number-two syndi-
cated radio talk show, “Sunglasses
with 100 percent UVA and UVB
protection are the equivalent of

sunscreen for your eyes, and will
protect against harmful ultravio-
let rays that can lead to cataracts,
macular degeneration and even
skin cancer around the eyelids.” 

For reading outdoors, Dr. Dean
Edell suggests switching to a
reader/sunglasses combination
that has both UV protection and
magnification. Or you can pur-
chase clip-on lenses that attach to
your reading glasses. For more
information on products like these,
visit www.zoomeyeworks.com.

Keep in mind that the tint of the
lens does not indicate UV protec-
tion, so check the label. 

So don’t leave home without
your 100 percent UVA and UVB
protective sunglasses. 

It’s important to protect your
eyes from the sun, whatever the
weather. 

(NAPSA)—It was a shining
moment in cardstacking history
when the first-ever suspended
house of cards was unveiled at the
2006 World Series of Poker. Loctite
Super Glue commissioned the cre-
ation of the 400-pound, 12-by-18-
foot structure, which attracted the
eyes of poker players and card-
playing fanatics at the tourna-
ment. Its presence could not help
but beg the question: What does
super glue have to do with playing
cards?

When Bryan Berg, the Guin-
ness World Record holder for card-
stacking, prepared to create the
first permanent card structure
from cards, poker chips and dice,
the answer was clear. Only with a
super glue that provided strength,
speed and precise application
would Berg be able to complete
his re-creation of the “Welcome to
Fabulous Las Vegas” sign by glu-
ing the thin edges of 26,000 play-
ing cards.

This project was quite different
from the initial intentions for
super glue. The first super glue
hit stores in 1955, but its origins
date back to World War II, when
researchers attempted to use the
stickiness of cyanoacrylate to
make clear viewfinders for guns.
What they created instead was a
formula that turned out to be a
terrific glue. 

Since then, super glue’s strong-
bonding, quick-curing attributes
have made it the go-to choice for
repairing nearly anything. Ini-
tially, the product was only avail-
able in small tubes, which often
created a messy, sticky situation.

Today, a wide variety of applica-
tors and formulas exist that make
the product more convenient than
ever. New, slower-drying, Goof
Proof formulas are available for
the shakiest of hands, giving
users a few extra seconds to align
and position small, delicate pieces.  

Sticky fingers and oozing are
other common symptoms of a glu-
ing session gone awry. Thanks to
new formula innovations, the days
of messy drips are gone. Formulas
like Loctite Control Gel Super
Glue are great for vertical applica-
tions—in addition to making life-
sized card replicas. 

Super glue remains one of the
strongest and fastest repair tools.
Whether it is repairing a family
heirloom, assembling model
planes or constructing a gigantic
card house, super glue can be an
effective and easy solution to a
sticky situation.

For more information, visit
www.loctiteproducts.com.

A Sticky Situation

Bryan Berg uses super glue to
re-create the “Welcome to Fabu-
lous Las Vegas” sign using
26,000 playing cards and 1,200
bottles of glue.

(NAPSA)—A Parkinson’s dis-
ease drug called Parcopa® (car-
bidopa-levodopa orally disinte-
grating tablets) dissolves on
patients’ tongues without water.
It can be an easy way for patients
to take their medication. For
more information, visit www.Par-
copa.com.

**  **  **
Finding terrific toys—classic

and contemporary—for children of
all ages is easy at eToys.com,
where shoppers can search by gen-
der, age and product popularity.

**  **  **
To protect yourself and your

loved one from identity theft, you
can shred documents disclosing
anything someone could use to
steal an identity. You can also
purchase Nationwide’s Identity
Theft protection service with
credit monitoring.

**  **  **
Visa Gift cards let recipients

buy what they want, when they
want, wherever Visa debit cards
are accepted. Visa’s Zero Liabil-
ity policy protects against unau-
thorized purchases if the card is
lost or stolen. Learn more at
www.visa.com/CSO.

**  **  **
A new book on relationships

offers advice from the HEART.
According to the authors, Jack
Rosenblum and Corinne Dugas,
“The 5 Secrets of Marriage From
the HEART” (Tate Publishing) was
written for people who would like
their relationship to be stronger. 

**  **  **
A yummy way to get vitamins A

and C, yams can be baked with
marshmallows, fried until crispy
and even made into desserts or
pancakes. For more kid-friendly
recipes, visit www.sweetpotato.org.

**  **  **
Food for thought: A new cook-

book celebrates half a century of
delicious dishes. In celebration of
the renowned magazine’s 50th
anniversary, Bon Appétit has pub-
lished “The Bon Appétit Cook-
book” (Wiley) by Editor-in-Chief
Barbara Fairchild. For more

***
Play the music ,  not  the
instrument.

—Author Unknown
***

***
An intellectual is someone who
can listen to the “William Tell
Overture” without thinking of
the Lone Ranger.

—John Chesson
***

***
Music’s the medicine of the
mind.

—John A. Logan
***

***
We are limited but we can
push back the borders of our
limitations.

—Stephen R. Covey 
***

A kangaroo cannot jump if its tail is lifted off the ground. It needs
its tail for pushing off.




