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(NAPSA)—In his 2002 State of
the Union address, President
Bush challenged all Americans to
devote 4,000 hours—the equiva-
lent of two years—over the course
of their lifetimes to national and
community service. The President
specifically asked older Americans
to share their experience and
skills with those in need in their
communities. Many older Ameri-
cans are giving back through
national service programs such as
Senior Corps.

Dr. Donald Allcorn of Sedalia,
Mo., is one of those Americans. He
volunteers through RSVP, a pro-
gram of Senior Corps for people
age 55 and over. A retired physi-
cian, Dr. Allcorn provides medical
care to families, many of whom
lack healthcare coverage, at the
Community Free Clinic in
Sedalia. He spends two days a
week at the clinic and visits a
satellite clinic in a nearby commu-
nity twice a month. 

“When I retired from regular
practice, I wanted to keep my
skills sharp and help others,” says
Dr. Allcorn. “Joining RSVP gave
me the opportunity to stay active
and give back to my community.”

Dr. Allcorn provides an invalu-
able service to those families who
rely upon the clinic for health
care. On a typical day, he sees 30
to 40 patients and provides them
with the medical care and advice
they need to lead healthy and pro-
ductive lives. At the clinic, Dr. All-
corn also serves as medical direc-
tor, secures other volunteer
staffing for the facility and
arranges referrals to other doctors
when specialized care is required.

“The best part about serving at
the clinic is that I feel like I have
made a difference in the lives of
those in the community of
Sedalia,” he says. “It is wonderful
to be able to spend part of my
time in retirement helping those
who need medical care and have

nowhere else to turn.”
Senior Corps, administered by

the Corporation for National and
Community Service, is the nation’s
largest volunteer service network
for people age 55 and over. Through
its three major programs—RSVP,
Foster Grandparents and Senior
Companions—more than 500,000
senior volunteers help local non-
profits, public agencies and faith-
based organizations carry out their
missions. RSVP volunteers help
communities face a wide range of
challenges. Foster Grandparents
serve one-on-one as tutors and
mentors to young people with spe-
cial needs and Senior Companions
help homebound seniors and other
adults maintain independence in
their own homes. Senior Corps is
also a member of the USA Freedom
Corps, President Bush’s initiative
to engage all Americans in volun-
teer service. 

To find a volunteer opportunity
or to learn more about Senior
Corps, visit www.seniorcorps.org
or call 1-800-424-8867 (TTY: 1-
800-833-3722).

Senior Corps Volunteer Answers Call To Service

Donald Allcorn, a retired doc-
tor, specializes in volunteering
his time to help others.

(NAPSA)—Ultrasound, a
potentially lifesaving technology
used to look at everything from
your heart to your unborn baby,
may now be available at your doc-
tor ’s office thanks to advance-
ments in medical technology.

High-end ultrasound systems
such as the Nemio, by Toshiba
America Medical Systems are now
being used by many doctors,
including cardiologists, Ob/Gyns
and radiologists.

In addition to checking an
expectant mother to monitor fetal
growth and development, these sys-
tems allow physicians to perform
more advanced studies right in the
exam room. For example, Nemio’s
fetal-face application can provide
clear, 3-D renderings of an unborn
child’s face, giving parents the
thrill of seeing their baby’s face
for the first time. More impor-
tantly, Nemio helps detect abnor-
malities such as cleft palate,
allowing the parents and physi-
cian to prepare for appropriate
medical treatment immediately
following birth.

Physicians also can use the
ultrasound’s advanced 3-D imag-
ing capabilities to examine a
tumor’s characteristics and vascu-
lar supply. Having such extensive
detail so early can lead to a faster,
more accurate diagnosis of dis-
eases such as breast and prostate
cancers. It also may eliminate the
need for a patient to undergo a
more invasive and potentially
unpleasant procedure to obtain a
definitive diagnosis.

New technology also enables
patients to get comprehensive
examinations of heart disease
right in the doctor’s office. It can
help diagnose coronary artery dis-
ease through what is known as a
stress-echo test, which examines
the efficiency of the heart. The

system also gives clinicians clear,
sharp images of the heart and its
internal structures. These capabil-
ities are particularly helpful for
evaluating “at risk” patients prior
to cardiac catheterization or open-
heart surgery.

With advanced ultrasound scan-
ners such as Nemio, looking inside
a patient’s body to examine organs
for heart disease, cancer and preg-
nancy has become easier and more
accurate for doctors who routinely
treat patients in their own office or
clinic. You can learn more about
the powerful diagnostic capabilities
of the latest ultrasound scanners
from your doctor or online at
www.medical.toshiba.com.

Coming To A Doctor Near You: Ultrasound 
Technology So Powerful,You Can See A Baby’s Face

Advances in ultrasound tech-
nology, like this 3-D fetal face,
allow doctors to see more detail
inside the human body than ever
before.

(NAPSA)—In the middle of the
cold, dark winter it’s easy to forget
the importance of protecting our
skin from the sun. After months of
walking around all bundled up,
many of us jet off for winter vaca-
tions. Though it’s tempting to hit
the beach or slopes the moment
we arrive on vacation, winter skin
is particularly vulnerable to sun-
burn and other conditions exacer-
bated by the sun. Whether at
home, or on a trip, you should
remember to protect yourself from
overexposure to UV rays.

One of the most common and yet
under-diagnosed skin problems
precipitated by sun exposure is
melasma, a pigmentary disorder
caused by excessive production of
melanin resulting from hormone
imbalance due to recent pregnancy,
birth control pills or hormonal
changes during menopause.
Melasma affects primarily women
in their reproductive years and is
characterized by dark spots or
blotches on the face, forehead and
neck. The American Academy of
Dermatology estimates that five to
six million American women have
the disorder. Exposure to sunlight
and UV rays often intensifies dis-
coloration of the skin.

Winter is the perfect time to
speak to your dermatologist about
a healthy skincare regimen and
treatment options for Melasma.
Tri Luma® Cream (fluocinolone
acetonide 0.01%, hydroquinone
4%, tretinoin 0.05%), is a product
clinically proven to reduce the
appearance of melasma after eight
weeks of use. 

Mild to moderate redness, peel-
ing, burning, dryness, or itching

may be experienced. This product
contains sulfites that may cause
severe allergic reactions including
anaphylactic symptoms and life-
threatening asthma attacks. Expo-
sure to sunlight, sunlamps, or UV
light and extreme heat, wind, or
cold should be avoided. Use of a
sunscreen with an appropriate SPF
of 30 or higher is required. Wear
protective clothing and change to
nonhormonal forms of birth control,
if hormonal methods are used.

Tri-Luma® Cream contains
hydroquinone, which may pro-
duce exogenous ochronosis, a
gradual blue-black darkening of
the skin, whose occurrence should
prompt discontinuation of ther-
apy. Tri-Luma® Cream contains
the corticosteroid fluocinolone
acetonide. Systemic absorption of
topical corticosteroids can pro-
duce reversible hypothalamic-
pituitary-adrenal (HPA) axis sup-
pression with the potential for
glucocorticoid insufficiency after
withdrawal of treatment.

You can view the Web site at
www.triluma.com.

Winter Wonderland Skin Care

(NAPSA)—With most con-
sumers looking for chic new furni-
ture design to complement both
traditional and contemporary
interior décor, a new wood finish
adds that perfect touch.

Powder coated finishes are rev-
olutionizing the wood furniture
market—particularly furniture
made of popular medium density
fiberboard (MDF)—because they
offer design freedoms other finish-
ing methods can’t provide.

Furniture shoppers can now
choose a home office desk, com-
puter console, entertainment cen-
ter, recreational suite or child’s
play center that is uniquely
designed but still offers the stur-
diness and warmth of wood. 

A powder coated finish also
protects wood furniture from
stains, chips, spills and scratches;
it promises value, beauty and easy
care for years to come.

Consumers looking to update
their homes with a new kitchen or
bath should also look for products
with a tough powder coated finish.

In addition to appliances and
fixtures, powder coating can be
found on easy-to-clean, durable
MDF cabinets and other kitchen
and bath products.

This high-tech powder coating
process is being embraced by all
the best manufacturers, including
manufacturers of high-perfor-
mance office and contract furni-

ture as well as consumer products,
because the finish comes in a rain-
bow of colors and textures, is easy
to apply and is more environmen-
tally friendly than paint.

In addition to MDF products,
successful testing is occurring on
hardwoods, such as beech, oak,
ash and walnut, and consumers
should be able to find powder
coated hardwood on the market in
the next few years.

So, whether your personal
taste craves an American Tradi-
tional or New Age Feng Shui
motif, powder coated wood furni-
ture will always be a standard
accent.

For more information about
powder coated wood and other
powder coated products, go to The
Powder Coating Institute’s Web
site at www.powdercoating.org.

Wood Designs Benefit From Durable New Finish

Powder coated furniture can
take a beating and retain its good
looks.
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The Movie Begins
When The Lights

Start To Dim
(NAPSA)—An increasing num-

ber of people are discovering that
when it comes to entertainment—
there’s no place like home. Today,
you don’t have to be a millionaire
to have an extraordinary home
theater.

Great audio and video are cru-
cial, but to make a home theater
experience complete, dim and
brighten your lights by using dim-
mer switches.

Dimmer switches add the dra-
matic “Lights! Camera! Action!”
excitement that transforms the
room into a true entertainment
retreat. Lutron Electronics, the
company that invented the dim-
mer switch, offers dimming prod-
ucts for as little as $10 that can
be purchased at local home
improvement centers, lighting
showrooms, or from electrical
products professionals.

For a free copy of Your Guide to
Home Theater Lighting Control,
call 1-877-2LUTRON, ext. 640, or
visit Lutron on the Web at
www.lutron.com.

A remote-control  d immer
switch can create a movie theater
atmosphere in your home.

(NAPSA)—Those who are
overweight or obese and find it
difficult to take off the pounds
through diet and exercise alone
may want to consult their physi-
cian about other available
options. One such option is a pre-
scription weight-loss medication
called Xenical (orlistat). Xenical
helps patients lose weight by pre-
venting one-third of dietary fat
from being absorbed. A recent
study showed that Xenical, com-
bined with diet and lifestyle
changes, can prevent or delay the
onset of type 2 diabetes.

Understanding the facts about
cholesterol can help you take bet-
ter care of your heart and live a
healthier life, reducing your risk
for heart attack and stroke. If
your doctor has told you that you
need to manage your cholesterol,
you might benefit from a new tool
from the American Heart Associa-
tion, Heart Profilers at american
heart.org/heartprofilers. People
can visit the site and enter infor-
mation in the system to find out
about lifestyle changes, risk fac-
tors, medication and new treat-
ment options.




