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(NAPSA)—Brace yourself: As a
result of innovations in orthodontic
materials, orthodontists are able to
provide today’s patients with a
comfortable and convenient experi-
ence while working toward the
ultimate goal of a healthy, beauti-
ful smile, a good bite and improved
facial appearance.

Traditional braces, a combina-
tion of brackets and wires, have
moved into the 21st century. Metal
brackets are smaller and less con-
spicuous; tooth-colored brackets
blend with the color of teeth.
Patients benefit from the use
of  NASA-developed technology:
advanced “space-age” wires with
built-in memory. The wires, which
actually move the teeth under the
orthodontist’s supervision, deliver
a light, continuous pressure. When
they reach mouth temperature, the
wires become active and “remem-
ber” their original shape. As the
wires attempt to return to that
shape, they gently guide the teeth
into their correct positions. When
compared to materials used as
recently as a decade ago, today’s
high-tech materials can result in
fewer and less frequent appoint-
ments, so patients require less
time away from school or work,
and the treatment time may be
shorter.

According to the American
Association of Orthodontists
(AAO), more than 5 million people
in the U.S. and Canada are receiv-
ing care from AAO members, den-
tal specialists who graduated from
dental school and completed a
minimum of two to three years of
university-based training in an
accredited orthodontic residency
program. More than 1 million of
these orthodontic patients are
adults. Many are in their 40s, 50s
and beyond.

Teeth tend to drift as people
mature. Even those who were

born with perfectly placed teeth
can experience these unwanted
changes. Many consult an ortho-
dontist to rejuvenate their smile
and get a healthy bite. Between
1994 and 2004, the number of
adult patients grew by 37 percent.
An estimated 63 percent of adult
patients are women.

But some things never change.
Orthodontic patients need to follow
their orthodontist’s instructions
regarding elastic wear and good
oral hygiene. Avoiding foods that
are too hard, sticky, crunchy or
chewy is also key. Such foods can
damage braces, which may length-
en time spent in braces. Addition-
ally, orthodontic patients need to
see their dentist at least every six
months for checkups and profes-
sional cleanings. Following these
recommendations helps patients
complete their treatment on time
and with desired results.

To learn more about contempo-
rary orthodontic treatment or to
find an AAO member orthodontist
in the U.S. or Canada, call 1-800-
STRAIGHT or visit the Web site at
www.braces.org.

Today’s Orthodontic Treatment: Comfortable, Convenient

A growing number of adults are
seeking orthodontic care to help
correct problems and improve
their smiles.

(NAPSA)—Identity theft is a
serious crime that costs American
consumers billions of dollars and
countless hours each year. It
occurs when someone uses your
personal information without your
permission to commit fraud or
other crimes.

While you can’t entirely control
whether you will become a victim,
there are steps you can take to
minimize your risk. The Federal
Trade Commission (FTC), the
nation’s consumer protection
agency, encourages consumers to
Deter, Detect and Defend to help
cut down on identity theft.

Deter
Deter identity thieves by safe-

guarding your information:
• Shred financial documents

and paperwork with personal
information before you discard
them.

• Protect your Social Security
number. Give it out only if ab-
solutely necessary or ask to use
another identifier. 

• Don’t give out personal infor-
mation via the phone, mail or the
Internet unless you know who you
are dealing with.

Detect
Detect suspicious activity by

routinely monitoring your finan-
cial accounts and billing state-
ments. Be alert to signs that re-
quire immediate attention, such
as: bills that do not arrive as
expected; unexpected credit cards
or account statements; denials of
credit for no apparent reason; and
calls or letters about purchases
you did not make.

Defend
If you think your identity has

been stolen, here’s what to do:

1. Contact the fraud depart-
ments of any one of the three con-
sumer reporting companies (Equi-
fax, Experian, TransUnion) to
place a fraud alert on your credit
report. The fraud alert tells credi-
tors to contact you before opening
any new accounts or making any
changes to your existing accounts.
You only need to contact one of the
three companies to place an alert.

2. Close the accounts that you
know or believe have been tam-
pered with or opened fraudulently.

3. File a report with your local
police or the police in the commu-
nity where the identity theft took
place. Get a copy of the report or,
at the very least, the number of
the report, to submit to your credi-
tors and others who may require
proof of the crime. 

4. File your complaint with
the FTC. The FTC maintains a
database of identity theft cases
used by law enforcement agen-
cies for investigations. Filing a
complaint also helps officials
learn more about identity theft
and the problems victims are
having so that they can better
assist you.

To learn more, visit ftc.gov/
idtheft.

Fight Back Against Identity Theft

Protecting your personal infor-
mation is the first step in pre-
venting identity theft.

(NAPSA)—For many people,
car shopping can be a frustrating,
time-consuming and inconvenient
experience. The good news is that
with a little know-how you can use
the Internet to turn what might
otherwise be overwhelming into a
manageable, even enjoyable expe-
rience. The Web is an excellent
resource to help reduce the stress
of car shopping and increase the
likelihood of finding exactly the
vehicle you are looking for.

The online shopping search
starts with thinking about the
basic things you want in a new
car. Ask yourself, “Do I want a
new, used or certified preowned
vehicle?” and “Would I prefer a car,
SUV or truck?” It’s also important
to ask “Do I have a favorite vehicle
manufacturer?” and “If I buy a
used vehicle, how important is the
vehicle’s current mileage to me?”
Narrowing your preferences on at
least a few of these items will min-
imize frustration and help lead
you in the right direction.

Next, you need to know where
to go. Visit consumer-friendly Web
sites such as Edmunds.com, Auto
Trader.com and AOL for news,
reviews and comprehensive vehi-
cle overviews. The Internet allows
you to shop for cars in your area
on your own schedule, when you
have time, without regard for the
dealerships’ hours of operation.
Automotive Web sites that allow
you to save car listings and
searches will help you save even
more time, since you can go back
to where you left off instead of
starting fresh each time you visit.

Once you have reduced your
search to a few select vehicles, do
a side-by-side comparison of the
cars. With just a few clicks, you
can quickly compare up-to-date
vehicle information and reviews,
features and benefits and costs of
several vehicles. More information
in less time is a bargain any con-
sumer can appreciate.

Want your own customized
shopping experience? Automotive
Web sites such as AutoTrader.com
allow you to personalize your car
search. Registered users of the
“My AutoTrader.com” function,
listed on the company’s home-
page, can save up to 10 searches
and up to 25 cars in their per-
sonal space and refer back to the
searches at a later date. In addi-
tion, the comparison tool allows
you to compare your top three car
choices. 

To gain more control over your
car-buying experience, visit
www.AutoTrader.com.

Save Time: Find Your New Car Online

By shopping for a vehicle online,
consumers can narrow their
search, compare prices and save
time.

Sharpest Cooks In The Kitchen

(NAPSA)—Chefs know that the
best knife is only as good as its
sharpest edge. That’s why chefs
such as television cook Rachael
Ray and Oprah’s chef Art Smith
insist on a state-of-the-art knife
sharpener for their best knives. 

Here are some tips on finding
the best professional sharpener
from the experts at Füritechnics:

• Choose a sharpener with
Diamond Fingers technology to
ensure exact 20˚ angles on both
sides of the blade. 

• Pull your knife through the
sharpener three to five times, and
the knife should be sharpened and
honed—error free.

• The sharpener should work
on any brand of knife.

• Chefs rarely use electric
sharpeners. They prefer a com-
bined sharpener and honer such
as Füri’s Ozitech, which is a sim-
plified, compact version of their
three-stage Tech Edge sharpening
system. “You won’t believe how
quickly and perfectly it sharpens
any knife—a few swipes and you
are done,” says Ray.

To learn more, visit www.
furitechnics.com/ozitech.

This chef-preferred, pocket-sized
knife sharpener has eight stain-
less steel spring fingers bonded
with industrial diamonds.

(NAPSA)—A recent study
found that nearly eight out of 10
used-car shoppers were more
likely to purchase a car identi-
fied as having only one owner
than they were to purchase a car
that had multiple owners. A good
way to learn how many owners a
vehicle has had is to run a vehi-
cle history report from Carfax.

The reports clearly indicate the
number of owners a vehicle has
had, as well as whether a car has
been in a flood, fire or accident.
For more information, visit
www.carfax.com. 

***
There are two kinds of people, those who do the work and those
who take the credit. Try to be in the first group; there is less com-
petition there.

—Indira Gandhi 
***

(NAPSA)—To make sure the
stain or sealant you apply on
your deck will be absorbed in a
uniform way, you will have to
remove any dirt, algae, mildew or
other materials first. Staining or
sealing a dirty wood surface can
cause premature failure of the
stain’s protective quality, and the
materials trapped under the
stain or sealant may continue to
damage the wood. A cleaner such
as Olympic Deck Cleaner lets you
rinse away dirt and mildew, leav-
ing the wood ready for protec-
tion. This product is available at
local home improvement, paint
and hardware stores, as well as
Lowe’s Home Improvement
Warehouses. 

**  **  **
Keeping wood properly pro-

tected is a growing challenge,
especially as homeowners have
made it a top choice for exterior
surfaces—not just siding, but
decks, furniture and all the other
accessories that are part of the

extended outdoors lifestyle.
Responding to this growing focus
on the expanded outdoors
lifestyle, Benjamin Moore has
developed a new, technologically
advanced, premium Exterior
Stain Collection that protects and
beautifies just about every wood
surface. The collection offers an
extraordinary palette of hues,
with a range inspired by organic
life and the outdoors world.




