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(NAPSA)—If your home’s fur-
nace is 20 or more years old
you’re not alone. The Environ-
mental Protection Agency says
that one in every four U.S. fur-
naces falls into this category. 

With Americans spending more
than half of home energy budgets
on heating and cooling, it may be
time to take a look at replacing
your old furnace with a new, more
energy-efficient model. If your
utility bills aren’t chilling enough,
waking some cold winter’s night
to discover that your old furnace
has called it quits is an experience
most of us could do without.

With numerous technology
advances in furnaces over the last
two decades, homeowners have
more options to consider than ever
before. One thing that hasn’t
changed is the importance of local
dealers in helping homeowners
choose the right heating solution
for optimum winter comfort. 

While the Internet allows con-
sumers to more thoroughly re-
search furnace brands, models
and new technologies, research
conducted by Carrier Corporation
shows that more than 70 percent
of homeowners still rely on the
recommendation of their local
dealer when selecting a furnace
brand and model. 

Whether you’re looking to save
on utility costs, or hoping to avoid
waking to icicles hanging from
your bedroom ceiling, a number of
innovations now allow you to pre-
set your furnace to much more
consistently maintain what Car-
rier calls an individual “indoor
weather” preference.

Older furnaces tend to heat a
home by blasting warm air in a
full-on cycle until the thermostat
senses that the pre-set temperature
level has been reached. The ther-
mostat then tells the furnace to
shut down. What follows is a full-
off cycle in which the home cools

down until the thermostat again
initiates another full-on cycle.

The result? A comfortable tem-
perature is achieved only in those
few moments after a strong blast
of heating subsides, and before
the colder point in a full-off fur-
nace cycle.

The solution? Today’s variable-
speed gas furnace. With the poten-
tial to save up to 20 percent on
heating-related energy costs, the
lower operating mode of a vari-
able-speed system delivers consis-
tent comfort by gradually deliver-
ing heated air to the home. 

Heated air tends to add to
already low humidity levels pre-
sent in cold, dry winter weather.
The impacts range from dry lips to
more serious health concerns,
such as persistent cough. Because
dry air feels cooler to most people,
homeowners often find themselves
unnecessarily increasing their
home’s temperature setting.

This only adds to the lack of
humidity in the air, and raises
temperatures and energy costs. A
number of technologies have
emerged to meet demand for both
increased moisture levels in win-
ter months and, if a central air
conditioning system is in place,

the ability to decrease humidity in
warmer months. 

Carrier took this new technol-
ogy to a higher level by developing
a system that adjusts humidity
when neither heating or cooling is
required. 

Another recent development
may be of particular importance
to homeowners looking to
increase their storage space or
just to move their furnace out of
the way into a closet or crawl
space. Engineering innovations
have brought dramatic advances
in the size-reduction of gas fur-
naces. A variable-speed gas fur-
nace recently introduced by Car-
rier, the WeatherMaker™ 8000
stands just 331⁄3 inches tall, is
much quieter and takes up less
than half the space of the old
“monster in the basement.” The
options available with today’s
gas furnaces present the home-
owner with many decisions to
consider before purchasing a new
system. Operating cost, energy
savings, maintaining a consis-
tent pre-set temperature, humid-
ity control, even noise level and
furnace size are being looked at
by  today ’s  more  d iscerning
consumer. 

Several tips to consider before
making a decision:

• Start  by researching.  A
good starting point is the EPA’s
EnergyStar program Web site—
www.energystar.gov.

• Have an informed discussion
with your dealer. Be prepared to
prioritize your needs when dis-
cussing options. Set your cost
limit, discuss options such as heat
and humidity control systems,
and weigh the benefits against the
cost for each option.

If your furnace’s days are num-
bered, now is a good time to start
understanding what today’s fur-
nace innovations can mean to
your family’s comfort, and budget.

Latest In Home Heating Innovations

Here’s an idea to warm to: the
comfort of home can be easier to
keep with a modern furnace.

“The best decision I ever made
was asking Laura to marry me.
I’m not sure the best decision she
ever made was saying yes. But I’m
glad she did...”

George W. Bush
(NAPSA)—It’s been said that,

from the outside, no one ever
really understands the pressure
the spotlight of celebrity can put
on a marriage. When the husband
and wife in question are President
and First Lady, says Christopher
Andersen, No. l New York Times
bestselling author of Jack and
Jackie and Bill and Hillary, “you
can multiply that pressure a thou-

sand fold.”
In his new book

G E O R G E  A N D
LAURA: Portrait
of An American
Marriage, (William
Morrow, $22.95),
Andersen puts the
Bushes’ marriage

under the microscope and con-
cludes that “as man and wife
they’re not only surviving in the
White House—they’re flourishing
there.”

To get to the heart of the cur-
rent President’s marriage, Ander-
sen conducted hundreds of inter-
views with those who know the
Bushes best, including Laura’s
surprisingly outspoken mother,
Jenna Welch. GEORGE AND
LAURA—which  is likely to find
its way onto a number of holiday
gift lists—has been described as a
vivid and sometimes startling por-
trait of the First Couple. Among
the many surprising revelations
and insights the author serves up: 

• A detailed, behind-the-scenes
account of how the President and
First Lady coped with 9/11 as the
drama unfolded, their emotional
reunion in the presidential bunker
beneath the White House, and
how they leaned on each other as
they rallied America in the war on
terrorism.

• The true extent of the Presi-
dent’s drinking problem prior to
becoming President, the strains it
put on his marriage, and the night
Laura delivered the ultimatum
that changed his life. “Laura is
stronger than most people real-
ize,” says Andersen. “After all, she

did what neither Jackie nor
Hillary could—she saved her man
from himself.”

• Surprising new details about
George and Laura’s poignant
struggle with infertility (“Laura
was so upset that she couldn’t
walk down the baby aisle at the
supermarket without crying”) and
her life-threatening pregnancy.  

• The pressures of raising
headstrong twin daughters in the
glare of the media and how the
girls have “shaped up completely,”
observes Andersen, since 9/ll.  

• Laura’s surprising behind-
the-scenes influence on domestic
and even foreign policy issues.
“She shares her opinions with her
husband in bed, over coffee and
the morning papers,” writes
Andersen, and she gets him to
appear more statesmanlike by
sidling up to the President and
whispering  “Rein it in, Bubba.”

A former contributing editor of
Time and senior editor of People,
Andersen has written 23 books.
In addition to his studies of presi-
dential marriages, the author also
wrote the No. l bestsellers The
Day Diana Died and The Day
John Died.  

The book is available now
wherever books are sold.

A Revealing New Look At America’s First Couple

A new book offers an “up
close and personal” look at the
marriage of the President and
First Lady.

Andersen

(NAPSA)—One way busy fam-
ilies can save time is with prod-
ucts that are packaged for conve-
nience. A survey, commissioned
by Hunt’s Tomatoes found that
80 percent of  consumers say
packaging innovations make
their lives easier. When shop-
ping you can select products that
minimize the mess and make
preparation hassle-free. Hunt’s
for example, has introduced the
new Perfect Squeeze ketchup,
the first upside-down, no-mess
ketchup bottle.

Responding to concerns about
access to higher education for
academically qualified low- and
moderate-income students, one
of the nation’s leading higher
education institutions will offer
a scholarship to one student at
every public high school in 18
metropolitan areas served by the
campuses. The DeVry University
Community Scholars program
will help meet the challenge of
ensuring access to higher educa-
tion for students who may not be
able to afford it, and to encour-
age students to pursue careers
involving technology, business
and management.  For more

information and to find out if
you are eligible, call 800-73-
DEVRY or visit www.devry.com.

Eco-tourism has become one
of the more noteworthy trends in
vacation planning. One of the
more appealing places promoting
the delicate balance of nature is
Florida’s Gulf Islands of Anna
Maria (dubbed “Fantasy Island”
by Florida Monthly magazine),
and Longboat Key. To learn more
about eco-adventures in Florida’s
Gulf Islands, write to the
Bradenton Area Convention &
Visitors Bureau, P.O. Box 1000,
Bradenton, FL 32406, call 1-800-
462-6283, or visit www.flagulfis
lands.com.

(NAPSA)—African-American
hair can tend to limit styling
options. However, that doesn’t
have to be the case. With the right
hair care products, it’s possible to
“relax” your ’do, for hair that’s
silky straight and touchably soft—
with improved manageability,
body and shine.

In fact, hair relaxers are noth-
ing new; they’ve been in use for at
least 30 years. However, new
chemistry has made these prod-
ucts safer to use, with formulas
that contain no lye, and which can
be used on fine, medium and
coarse hair.

One example is the DAX Relax
Hair Care System from Imperial
DAX. This no lye crème relaxer is
available in both Regular and
Super strength versions—and
works in just 13 to 15 minutes
(fine hair), up to 25 minutes
(coarse hair). Like other similar
products, Relax should not be
applied to bleached hair.

DAX Relax comes with detailed
instructions, as well as a list of
do’s and don’ts that should be fol-
lowed for best results. This in-
cludes finishing the job with DAX

Leave In Conditioner.
Imperial DAX offers a complete

line of quality hair care, mainte-
nance, grooming and styling prod-
ucts, including shampoos, condi-
tioners, gels, waxes, texturizers
and pomades. There are also prod-
ucts designed to help with curling,
pressing, styling and waving hair.

To learn more, or for additional
product information, visit the Web
site at www.imperialdax.com or
call toll free 866-329-9297.

New Products Can Help Your Hair To Relax

New chemistry helps give hair
more manageability, body and
shine.

***
It is not by the gray of the hair
that one knows the age of the
heart.

—Edward Bulwer-Lytton
***

***
It’s not hard to make decisions
when you know what your val-
ues are.

—Roy Disney
***

***
In cooking, as in all the arts,
simplicity is the sign of
perfection.

—F.D. Armour
***




