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(NAPSA)—A little forethought can
help entrepreneurs avert a problem
they may not even know they have.

A recent poll discovered a great
number of small business owners
are confident they are meeting
retirement plan legal requirements
but fail to understand key duties. 

According to the survey, many
business owners are confused about
meeting legal obligations and
responsibilities associated with
offering a retirement plan, some-
times referred to as fiduciary
responsibility. What it really means
is, if you offer a retirement plan,
you’re liable for that plan’s manage-
ment, personally and professionally.

“Many business owners under-
stand the various benefits of spon-
soring a retirement plan, but
many others are unaware of the
legal responsibilities, and that can
place them at risk both personally
and professionally,” explained
Michael Butler, a senior vice pres-
ident for Nationwide Financial
which sponsored the survey.

While 80 percent say they are

meeting fiduciary responsibilities,
many business owners report crit-
ical lapses in fiduciary knowledge:

• They don’t realize they hold
primary responsibility. A large
percentage of small business own-
ers incorrectly identified the plan
investment provider, the financial
advisor, and even employees as
having this role. 

• They fail to evaluate invest-
ments regularly. Only six in 10
business owners reported an
investment policy statement for
their retirement plans, fewer
reported a formal process to eval-
uate investments regularly.

• They don’t question the ethics
or risk of required funds. More
than a third of small business own-
ers consider it acceptable for a plan
provider to require its funds be
among a plan’s investment options.

Butler suggests working with a
financial professional, CPA or third-
party administrator to ensure fidu-
ciary obligations are being met. For
more information visit www.nation
widefinancial.com.

Overcoming False Confidence
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Recent retirement plan concerns for small business owners

Flying High
(NAPSA)—USA Today best-

selling author and conservationist
Mary Alice Monroe has returned
to the South Carolina Lowcountry
to tell the moving story of healing,
hope and new beginnings in Sky-
ward (MIRA Books, $6.99). 

Set against a backdrop of stun-
ning wildlife and the natural
beauty of the landscape, this
heartwarming tale examines the
deepening relationship between a
withdrawn wildlife biologist and
the disillusioned ER nurse who
comes to town to help care for his
diabetic daughter. 

The work of rehabilitating
majestic birds of prey together
brings the couple closer, but the
sudden return of the biologist’s
estranged wife threatens the frag-
ile bonds of new love.

Skyward is available at book-
stores or can be ordered from the
Web site www.mirabooks.com.

The South Carolina landscape
provides a backdrop for a memo-
rable novel of healing and hope.

(NAPSA)—Menopause is a nat-
ural biological process that marks
the end of a woman’s childbearing
years. Menopause may also be
induced as a result of a hysterec-
tomy, as well as by chemotherapy
and certain radiation therapies.

Approximately 75 percent of
women report some troublesome
symptoms during menopause,
though the severity and frequency
of symptoms varies from woman
to woman. These symptoms can
include vaginal dryness, painful
intercourse, hot flashes, mood
swings and night sweats, among
many others. The average woman
enters menopause between the
ages of 50 and 51, however,
menopause can begin at any age. 

Forty-nine-year-old Anita
Smith suffered for over a decade
from the symptoms of menopause.
Hot flashes and severe mood
swings disrupted her life on a
daily basis. Vaginal dryness and
pain during intercourse caused
Anita to feel both embarrassed
and apathetic towards intimacy.
Night sweats would often inter-
rupt her sleep and although she
had tried several types of hor-
mone replacement therapies, no
treatment effectively relieved all
of her symptoms.

“When I began to experience hot
flashes and vaginal dryness, my
symptoms put a lot of stress on my
life and on my relationship with my
husband,” said Anita. “It became
impossible to sleep through the
night and my husband and I
became frustrated with the vaginal
symptoms and pain.”

A new estrogen therapy
approved by the Food and Drug
Administration and now avail-
able nationwide may help mil-

lions of women combat the symp-
toms of menopause. Femring™ is
the only vaginally delivered
estrogen therapy that treats both
the vaginal (dryness, painful
intercourse) and vasomotor (hot
flashes, night sweats) symptoms
of menopause. A soft, flexible,
self-inserted ring, the product
delivers estrogen at a steady rate
during a three-month dosing
period. This treatment provides
women with both relief from
symptoms and convenience. 

“As women get older, they want
to remain physically and sexually
active, and they don’t want to be
slowed down by hot flashes and
vaginal dryness,” said Susan Bal-
lagh, M.D., assistant professor of
the Department of Obstetrics and
Gynecology at Eastern Virginia
Medical School. 

As with all menopausal treat-
ments, women should discuss the
risks and benefits of hormone
replacement with their doctor. For
more information, call 1-800-521-
8813.

You Don’t Have To Surrender To Menopause

Women now have a conve-
nient method for treating the
symptoms of menopause.

(NAPSA)—When it comes to
selecting a technician to care for
their home’s comfort system,
many consumers are lost. Too
often, the only question asked is,
“How soon can the technician get
here?” A knowledgeable, trained
technician is critical to maintain-
ing the longevity and efficiency of
home comfort systems. 

Consider the following:  
• Ask the contractor for refer-

ences. Call them and ask if they
would use that contractor again.

• Is the technician NATE-certi-
fied? NATE-certified technicians
know heating and cooling.

• Ask the contractor if they
belong to a professional trade
association. Contractors actively
involved in trade associations are
apt to have more current knowl-
edge about equipment.

• Properly serviced equip-
ment lasts longer and runs more
efficiently. Ask about mainte-
nance programs.

• Is the contractor familiar
with your home’s heating and
cooling equipment?

This information is provided by
North American Technician Excel-
lence (NATE), the nation’s largest
non-profit certification organiza-
tion for heating, ventilation, air

conditioning and refrigeration
(HVAC/R) technicians.  

The U.S. Department of Energy
endorses NATE for its dedication
in raising quality standards for
installation and maintenance of
HVAC/R equipment and contribut-
ing to increased energy efficiency.

To locate a contractor employ-
ing NATE-certified technicians in
your area, visit the Consumer
Contractor Connection on the
NATE Web site at www.natex.org
and click on the “consumers” icon.

The Right HVAC Technician Solves Heating and Cooling Problems

Properly serviced heating and
cooling equipment lasts longer
and runs more efficiently.

(NAPSA)—Painful muscles,
which can be a sign of TMD, are
best evaluated by a neuromuscu-
lar dentist, who evaluates muscle
activity to find an ergonomic posi-
tion for the jaw based on muscles,
joints, teeth and nerves. A neuro-
muscular dentist first deter-
mines the optimal position and
function of the temporomandibu-
lar joints and the optimal resting
posture and function of the mus-
cles which power the jaw. Neuro-
muscular dentists are trained in
this technique, which is not part
of the standard training in dental
schools around the world. To find
a dentist with neuromuscular
training, or for more information
about TMD, visit www.leading
dentists.com.

Recent scientific studies show
that all women of childbearing
age should take a vitamin with
folic acid every day—even when
not planning a pregnancy. This re-
duces the risk of spina bifida up
to 70 percent because folic acid is
a B-vitamin that helps build
healthy cells. In addition to folic
acid, genetics and maternal envi-
ronmental factors are involved in
spina bifida. To learn more, call
the Spina Bifida Association of
America at 1-800-621-3141 or
visit www.sbaa.org.

The College of American
Pathologists suggest parents take
these steps to help reduce the risk
of sudden infant death syndrome
(SIDS): receive appropriate pre-
natal care; don’t smoke or expose
your baby to smoke; put your
baby to sleep on its back; use a

firm mattress in the crib and
remove fluffy blankets and stuffed
animals from the crib.

Actor David L. Lander, best
known as Squiggy on the TV clas-
sic “Laverne & Shirley,” has
taken on a new role. After hiding
his multiple sclerosis (MS) for 15
years, Lander now shares his per-
sonal story with tens of thou-
sands of others who live with MS.
In 2000, the National Multiple
Sclerosis Society named Lander
Ambassador of the Year for his
efforts to raise awareness of the
autoimmune disease of the cen-
tral nervous system. Lander uses
AVONEX® (Interferon beta-1a) to
help control his MS symptoms. To
learn more about MS or Lander’s
story, or to find out where Lander
will be speaking, visit www.MSAc
tiveSource.com. For full prescrib-
ing information on AVONEX®, visit
www.Avonex.com.

***
Best of all is it to preserve every-
thing in a pure, still heart, and
let there be for every pulse a
thanksgiving, and for every
breath a song.

—Konrad von Gesner
***

***
Continuity in everything is
unpleasant. Cold is agreeable,
that we may get warm.

—Pascal
***

***
Gratitude is not only the great-
est of virtues, but the parent of
all others.

—Cicero
***
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