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(NAPSA)—Severe drought has
swept through all 50 states this
year, inflicting damage on crops
and cattle production and con-
tributing to erosion. In response,
USDA’s Farm Service Agency (FSA)
is providing disaster assistance to
farmers and ranchers in need
nationwide. Since late summer,
programs totaling over $2 billion
funds in aid have been announced.
Both traditional programs as well
as new ones came to the rescue for
farmers and ranchers.

“Recent rains came too late to
rescue Maryland’s grain crop. This
drought, one of the worst in more
than a century, will cost many
farmers up to 75 percent of their
income,” said Steven Connelly,
Maryland FSA State Executive
Director. “These programs are a
huge relief, and people leave our
office feeling a lot better about
their options.”

The drought was especially
tough for livestock producers, who
don’t typically benefit from disas-
ter relief programs. FSA imple-
mented a new Livestock Compen-
sation Program, totaling nearly
$800 million, serving cattle,
sheep, buffalo and goat producers. 

Cow-calf operators in Ne-
braska, Colorado, Wyoming and
South Dakota also received an
additional $150 million from the
feed assistance program. The
Emergency Conservation Pro-
gram, the Noninsured Crop Disas-
ter Assistance Program and the
Emergency Loan Program will
also provide financial assistance
to eligible producers affected by
natural disasters. And recently
the agency announced an Emer-

gency Watershed Protection Pro-
gram (EWP) to help restore nat-
ural resources.

In addition to relief funds, FSA
is encouraging producers to share
resources. FSA developed the Hay
Net Web site (www.usda.fsa.gov)
where producers can list their
need for hay or hay available for
sale or donation. CRP participants
have been authorized to use some
conserved lands for emergency
haying and grazing. CRP partici-
pants without livestock may
donate, rent or lease their hay or
haying or grazing privileges. 

“It’s our hope that, in the
American tradition of neighbor
helping neighbor,” said Farm Ser-
vice Agency Administrator James
Little, “CRP participants in areas
not affected will be able to help
those in need. These and other
FSA programs will provide feed
and forage to producers who’ve
lost hay stocks and grazing lands
in the recent disasters.” 

To learn more, visit the Web
site at www.fsa.usda.gov.

Drought Aid Saving Many Farmers,
Ranchers And Resources

America’s farmers and ranch-
ers are struggling through one of
the worst droughts of the last
century.

(NAPSA)—One of the most
prestigious awards in the automo-
tive industry is going to town—
the Town Car, that is.

The 2003 Lincoln Town Car
earned the J.D. Power and Associ-
ates APEAL (Automotive Perfor-
mance, Execution and Layout)
award for the “most appealing
mid-luxury car.” The APEAL study
is based on responses from new-
vehicle owners and comprises
eight specific areas of vehicle per-
formance and design that identify
what consumers like and dislike
about their new vehicles during
the first 90 days of ownership.

The accolade should come as no
surprise to owners of this enduring
model; almost 60 percent of Town
Car customers are repeat buyers,
and 65 percent of them say they
don’t even consider another vehicle.

Town Car drivers look for lux-
ury, and the 2003 model offers it
throughout, especially in a smooth,
quiet ride and improved safety,
handling and durability.

“Front-seat space is generous,
with lots of room for three,” writes
The Arizona Republic. “The pam-
pered passengers roosting in the
back seat will appreciate the extra
console controls for audio [and]
climate control.”

Drivers and passengers can
take advantage of a 44 percent
increase in total interior storage,
including a larger glove compart-
ment and better cup holders. Big-
ger is also better in the trunk,
where the Town Car offers a class-
leading 20.6 cubic feet of cargo
space.

In addition, the car comes with
extended rear park assist, a
handy warning signal that beeps
when the car is in reverse and
approaching an object.

“The Town Car remains as the
traditional American luxury car,”
concludes The Florida Times-
Union.

To learn more about the 2003
Town Car, visit the Web site at
www.lincolnvehicles.com.

Steve Goodall (right), president of J.D. Power and Associates, pre-
sents The J.D. Power and Associates APEAL award for most appeal-
ing mid-size luxury car to John Fitzpatrick, general marketing man-
ager, Lincoln Mercury.

Free Yourself From The
Daily Commute

(NAPSA)—Every day is casual
day for the 60 million people who
bypass the traditional modes of
transportation and walk to work
in their slippers. At the kitchen
table, in the basement, or in the
spare bedroom, the home office
has become the new American
dream.

In the new book The 60-Second
Commute: A Guide To Your 24/7
Home Office Life (Financial Times
Prentice Hall, $19.95) authors
Erica Orloff and Kathy Levinson,
Ph.D., share their wealth of expe-
rience in managing successful
home-based businesses. This thor-
ough guide covers a full range of
topics, from time management
and getting organized, to filing
taxes, projecting professionalism,
and addressing legal concerns and
issues.

A new book tells you what you
need to know to work from home.

(NAPSA)—Menopause experts
say that healthy eating, exercise
and stress control can help allevi-
ate the discomfort associated with
menopause and peri-menopause.
Supplements are also an option to
discuss with your doctor. Choose
those formulated for women in
menopause and based on
research. One such recommended
supplement is Natrol’s Complete
Balance AM PM Formula for
Menopause, a day and nighttime
hormonal balance supplement
with soy, black cohosh, calcium
and vitamins. The PM formula
also contains melatonin to help
with occasional sleep problems.
For more information, visit
www.natrol.com.

Here’s a suggestion from the
American Dietetic Association
(ADA) that could help put you and
your family on the path to better
nutrition and well-being all year
long: visit a registered dietitian—
the only health professional who
has specific training and an edu-
cational background in food and
nutrition. From obesity, diabetes
and food safety to meal planning,
healthful cooking and packing
children’s school lunches, people
can consult a dietetics profes-
sional for trusted, accurate, timely
and practical advice. To find a reg-
istered dietitian in your area, visit
ADA at www.eatright.org.

It has been said that an indi-
vidual’s nutritional age may not
be the same as his or her biologi-
cal age based on food and lifestyle
choices. Simple dietary and

lifestyle changes can often result
in significant health benefits and
can help your body to age slowly
and gracefully. A free question-
naire available online at www.eDi-
ets. com, a leader in personalized
online diet programs, can deter-
mine if a person’s dietary habits
are positively or negatively
impacting his or her  age. To learn
more or fill out the questionnaire,
visit www.eDiets.com/diettest.

Since 1889, Zatarain’s has been
making authentic New Orleans-
style foods, including some of
America’s favorite rice mixes. To
create Jambalaya, a simple, one-
pot meal and a New Orleans tradi-
tion, follow the cooking directions
on a box of Zatarain’s New Orleans
Style Jambalaya Mix. Add your
choice of smoked sausage or cubed
chicen breast. For delicious recipes
and party ideas, visit www.
zatarain.com.

(NAPSA)—Roses have symbol-
ized love, friendship and beauty
across cultures throughout time.
Whether one’s taste leans towards
the subtle, the flamboyant or the
delicate, there is a rose to please.
Red roses, however, are symbols of
romantic love and dedication, and
continue to be a popular choice.
For a beautiful assortment of roses
this Valentine’s Day, visit
www.1800flowers.com.

Art enthusiasts across the coun-
try will have a chance to view the
largest display of drawings by
Renaissance master Leonardo da
Vinci ever assembled in America.
The rich and varied selections of
nearly 120 drawings by Leonardo
are featured in a landmark exhi-
bition premiering at New York’s
Metropolitan Museum of Art.
“Leonardo da Vinci, Master
Draftsman” is sponsored by Morgan
Stanley and will be on view at the
Met through March 30, 2003. The
exhibition may also be previewed
online at www.metmuseum.org.

Many families are making
travel less stressful by planning
trips that they can afford. It’s a
good idea to know in advance
what’s included and what you will
have to pay when you get to your
destination. Sites such as
Trip.com and Cheaptickets.com let
you build your own packages for
added savings. Cheaptickets.com
is also a good source for travel
savings ideas and family-friendly
games and tools.

Dog owners should talk to vet-
erinarians about any problems
their animals may be experienc-
ing. This can help vets form a bet-

ter diagnosis. The vet should
check your pet for tickborne dis-
eases and heartworm with a quick
and easy in-clinic test. Talk to the
vet about prevention and protec-
tion strategies. Treatments and
medications are readily available.
For more information, visit
www.lymetest.com.

The right choice for your roof
can keep you from hitting the
ceiling when you see your heat-
ing and home-repair bills. The
most widely used roofing mater-
ial in North America, topping
four out of five homes, is asphalt.
Over 12.5 billion square feet of
asphalt shingles—enough to
cover more than five million
homes—are manufactured annu-
ally. Asphalt shingles offer con-
sumers the broadest array of col-
ors,  shapes and textures
available, and can affordably
match almost every type of archi-
tectural design and achieve vir-
tually any desired effect. For
more information on the benefits
of asphalt, go to www.asphaltroof
ing.org.

The Council for Exceptional
Children at www.cec.sped.org.
World Vision 30-Hour Famine
relief at www.30hourfamine.org.
Swanson® at www.swanson
meals.com.
For a beautiful assortment of
roses, visit www.1800flowers.
com.
New York’s Metropolitan
Museum of Art at www.metmu
seum.org.
The National League of Cities
at www.nlc.org.
NASA and International Laser
Ranging at http://ilrs.gsfc.nasa.
gov.
To learn about NASA’s TOPEX/
POSEIDEN project, visit http://
earthobservatory.nasa.gov.
AmeriDream, Inc. at www.
ameridream.org.
The International High IQ Soci-
ety at www.highiqsociety.org.
Cat Attract at www.precious
cat.com.
The American Institute of Certi-
fied Public Accountants at
www.womensfinancialhealth
week.com.

Check Out
These Web Sites:




