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(NAPSA)—A new book takes a
long and fascinating look at his-
tory and biology.

Over a span of 543 million
years, ocular evolution spawned a
variety of eyes for the creatures
inhabiting the earth. For species
from single-cell organisms to
humans, eyes have evolved to
form myriad optical and physio-
logical masterpieces.

Now, for the first time, the
amazing progression of the eyes is
documented through the ages by
the extensive research of Dr. Ivan
Schwab and more than 400 stun-
ning images of critical species and
their ocular microscopy. His
astounding book, “Evolution’s Wit-
ness: How Eyes Evolved,” was pub-
lished by Oxford University Press.

Dr. Schwab is a professor at the
University of California, Davis,
where he has worked as an oph-
thalmologist for more than 20
years. His strong interest in biol-
ogy and natural history led him to
investigate ocular stem cells, bio-
engineered tissues for the eye and
comparative optics and physiol-
ogy. His research took him from
the Burgess Shale in the Cana-
dian Rockies to the Ediacaran
Hills in South Australia and to
every point on earth holding
answers to the wondrous ocular
evolution.

“Like evolution of life in general,
the eye’s early trail is obscure,” Dr.
Schwab says. “‘Evolution’s Witness’
tracks the advancements, springing
them to life. Spiders develop tiny,
well-formed eyes with scanning
optics and three visual pigments,
scallops use the 40 to 100 eyes that
circle their mantle and birds pos-
sess the ability to see up to five
times better than humans. It’s the
storybook tale of life and how eye-
sight evolved from a primeval
organism to an unending variety of

eyes with at least 10 fundamental
designs.”

This extraordinary voyage
through time is a must-read for
ophthalmologists, optometrists,
biologists, neurophysiologists and
anyone interested in science. Yet
everyone from an accountant to
the CEO of a Fortune 500 com-
pany will be enthralled; the pages
lead the mind through a fascinat-
ing world of discovery about
vision, a saga rarely told before
and never with the intrigue, detail
and imagery that Dr. Schwab pre-
sents. His book is a leisurely stroll
through earth’s history, one that
brings a delightful balance of
entertainment and intellectual
stimulation.

“This book is a sure winner,”
says Richard Alan Lewis, a profes-
sor at the Baylor College of Medi-
cine. “It is a tantalizing tale of the
evolution of vision. Readers will
not be able to put it down. It will
capture your imagination.”

It’s available at bookstores and
on Amazon.com. For more informa-
tion, visit www.evolutionswitness.
com.

Discover The Story Of The Eye

A new book, “Evolution’s Wit-
ness,” can enhance your reading,
spark lively discussions and pro-
vide personal enjoyment.

(NAPSA)—Getting involved in
the fight against blood cancer can
be as easy as making a wish.

According to the American
Cancer Society, nearly 138,000
people were diagnosed with a
form of blood cancer last year,
accounting for 9 percent of newly
diagnosed cancer cases in the
United States. Blood cancers are
diseases that can affect the bone
marrow, the blood cells, the lymph
nodes and other parts of the lym-
phatic system.

These blood cancers include
multiple myeloma, Hodgkin’s lym-
phoma, non-Hodgkin’s lymphoma
and leukemia. Although several
new treatments have greatly
increased the rate of blood cancer
cures and remissions in the past
decade, ongoing research and con-
tinued advances in therapies are
still needed to help improve the
lives of patients.

To increase research, education
and access to treatment for pa-
tients, Millennium: The Takeda
Oncology Company developed the
1000 Cranes of Hope program.

The ancient Japanese tradition
of senbazuru promises that a per-
son who folds 1,000 origami cranes
will be granted a wish, such as
long life or recovery from illness.
The crane, known in Japan as the
“tancho,” has for generations
embodied hope, beauty and good
fortune. Many times a family or
group of people have come together
to accomplish this labor of love.

Each visitor to the program’s
website is invited to make wishes,
creating digital origami cranes
that will join the flocks of others
and share their voice in a commu-
nity united against cancer. Visi-
tors are also encouraged to read

the collective wishes of patients,
caregivers, health care providers
and others who stand together to
help find a cure for cancer. For
each wish made, Millennium will
make a donation to one of several
professional and charitable orga-
nizations that are committed to
advancing cancer research, treat-
ment support and education.

“The 1000 Cranes of Hope pro-
gram is a unique way for patients,
treatment providers, family and
friends to get involved in the fight
against cancer,” said Tom K., a
multiple myeloma survivor. “It
was very touching and encourag-
ing to read these heartfelt wishes
during my treatment program for
multiple myeloma.”

The initiative is a way to give
back to the cancer community and
to promote the development of
extraordinary medicines for can-
cer patients through science, in-
novation and passion. For more
information, visit www.1000
cranesofhope.com.

Join “1000 Cranes Of Hope”To Help Fight Cancer

The ancient Japanese tradition of
senbazuru promises that a per-
son who folds 1,000 origami
cranes will be granted a wish.

(NAPSA)—To help parents and
caregivers faced with the ever-
challenging task of preparing
healthful school lunches that kids
will actually eat, Registered Dieti-
tian Sarah Wally offers a few tips:

•Include all food groups. A
balanced lunch is a healthful
lunch. Follow the MyPlate meal-
planning model and pack a serv-
ing or two from each of the follow-
ing categories: grains, vegetables,
fruit, dairy and protein. Vegeta-
bles and fruits should account for
roughly half of the meal.

•Keep foods safe. Making
sure hot foods stay hot and cool
foods stay cool is imperative to
keep food-borne illness at bay.
Insulated thermoses are a great
option for storing soups or warm
pasta. Adding a frozen juice box to
your kid’s lunch bag creates an
instant ice pack to keep cool items
chilled and it will defrost just in
time to enjoy at lunch. As a bonus,
just 4 ounces of 100% juice counts
as a serving (half a cup) of fruit.

•Get the kids involved. Ask-
ing your children to help plan
their weekly lunches lets them
feel important and in control.
Share with them your criteria for
a healthy lunch and then give
them some options to choose from.
Kids will enjoy a break from repe-
titious lunches and learn a bit
about creating healthful meals.

•Use lunchtime as a way to
connect. A handwritten note can

be a surprising, sentimental way
to reconnect with your kids. Use a
napkin to write a few words of
encouragement before that after-
lunch test or important soccer
game. It can make their day.
Recipe for a Healthful Lunch Box

•Choose whole grain breads
and crackers for added fiber.

•Pack 100% juice, providing vi-
tamins, minerals, and beneficial plant
compounds called phytonutrients.

•Stick to low-fat or fat-free
dairy products.

•Help your kids to “eat the
rainbow” by offering a variety of
colorful fruits and vegetables.

Learn More
For more information, log on

to www.fruitjuicefacts.org.

Healthful, Fun And Swap-proof School Lunches

The lunch you pack for your child
can be one she’ll like and good
for her, too.

by Stephen M. Edelson, Ph.D.
(NAPSA)—In the early days of

attempting to treat autism, par-
ents were given little to no hope
regarding their child’s prognosis;
the usual recommendation was

institutionalization
and/or medication.
That is no longer the
case.

Autism experts
now value behav-
ioral, environmental
and diet modifica-
tions in treating
autism. Autism man-
ifests differently in

each person, with the most com-
mon symptoms affecting the
immunological, the gastrointesti-
nal and the metabolic systems, as
well as the neurological system.

Diet has long been known to be
a factor in various medical disor-
ders—and autism is no exception.
Affected children can have an
exaggerated response to toxins,
foods and airborne allergens. Vari-
ous research studies have shown
that those with autism often lack
various nutrients, enzymes, anti-
oxidants and essential fatty acids.

The integrative medical ap-
proach to treating autism is
guided by a simple principle:
Remove what is causing harm and
add what is missing.

“My son was diagnosed with
full-syndrome autism when he
was 2 years old,” says Autism
Research Institute’s Conference
Director Denise Fulton. “He
exhibited uncontrollable repetitive
behavior, a lack of social engage-
ment and very little speech. After
seven years using appropriate

medical treatments and individu-
alized behavioral intervention, my
son has significantly improved
over his initial prognosis. Today,
he attends school and community
activities without an aide, has
made good friends, and enjoys act-
ing on stage, traveling, and learn-
ing new things.”

If you or someone you know
has a child who has been diag-
nosed with autism, I urge you to
keep looking for answers. Autism
is treatable.

The Autism Research Institute
holds biannual conferences about
the integrative medical approach
for treating autism. Visit
www.ariconference.com to learn
more.

Stephen M. Edelson, Ph.D., is
the director of the Autism Re-
search Institute. Dr. Edelson has
been conducting autism research
for more than 30 years. His work
spans a variety of areas including
biomedical, behavioral, sensory
and cognition.

Autism Is Treatable

Parents of children with autism
have seen significant impact with
dietary and lifestyle adjustments.

Stephen M.
Edelson

(NAPSA)—White whole wheat
flour, whole flax seed and whole
flax meal are made to help con-
sumers add more nutrition to deli-
cious home-baked goods. They are
made by King Arthur Flour. For
recipes and baking tips, visit
www.kingarthurflour.com.

* * *
For recipes, tips and informa-

tion, visit the National Frozen &
Refrigerated Foods Association at
www.EasyHomeMeals.com and
www.facebook.com/EasyHome
Meals. There, you’ll find rules for a
Ski or Sea Vacation Sweepstakes
that celebrates a Cool Food for
Kids promotion, during which
you’ll find special deals on frozen
foods.

* * *
Gluten-free recipe developer

and TV chef Carol Kicinski always
keeps a jar or two of maraschino
cherries on hand because these
moist and flavorful bits of fruit
are an easy way to add color, fla-
vor and fun to many desserts. For
gluten-free recipes, visit www.
nationalcherries.com.

(NAPSA)—To fuel the connec-
tion between music and play,
LEGO Systems released a series
of free, downloadable songs to
inspire and entertain children as
they play—DUPLO JAMS. In
addition to upbeat songs, the
series offers age-appropriate tips
and activities. For a downloadable
magazine, visit Face-
book.com/LEGO DUPLO.

* * *
Research suggests that in less

than 10 years, 60 percent of U.S.
jobs will require postsecondary
education. Bellevue University,
which caters to adult learners,
offers credit for work and life
experience. Learn more at www.
bellevue.edu.
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