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(NAPSA)—Brokerage firms
often talk about the services they
offer without providing many
details about their most important
product—the trade. That’s
because many firms believe that
investors cannot compare the
quality of the execution they pro-
vide. However, there can be signif-
icant differences in the way stock
transactions are conducted. In
fact, these distinctions often
determine if brokers are adding
value to a transaction or seeking
to gain additional profits at the
expense of their customers.

Firms that add value to the
equity transaction take full re-
sponsibility for executing their
customers’ transactions. To add
value to the transaction, a broker
should be able to quickly scan the
market and route an order to the
market participant that is ex-
pected to provide the best execu-
tion. Most investors are surprised
to learn that not all firms do so. 

Many brokers—both online and
offline—send orders to a middle-
man for execution. These third
parties can be thought of as whole-
sale brokers who pay retail broker-
age firms for the privilege of exe-
cuting their orders. This process is
called “payment for order flow.”
These middlemen, called market
makers, profit by trading against
this very same order flow. It is the
prospect of making handsome
trading profits that prompts mar-
ket makers to offer payments to
retail brokerage firms.

Typical payments for order flow
range from $3 to $10 for a 500-
share order, adding to the firm’s
revenue beyond posted commis-
sion rate.

Such arrangements can place
brokers in a conflicted position:
brokers are required to seek the
best execution for customers’
transactions, yet receive payments

from firms that trade against their
customers. If the wholesale firms
are able to make such a profit, was
the best execution for the cus-
tomer actually obtained?

It is unusual to find a major
broker that does not seek order
flow payments or trade against its
customers’ orders. Dave Whit-
more, senior vice president, cus-
tomer development, Datek Online
Brokerage Services LLC, said,
“Our computers are programmed
to seek the best execution for each
order, regardless of order flow con-
siderations. If we do happen to be
paid for our order flow, we rebate
that money back to our customers.
These rebates, which amounted to
$2.4 million last year, demon-
strate that we have no conflicts.”

A variation on order flow pay-
ments is the practice of internal-
ization. Some brokers relay orders
to their own trading departments,
which once again profit by trading
against the order flow generated
by individual investors. Internal
trading departments can earn
even greater profits because they
don’t have to pay for the orders.

While market makers play a
valuable role in our capital mar-
kets, certain practices stack the
deck against smaller investors. For
example, a market maker has up to
three minutes to respond to an
order. This gives the market maker
an opportunity to spot a change in
the direction of the market, gaining
a distinct information advantage
over less knowledgeable investors.
This could result in a market order
that is executed at a price that is
different than the one that had
been displayed. A limit order may
not be executed.

In contrast, alternative trading
systems, commonly referred to as
ECNs (electronic communications
networks), do not have profit-
seeking market makers acting as
middlemen. ECNs are computer
systems that post orders to buy
and sell from many different mar-
ket participants, and quickly
match orders electronically.

ECNs typically do not pay bro-
kerage firms for directing orders.
In fact, most charge firms a frac-
tion of a cent per share to execute
an order. For this reason, many
brokers prefer to have arrange-
ments with middlemen that pay
them for order flow.

Mr. Whitmore said that the
vast majority of Datek’s orders are
executed on ECNs, and the aver-
age speed for a marketable online
equity order in March 2001 was
less than seven seconds.

The U.S. Securities and Ex-
change Commission has become
more concerned with the quality of
execution and will require brokers
to publicly disclose the way they
route their orders.

These disclosures will help
investors evaluate the way bro-
kers execute their orders, and
seek out those brokers that work
on their behalf, both in the front
office and behind the scenes.

Transaction Quality Can Vary at Your Online Broker

Researching a broker’s order-
routing policy can help investors
ensure their best interests are
served.

(NAPSA)—If you could grow
the “food of the future” what would
it be? Would it be as healthy as
broccoli but taste like ice cream?
Would it grow from seed to stalk in
just one day? Could it help combat
world hunger?

Biotechnology is helping make
foods even better: better tasting,
better for you, and better for the
environment. The Council for
Biotechnology Information is on a
nationwide search for kids with
creative ideas about science to
come up with the “Food of the
Future.” For example, if you could
grow a food that would help peo-
ple, what would it be? How would
it look and taste?

One lucky winner will be
awarded a $10,000 college schol-
arship. The winner and his or her
“Food of the Future” drawing will
also be featured on Biotech And
You! a monthly online magazine
featured on www.whybiotech.com.

It’s Easy—Just Use Your 
Imagination!

Entering is easy! Just print out
an official entry form by logging
onto www.whybiotech.com and
clicking on the link to the “Food of
the Future” contest. In the spaces
provided, draw a picture of your
“Food of the Future” and tell us
about it in 50—100 words. Print
your complete name, address,
date of birth and telephone num-
ber on the lines provided. If you
do not have access to the Internet,
you can receive an official entry
form via U.S. mail by calling 202-
467-6565 and requesting one.

Finally, mail your completed
entry form to: “Food of the Future”
Contest, 676 N. St. Clair #1000,
Chicago, IL 60611. Kids can enter
the contest as often as they choose,
but only one entry per stamped
envelope will be accepted.

The “Food of the Future” con-
test is open to children 8 to 12

years old on May 31, 2001. All
entries will be judged based on
originality, creativity and appro-
priateness to the contest theme, a
“Food of the Future” that would
help people in some way (for
example, help combat world
hunger or produce food in a more
earth-friendly manner).

FREE Activity Book Offer
Everyone who enters will auto-

matically receive a free copy of
“Look Closer at Biotechnology”
filled with fun educational activi-
ties for children to learn more
about the future of food. The 16-
page workbook comes with a set of
colored pencils and includes word
games, puzzles and coloring activ-
ities that are fun for kids and also
make this new science easy to
understand.

Don’t Delay, Enter Today!
The “Food of the Future” con-

test ends September 30, 2001. For
more information about biotech-
nology and the “Food of the
Future” contest, visit the Council
for Biotechnology Information’s
Web site at www.whybiotech.com.
The winner will be selected on or
about October 31, 2001.

Calling All Junior Scientists!
Create An Imaginary “Food of the Future” For A
Chance To Win A $10,000 College Scholarship!

(NAPSA)—STIHL manufactures
the world’s largest selling brand of
chain saws and portable, hand-
held, cut-off machines as well as a
complete line of powerful, light-
weight, and versatile outdoor power
equipment and top quality, preci-
sion hand tools for homeowners and
professional users.  STIHL products
are sold through independent ser-
vicing power equipment retailers
from coast to coast.  For more infor-
mation or for the name of the clos-
est STIHL retailer call toll free 1-
800- GO STIHL (1-800-467-8445) or
visit their Web site at www.stih
lusa.com.

Your garden needs sunlight,
water and attention to thrive. Addi-
tionally, while the bacteria, fungi
and parasites present in potting
mixes and soils can be your gar-
den’s best friend, they may be
unhealthy for you. Using paper
products such as Sparkle® paper
towels can help reduce the risk of
contamination when you are plant-
ing your indoor or outdoor garden,
say experts at the Georgia-Pacific
Health Smart™ Institute. For more
information on staying healthy,
please call  toll-free 1-877-

GPCLEAN or visit  www.gphealth
smart.com.

Many Valley Forge countryside
inns and taverns frequented by
General George Washington and
his opponent, British General
Howe are still welcoming travel-
ers to enjoy a good meal or a bev-
erage—and a slice of history. For
a free Valley Forge Visitors Guide
and Calendar of Events, listing
these inns and other area attrac-
tions, call 1-888-Visit VF. Or visit
the Web site, www.valleyforge.
org.

(NAPSA)—A growing number
of parents are finding that when
it comes to choosing toys for their
children, staying power can be
just as important as playing
power. A good example of this is a
series of toys that was named the
best selling action figure of 2000
and continues to top children’s
wish lists. Based on the popular
“Power Rangers Time Force” TV
Show, the line features items
ranging from action figures to
time traveling vehicles to remote
controlled, infrared activated
robots. For more information on
the complete toy line, you can
visit Bandai America online at
www.bandai.com.

A new Internet offering from
Stouffer’s makes giving the gift of
food as easy as pie. Consumers
who visit www.Stouffers.com will
be able to purchase gift certifi-
cates for Stouffer’s entrées. The
certificates are available for a
variety of products, including
Stouffer’s core entrées and Stouf-
fer ’s Family Style Favorites®

meals. For more information,
visit www.Stouffers.com.

According to The Journal of the
British Menopause Society, many
women would prefer an effective
alternative to hormone replace-
ment therapy (HRT) when it
comes to relieving menopausal

symptoms. One study showed
that a red clover-derived iso-
flavone preparation called
Promensil, given at a dose of 40
mg per day, produced a 75 percent
reduction in hot flashes after 16
weeks. Over 1,000 women have
been through trials with Promen-
sil with no related product side
effects reported. For more informa-
tion, visit www.promensil.com.

According to Dairy Manage-
ment, Inc., every region has foods
that are specific to that area, such
as apricots from the West Coast or
cherries from the Midwest. Pine
nuts hail from the Southwest mak-
ing Orange, Pine Nut Cookies a
regional favorite. This buttery
baked cookie is loaded with flavor
and texture. For this and other
regional dessert recipes, visit
www.butterisbest.com.

Vancouver Island is the largest
island on the Pacific Coast of
North America and is named for
the British explorer George Van-
couver.

Predating the telephone, the
first fax machine was created by
Italian priest Giovanni Caselli in
1863.


