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by Donald J. Carty, Chairman
and CEO, American Airlines
(NAPSA)—American Airlines has

learned some important lessons dur-
ing a period of unprecedented chal-
lenge in America. Foremost among
them is the realization that having
in place a set of core values and prin-
ciples provides a critical guidepost
at times of adversity.  

American’s val-
ues and principles
are embodied in our
Airline Leadership
Plan, which stresses
six areas—Safety,
Service, Network,
Technology, Product
and Culture. By ori-
enting every decision
around our goal of

leadership in those areas, we have a
roadmap for recovery that keeps us
focused on our customers, our
employees and our shareholders.

The spirit, talent and dedication
of American’s people have helped
us get through some of our darkest
days. It is clearly our people who
make American work, so we set out
several years ago to ensure that
American continued to be a great
place to work. 

We have discovered an unex-
pected richness in tapping the
divergent views of people of all
races, genders, national origins
and lifestyles—all pulling toward
the same goals.  

Diversity, however, has its
challenges. Although we won
dozens of awards for our work-
place policies and programs, and
have been recognized for the
involvement of our employees and
our Diversity Advisory Council,
much remains to be done.

We have seen small pockets of
resistance from a very few people.
Even in this day and age, I hear
isolated reports of employees com-
ing to work to find distasteful
affronts to their race, their reli-
gion, their national origin, their
gender, disability or sexual orien-

tation. We have consistently disci-
plined and often terminated peo-
ple for these behaviors, but we
have not been able to wholly
remove this vestige of unpleasant-
ness from the workplace.

So, a couple of weeks ago, we
adopted a more aggressive
approach. We will go beyond our
already strong measures to more
clearly explain—and aggressively
enforce—our zero-tolerance poli-
cies. The rules and regulations
have been rewritten and we will
fire people for hate-related behav-
ior regardless of their tenure or
their work record. 

We pledge to turn the egregious
cases over to law enforcement
authorities for criminal prosecu-
tion if necessary.  

To implement these policies, we
will train 10,000 managers and
supervisors by year-end and have
asked four highly respected and
nationally recognized members of
our Board of Directors to help
monitor our progress. This is
unprecedented in the airline
industry—no airline board has
been asked to take such an active
role. We have asked our unions to
join in this important measure.

Some people may ask why we
are directing resources to cultural
issues when we remain under
financial pressure from the Sept.
11 attacks.  

The answer is evident. Even in
tough times—perhaps especially
in tough times—no company can
lose sight of its values. At Ameri-
can, we will not allow the progress
we’ve made to be damaged or
diminished by this behavior.

For more than 76 years, peo-
ple of all backgrounds, races,
religions, national origins and
life experiences have made
American successful. Everyone
deserves a safe, harassment-free
place to work. We’re committed
to having that place at Ameri-
can—that’s what leadership is all
about.

Grasping The Value Of Diversity In Tough Times

Donald J. Carty

Fast Stress Relief
On the Go!

(NAPSA)—Living with stress is
a fact of life, but now there’s all-
new Rescue Remedy Spray® from
Nelson Bach USA, Ltd. that offers
fast and convenient relief. Now,
the best selling stress reliever,
Rescue Remedy, used by celebri-
ties including Cate Blanchett,
Rosie O’Donnell, Jennifer Aniston,
and Sissy Spacek is available in
an easy-to-use spray format for
people on the go—portable enough
to toss in a purse or pocket.

“We all have stress. How we
react to it is our choice. Instead of
becoming over-emotional, grab-
bing another cigarette, or snap-
ping at a colleague, we can reach
for Rescue Remedy Spray,” said
Nancy Buono, national education
manager of Nelson Bach USA,
Ltd. “Rescue Remedy helps us
take control of our lives—it
relieves stress naturally and
safely without side-effects. With
stress under control, we can make
more rational life choices. And, we
live healthier lives.”

During the early 1930s, Dr.
Edward Bach discovered the 38
Bach Flower Essences, dilutions
of flowers which balance different
emotional states. He found that
five of the essences: Rock Rose,
Star of Bethlehem, Impatiens,
Cherry Plum and Clematis had
special energy properties to calm
agitated emotions, creating an
effective remedy for everyday
stress. This combination came to
be known as Rescue Remedy.
Today, it’s sold all over the world,
and yet the mother tinctures are
still made according to Dr. Bach’s
original methods, formulated over
70 years ago in England. 

Nelson Bach has been manu-
facturing homeopathic medicines
since 1860. With over 140 years of
solid homeopathic experience, the
company has earned the distinc-
tion of being a worldwide leader in
its field.  

For more information on Res-
cue Remedy®, the Bach Flower
Essences® and Nelsons™ Home-
opathy,  contact Nelson Bach
USA at 1-800-319-9151 or visit
www.nelsonbach.com.

(NAPSA)—On an average day,
small-business owners must play
the roles of accountant, secretary
and human resources specialist,
among others. One crucial role
often overlooked, however, is that
of packaging and shipping expert.
If shipping products is a large
part of one’s business, the way the
product is packaged is important
because it is the first opportunity
to make a positive impression on
customers. The following quick
tips are designed to help busi-
nesses package products so they
arrive on time, unharmed and
visually appealing.

Get It There On Time: To
ensure that products arrive on
time, it is essential to use ade-
quate postage so the product will
not be returned to sender—leav-
ing the customer to wonder when,
and if, the order ever will arrive.
Rather than guessing how much
postage to use, business owners
can utilize the United States
Postal Service’s online postage
rate calculators.

Get It There In One Piece:
Nothing can alienate customers
more than receiving broken mer-
chandise. To prevent product
breakage during shipping, busi-
ness owners should make sure an
adequate amount of the proper
packaging material is used.

One packaging material option
is Instapak Quick foam-in-bag
packaging by Sealed Air Corpora-
tion. To use the product, simply
apply pressure to designated
areas of the bag to mix two liquid
components contained within.
When the liquids mix, packaging
foam is activated inside the bag
and rises to form a protective
cushioning for the products to be
shipped. It is a good way to create
custom packaging just in time.

By vis it ing www.instapak
quick.com, shippers can access a
calculator that determines how
much of the foam cushioning is
needed to adequately protect a

product based on its dimensions
and weight. The calculator is able
to determine whether foam pack-
aging is the best option for the
specified product.

Through the Web site, users
also can access the “Packaging
Options Finder.” This interactive
section of the site features a pull-
down menu that enables users to
select the product being sent and
discover the best possible packag-
ing options to meet their needs.

Get It There Attractively: A
series of focus groups was con-
ducted by 3M recently on how
Internet consumers viewed the
packages they received. Con-
sumers proved to be quite savvy
about the shipping process and
hold a strong opinion that the
shipping container should be close
to the size of the product inside.

A real irritation for customers
is receiving a small product placed
in too large a box, surrounded by
“peanuts” or other fillers, such as
shredded paper. The messy and
unattractive “peanuts” came up
again and again as the biggest
gripe.

To combat this messy packaging
dilemma, there are attractive pack-
aging options that do not require a
larger-than-necessary box. Foam-
in-bag packaging, cushioned mail-
ers and inflatable packaging are
just a few of the alternatives that
protect the product without wast-
ing space. To learn more about
packaging options or to receive
answers to packaging questions,
call  1-800-568-6636, or visit
www.sealedair.com.

Package Like An Expert—Even If You Aren’t

FOR SMALL BUSINESS

(NAPSA)—Plastic surgeons
repair the results of thousands of
dog attacks each year. If a child is
severely bitten, say experts, par-
ents should ask the emergency
room physician to call a plastic
surgeon certified by the American
Board of Plastic Surgery (ensur-
ing the doctor is qualified to per-
form reconstructive and cosmetic
procedures on the face and all
areas of the body). For more infor-
mation on dog bite prevention and
to download the “Beware the
Bite!” children’s activity sheet,
visit www.plasticsurgery.org. To
find a board-certified plastic sur-
geon and learn more about plastic
surgery, visit the Web site or call
1-888-4-PLASTIC (1-888-475-
2784).

Two of the nation’s leading
advocates of health care quality
and safety have launched a
national campaign to urge patients
to take a role in preventing health
care errors. Dubbed “Speak Up,”
the groundbreaking program spon-
sored by the Joint Commission on
Accreditation of Healthcare Orga-
nizations (JCAHO) encourages pa-
tients to become active, involved
and informed participants on the
health care team. The steps are

based on research which shows
that patients who take part in
decisions about their health care
are more likely to have better out-
comes. Consumers can download
a “Speak Up” brochure that pro-
vides specific guidance to pa-
tients to help them make their
care safer by visiting the JCAHO
Web site, www.jcaho.org. The
brochure is also available by
calling JCAHO’s Customer Ser-
vice Center at 630-792-5800,
8:30 a.m. to 5 p.m. CT, Monday
through Friday.

(NAPSA)—To help people
around the world get back in the
game—whatever their game is—
members of one non-profit associ-
ation are donating their time as
coaches for those affected by Sep-
tember 11 and subsequent events.
The International Coach Federa-
tion (ICF) has started a Global
Pro-Bono Coaching Project to help
people move forward in their lives
by setting better goals, making
better decisions and more fully
using their natural strengths.
Hundreds of ICF coaches from
around the world have volun-
teered to provide up to two
months of coaching for a maxi-
mum of two clients. For more
information, visit www.coachfed
eration.org or to speak to ICF
Executive Director Dan Marti-
nage, call 1-888-423-3131. 

There are more than a million
species of insects. Some can dam-
age your home and affect your
family’s health. To effectively com-
bat these pests, many homeown-
ers use Bayer Advanced Home
Pest Control, containing cyflu-
thrin, which kills a broad range of
insects for up to nine months
indoors. Outdoors it can be used to
create a barrier to keep bugs out.
To learn more about caring for
your lawn, garden and home and
about discounts on products, visit
www.bayeradvanced.com or call 1-

877-BAYERAG.
Now parents and caregivers

have a unique, fresh resource to
help them cope with a tragedy
played out in the news, a crisis in
the family or the death of a loved
one: When Terrible Things Hap-
pen, a new booklet released
jointly by the American Academy
of Pediatrics, the International
Pediatric Association and Johnson
& Johnson Pediatric Institute,
L.L.C. It offers simple, practical
advice in age-appropriate cate-
gories: Infant and Toddler,
Preschool, School Age and Adoles-
cent/Teenager. The booklet When
Terrible Things Happen is avail-
able through your pediatrician’s
office or online at www.jjpi.com.

***
Never lose sight of the fact that
old age needs so little but needs
that little so much.

—Margaret Willour
***

***
Always bear in mind that your
own resolution to succeed is
more important than any one
thing.

—Abraham Lincoln
***

****
Solitude is as needful to the
imagination as society is whole-
some for the character.

—James Russell Lowell
***




