
13

by Lance Walheim
Bayer Advanced™ Garden Expert

(NAPSA)—To many homeowners,
a thick, green lawn brings a great
sense of pride. There’s also a finan-
cial incentive to having a great-look-
ing lawn: According to The Lawn

Institute, home-
owners may real-
ize up to a 15-
percent increase
in property value
from a well-main-
tained lawn and
landscape. 

Maintaining
your lawn does-
n’t have to be a

massive undertaking. All you need
to remember are three easy steps
to having a fuller, more beautiful
lawn:

• Fertilize. For the best-look-
ing lawn, fertilize according to
label directions during the active
growth period. So for warm-sea-
son grasses, such as Bermuda and
St. Augustine, that means fertiliz-
ing from late spring through the
summer and, in the Deep South,
into early fall. Cool-season
grasses, such as Kentucky blue-
grass and tall fescue, require fer-
tilization in the spring, no applica-
tions during the heat of summer,
and resuming applications in the
fall (winter in warmer parts of the
country). Be sure to follow the rec-
ommended fertilizer spreader set-
tings on the bag.

• Water properly. If you look
behind you and see footprints in
your grass, it’s time to water. Most
lawns need a total of about one to
two inches of water per week in
mid-summer. Usually this is bro-
ken up into two or three applica-
tions, watering the soil to a depth
of six to eight inches each time. Be
sure to water early in the morning
to avoid lawn diseases.

• Mow frequently. Set your
mower at the proper height for
your type of lawn grass. Mow the
lawn when the grass reaches

one-third higher than the recom-
mended mowing height. Cut it
too low and you'll weaken the
lawn, inviting weeds to take
over.

Bayer Advanced Lawn® has now
made it easier than ever to build a
better lawn. Bayer Advanced
Lawn® Triple Action fertilizers are
special because they feed your
lawn at every level. The product
not only continuously feeds the
grass for a thicker, greener lawn,
it also builds stronger root sys-
tems. Plus it enriches and fortifies
your soil with extra nutrition for a
deep-down green lawn that lasts.
And if you need to control weeds,
Bayer Advanced Lawn Triple
Action Fertilizer Plus Weed Con-
trol helps you control weeds at the
same time you feed at every level.
It contains a proven weed killer for
lawns that controls more than 200
broadleaf weeds, including dande-
lion and clover, without harming
the lawn.

For more information, visit
www.bayeradvanced.com or call 
1-877-BAYERAL.

Bayer Advanced™ Garden
Expert Lance Walheim has
authored or contributed to more
than 30 gardening books includ-
ing Roses for Dummies, Lawn
Care for Dummies, Landscaping
for Dummies and Vegetable Gar-
dening for Dummies.

Cultivate A Lawn In Three Easy Steps

If your lawn is a cut above the
rest, you may realize a 15 percent
increase in your property value.

(NAPSA)—These days, getting
your money’s worth is the rule
rather than the exception. One of
the easiest ways to save unneces-
sary costs is to make sure your
long-distance calling plan matches
your calling needs. However,
many people don’t realize how
simple it can be to find a plan that
fits their lifestyle.

Today, with increased industry
competition and more provider
choices, long-distance companies
are offering more than just a tele-
phone connection. Doing some
research can ensure you’ll find the
long-distance plan that stretches
your dollar farther and earns you
extra perks when you call. Here
are five factors to consider so you
can get the most out of your plan.

Know your calling pattern.
Review past phone bills to see what
types of calls you typically make.
Consider when you make calls and
where you call. Do you want to be
able to call anywhere in the coun-
try, anytime you want, or do you
prefer to wait until evening hours
to call? Remember that many long-
distance plans include a monthly
fee. So if you make long-distance
calls at night and talk less than 30
minutes a month, a standard rate
plan may cost less than a discount
calling plan. But no one calling
plan is meant to fit all callers.
Aside from standard and discount
calling plans, other options include
block-of-time programs. 

Bundle up. Many national
long-distance providers offer more
than just long-distance services.
Choosing to bundle options such
as Internet and wireless services
with your long distance can add
up to monthly savings. For in-
stance, some providers, such as
Sprint, offer their wireless cus-
tomers free residential domestic
long-distance minutes as a bonus.

Go for  the perks . Long-
d is tance providers often offer
bonuses with calling plans, such

as airline mileage. Get more value
out of your plan by finding out
what partnerships long-distance
providers have and what perks
they offer.

Factor in international
calls. International calling is
often overlooked when selecting a
long-distance calling plan. But if
you make more than two interna-
tional calls a month, an interna-
tional calling plan can help keep
down the cost of calling overseas. 

Consider the source. While
cost may be a primary factor in
selecting a long-distance provider,
it is also important to choose a
company that is well-recognized
within the industry. Make sure
the long-distance provider you
choose offers reliable service, good
customer care, and will be around
six months from now.

“It’s important to assess your
calling patterns to find a plan that
will fit your needs,” said Jeff Mott,
vice president of marketing, Mass
Markets Organization at Sprint.
“As an integrated communications
provider, Sprint encourages cus-
tomers to consult with us to evalu-
ate all the communications ser-
vices they use, in addition to long
distance, to find out how bundling
those services can add up to sav-
ings down the road.”

For more information about
Sprint’s services, call (800) 746-
3767.

Calling All Long-Distance Customers

(NAPSA)—If you’re concerned
about your family’s medical
expenses, here’s some good news.
A new program is giving low-
income and uninsured people
access to information on getting
hundreds of medications you need.

Last year, patient assistance
programs provided $1.5 billion
worth of prescription medications
to five million Americans, including
senior citizens whose only medical
insurance is Medicare, which does
not cover prescription drugs.

The pharmaceutical industry
has a long tradition of providing
prescription medicines free of
charge to patients who might not
otherwise be able to afford them.

Recently, the Pharmaceutical
Research and Manufacturers of
America (PhRMA) launched
www.helpingpatients.org, a new
interactive Web site that provides
a comprehensive one-stop link to
more than 1400 medicines offered
through more than 140 industry
and 185 government and privately
sponsored patient assistance pro-
grams. The Web site enables
patients to fill out an online form
and receive a listing of programs
for which they may be qualified.
PhRMA also publishes a printed
version of the Directory of Prescrip-
tion Drug Patient Assistance Pro-
grams, which lists programs, the
companies that offer them, avail-
able medicines, basic eligibility

requirements and contact persons.
Industry patient assistance

programs are considered indis-
pensible for ensuring that the
neediest patients have access to
medicines, but they alone cannot
solve the underlying problem of
healthcare access, including
availability of prescription drugs
at all income levels. The industry
will continue to work coopera-
tively with organizations and
individuals who are seeking pub-
lic and private sector solutions to
chronic health system challenges.

For more information or to find
out if your family is eligible for a
patient assistance program, go to
www.helpingpatients.org or
www.phrma.org.

Online Access To Medicines For Those In Need

Pharmaceutical companies
are committed to helping people
get prescription drugs.

(NAPSA)—Volunteers of Amer-
ica reports that about one-third of
its roughly 60,000 volunteers are
seniors. Those seniors help with a
wide variety of human service pro-
grams in more than 40 states. Vol-
unteers of America is a national,
nonprofit, spiritually based orga-
nization providing local human
service programs and opportuni-
ties for individual and community
involvement. For more informa-
tion about senior volunteer pro-
grams, call Volunteers of America
at 800-899-0089 or visit www.Vol
unteersofAmerica.org.

Hanes Hosiery, the nation’s
leading hosiery manufacturer,
has designed a new, break-
through hosiery style that’s help-
ing women enjoy their new
strappy sandals and show off
their pedicured toes at the same
time. Hanes Hosiery’s Silk Reflec-
tions Beyond Bare collection now
includes Toeless hosiery, featuring
a specially-designed toe thong.
You can learn more about the col-
lection at www.haneshosiery.com.

Developed by BoomerangIt, the
McGruff ID Armor Identity Theft
Prevention and Privacy Pack

includes forms addressed to credit
bureaus and direct marketers,
useful phone numbers and valu-
able tips to keep your identity and
credit secure. The process takes
just 30 minutes, the time neces-
sary to complete and mail a few
forms. Once credit agencies re-
ceive the forms, an account cannot
be opened unless the store or
other business calls the consumer
directly. McGruff ID Armor costs
about $10 (an e-mail version is $8)
and can be purchased by visiting
www.boomerangit.com or calling
1-800-2BOOMIT. A percentage of
sales go to fund National Crime
Prevention Council programs.

(NAPSA)—Students interested
in pursuing a career in healthcare
may be eligible for tuition assis-
tance through an annual scholar-
ship program that has awarded
more than $6 million in financial
aid since 1991. Scholarship appli-
cations and guidelines are at
Albertson’s, CVS, Eckerd, K-Mart,
Kroger, Rite Aid, Target, Wal-
Mart and Walgreen’s or at
www.tylenol.com. Entries must be
postmarked by April 30, 2003.

Keeping up the momentum of
drug discovery that has cut deaths
from heart disease and stroke in
half over the past three decades,
pharmaceutical and biotechnology
companies continue to work on
new medicines for these diseases.
Recently, the research-based phar-
maceutical manufacturers an-
nounced 123 treatments either in
clinical trials or awaiting approval
by the Food and Drug Administra-
tion. These new medicines
promise to continue the already
remarkable progress against
heart disease and stroke and to
raise the quality of life for
patients with these diseases. The
complete survey can be viewed at
www.phrma.org.

***
Everything should be made as
simple as possible, but not one
bit simpler.

—Albert Einstein
***

***
If you would persuade, you must
appeal to interest, rather than
intellect.

—Benjamin Franklin
***

***
True ecstasy hails neither from
spirit nor from nature, but from
the union of these two.

—Martin Buber
***




