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by Elaine Knight
(NAPSA)—There is no question

about it—the warm Gulf and
Atlantic waters of the U.S. pro-
duce some of the most succulent,
sweetest shrimp ever eaten. How-
ever, all shrimp are not alike in
taste, texture, safety and price.

Today, much to the surprise of
many consumers, as much as 85
percent of the shrimp we eat is an
imported product sold at premium
prices. And a majority of these
shrimp originate from foreign
pond farms that do not have to
comply with our strict environ-
mental laws.

Most importantly, on March 3,
2004, the General Accountability
Office, the investigative arm of
the Congress, found that the U.S.
Food and Drug Administration
had only the resources to test just
over one percent of the imported
shrimp that ends up on our dinner
plates for contaminants, including
illegal chloramphenicol antibiotic
residues.

Consequently, consumers are
unwittingly paying top-dollar for
what they believe to be wild-
caught American shrimp when, in
fact, the product is likely to come
from ponds halfway around the
world. Due to scarce FDA enforce-
ment resources, consumers have
no way of knowing whether the
shrimp is contaminated or not.

According to an August 19, 2004
report from the National Marine
Fisheries Service, shrimp prices
declined 27 percent in the Gulf of
Mexico shrimp fisheries between
1997 and 2002, as imports in-
creased 300 percent. The result of
this marketing “flimflam” is that
the price U.S. shrimpers are paid
is the lowest since the industry
started keeping records, while

restaurant prices have actually
increased. So it comes as no sur-
prise that, in spite of using mod-
ern, environmentally sound tech-
nology and harvesting techniques,
American families who have
shrimped for generations are on
the brink of economic destruction.

Consumers do have a powerful
weapon to get the quality they
expect when buying shrimp. They
can vote with their wallets and
purses. To get sweet, tender, nat-
urally harvested shrimp, rich in
omega 3 essential fatty acids,
make sure you ask for Wild
American shrimp and look for the
country of origin label and the
Wild American shrimp certifica-
tion. In doing so you will receive
the very best value for your pur-
chase and help preserve a salty
way of life that defines entire
communities throughout the Gulf
Coast and Eastern Seaboard.

Elaine Knight is co-owner of
Knight Seafood Inc. in Brunswick,
Georgia and president of the
Southern Shrimp Alliance. She
has served the community through
a number of councils and panels
and is a member of the Georgia
Fishermen’s Association.

A Jumbo Fight Over Shrimp

Now shrimp lovers can ask for
the high quality Wild American
shrimp for real value and taste.

(NAPSA)—As the cloud of Sad-
dam Hussein’s dictatorship has
been lifted from the face of Iraq,
Iraqi citizens are gradually ad-
justing to life in a free and democ-
ratic society, complete with per-
sonal freedoms and new economic
opportunities.

American soldiers are helping
this transition in several areas,
such as reconstruction of local vil-
lages, rehabilitation of the educa-
tional system and implementation
of modern technological advances.
Specifically, U.S. Army soldiers,
relying on their Army training
and civilian careers, are well posi-
tioned to help lead this effort,
based on their previous mission
experience in Bosnia/Kosovo as a
part of Task Force Falcon and in
Panama as a part of Operation
Just Cause. 

Soldiers, primarily from the
Army Reserve, are helping Iraqi
citizens transition to a free-mar-
ket economy in which business
opportunity and entrepreneurship
thrive. In the post-Saddam era,
there are numerous business op-
portunities for Iraqi citizens,
including reconstruction projects,
foreign investments and subcon-
tracting opportunities. Currently,
the majority of opportunities lie
with the United States Army, the
Coalition Provisional Authority
(CPA) and state-owned ministries
and enterprises. 

To aid this effort, Army Reserve
soldiers are using their unique
background, of both Army train-
ing and civilian careers, to work
with local Iraqi citizens to help
develop working business rela-
tionships and succeed in this post-
Saddam era. Army Reserve Civil
Affairs soldiers, who serve as both
warriors and diplomats, are a key
factor in this economic transition,

interacting with local civilians
and building lasting relationships
with Iraqis. 

One such soldier is Army
Reserve Sgt. Glenn Corliss, a
member of the 353rd Civil Affairs
Brigade, who left his job as a pri-
vate equity analyst on Wall Street
after September 11th to join the
Army to help the economic devel-
opment of Iraq. During his 15-
month deployment, Corliss worked
as an economic advisor to the Iraq
Ministry of Industry and Minerals
(MIM), where he supported the
reorganization of the Oil-for-Food
program and coordinated long-
term private sector investments
for MIM businesses. Despite
inherent obstacles in the transi-
tion to a free-market economy,
Corliss believes that significant
progress is being made that will
help Iraq establish itself as an eco-
nomic power in the region.

“Rebuilding the Iraqi economy
after 30 years of dictatorship is a
long, difficult process,” he says.
“But we’re making great strides
and moving in the right direction.”

In addition to his work at the

MIM, Corliss served as an advisor
at the Iraqi Business Centers
(IBC) in Baghdad, which is a net-
work of business centers through-
out Iraq designed to help build
alliances between Iraqi companies
and international investments.
These business centers, located in
major Iraqi economic hubs of
Baghdad, Kirkuk, Basrah and
Nineveh, assist Iraqi citizens
interested in exploring private-
sector trade and teach them how
to market themselves to potential
business partners while also pro-
viding a database of qualified
Iraqi companies seeking subcon-
tracting work for reconstruction
jobs. These business centers are a
key element in the foundation of
Iraq’s future success in the inter-
national business community. 

At the Baghdad Business Cen-
ter, Corliss served as an economic
advisor for the rehabilitation of
Iraq’s educational system, work-
ing specifically on a needs assess-
ment plan for Iraqi universities
with a resulting $2 million in
materials raised to help repair
and modernize Iraqi schools. Addi-
tionally, while at the Baghdad
Business Center, Corliss devel-
oped and launched an entrepre-
neurship training program that
will teach more than 5,000 Iraqi
citizens how to start their own
businesses, further continuing the
advance of the free-market econ-
omy in Iraq. 

“We’ve had some wonderful
successes, rebuilding educational
initiatives and both small and
large businesses,” continued
Corliss. “Iraqis are really starting
to embrace their freedom and are
realizing the enormous opportuni-
ties of a free economy.”

For more information on the
U.S. Army, go to GoArmy.com.

Army Plays Key Role In Developing Iraqi Free Market Economy
Iraqi Business Center Prepares Iraqi Citizens To Take Advantage Of Economic Opportunities

The U.S. Army is playing a vital
role in the Iraqi transition to a
free-market economy.
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(NAPSA)—There’s good news
for recent college grads who are
still  looking for a foothold in the
job market. Those with money
worries may find that consolidat-
ing their federal student loans into
one fixed-rate loan can be a rela-
tively easy way to increase their
“cash in hand.” Consolidation may
reduce student loan monthly pay-
ments by up to 60 percent.

A federal consolidation loan is
part of the family of loans avail-
able under the Federal Family
Education Loan Program (FFELP)
as authorized by the federal gov-
ernment. A consolidation loan
allows recent college graduates to
consolidate all or some of their
outstanding education loans into a
single new loan, even if their loans
are held by more than one lender
and are of different loan types. 

Consider the following: A col-
lege graduate with $20,000 in fed-
eral student loan debt and an
interest rate of 8.25 percent would
have a monthly payment of $245.
By combining the loans into a
2.875 percent fixed-rate consolida-
tion loan, the monthly payment
would drop to $192. 

Some plans offer even more
savings. For example, with a loan
from a company called Student
Loan Xpress, that number can
drop even lower, as borrower ben-
efit programs will reduce a new
graduate’s interest rate to as low
as 1.625 percent—the lowest rate
in the history of the federal con-
solidation program.

Borrowers who have been out
of school longer than six months
can also benefit from historically
low rates—as low as 2.125 percent

with a consolidation loan from
Student Loan Xpress.

While lower student loan inter-
est rates help all students, they
are an especially welcome gift for
graduates who are eligible to con-
solidate their loans. According to
the Department of Education,
about 7 million students and their
parents take out $50 billion in
federally backed loans each year.  

“Now is definitely the time to
consolidate,” said Fabrizio Balestri,
president and CEO of national stu-
dent loan provider Student Loan
Xpress, Inc., a subsidiary of Educa-
tion Lending Group, Inc. “With a
low fixed rate and repayment
options to fit any situation, a con-
solidation loan is often one of the
best financial decisions a new
graduate can make.”

For more information on con-
solidation loans, visit www.stu
dentloanxpress.com and click on
“Student Loan Consolidation,” or
call toll free: 888-290-3078.

Loan Consolidation Can Help Grads Increase Cash Flow

A consolidation loan allows recent
college graduates to consolidate
all or some of their education
loans into a single new loan.

(NAPSA)—You may soon be
seeing something new in the pro-
duce aisle: farm-grown contain-
ers— made from 100 percent
corn—used to package farm-grown
fruits and vegetables. The new,
nature-based packaging, called
NatureWorks PLA, looks and feels
just like traditional plastic—but
uses corn, an annually renewable
resource, as a raw material
instead of relying on petroleum.
The packaging is used to hold a
variety of whole and fresh-cut
fruits and vegetables such as
apples, melon and tomatoes. It’s
also being used as film bags for
pre-cut salad mixes. For more
information, visit www.natu re-
workspla.com.

A growing body of research
suggests that drinking adequate
amounts of low-fat or fat-free
milk—3 servings a day or 24
ounces in 24 hours—as part of a
reduced-calorie diet may offer an
additional boost to weight-loss
efforts. To draw attention to the
role milk can play in a weight-loss
program, the “Milk Mustache got
milk?” campaign is launching a
nationwide education initiative
that encourages people to include
24 ounces of milk as part of a
reduced-calorie diet. For more
information or to access meal
plans, visit www.eatright.org or
www.2424milk.com.

One way to add a little zip to
your salad routine is to use a wide
variety of toppings on salad
greens. You can use Mandarin

oranges, sweet and tangy Ocean
Spray® Craisins® Sweetened Dried
Cranberries and pecans to create
an exotic Mandarin Cranberry
Salad. Spice up a chicken salad by
adding curry powder and Craisins®

Sweetened Dried Cranberries. The
wonderful color and sweet, tangy
taste of Craisins® add an unex-
pected sweetness to this favorite. 

Easy-to-prepare “S ’mores
Squares” are a great way to enjoy
the new flavor of Honey Graham
Life® cereal. Spray a 9 X 9-inch
pan with cooking spray and set
aside. In a large bowl, combine 4
cups of Honey Graham Life
cereal, 2 cups of Thin Rold® Gold
Pretzel Sticks, broken in half,
and 1 cup of chocolate chips. Set
aside. Melt 1⁄4 cup butter (1⁄2 stick)
in a large saucepan. Then, add
marshmallows and cook over low
heat, stirring constantly, until
melted. Pour this sauce over the
mixture and mix until well
coated. Press cereal mixture
evenly into pan and let it cool.
When it has cooled, cut it into 16
squares and serve. Visit www.life-

***
Courage, energy and patience
are the virtues which appeal to
my heart.

—Fritz Kreisler
***

***
Industry, economy, honesty and
kindness form a quartet of
virtue that will never be
improved upon.

—James Oliver
***

***
The strength of a man’s virtue
must not be measured by his
occasional efforts, but by his
ordinary life.

—Blaise Pascal
***

***
Nature does not bestow virtue;
to be good is an art.

—Seneca
***




