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(NAPSA)—American women
spend close to 7.2 billion dollars a
year on skin-care products in an
attempt to look young and beauti-
ful. However, caring for one’s
smile, a natural youth-boosting
accessory, can take less than five
minutes a day and keep every
woman’s smile ageless. 

As women age, their smiles are
susceptible to damage caused by
their stage in life, oral care habits,
lifestyle factors and overall
health. The results can leave a
woman’s smile infiltrated with the
visible signs of aging, which may
include tooth decay, gum disease
and stains on the tooth surface. 

“Women need to balance a
healthy lifestyle and proper oral
care habits to keep their smiles
looking young and beautiful,” says
Manhattan dentist Jennifer
Salzer, D.D.S. “An ageless, radi-
ant smile can make a woman look
years younger and improve her
self-confidence.”

Dr. Salzer suggests the follow-
ing, six smile-boosting strategies
for maintaining an ageless smile: 

• Floss away food particles—
Floss before brushing to remove
plaque and loosen debris from in
between teeth. If these particles
remain on the tooth surface, it can
lead to age-related oral care prob-
lems such as gingivitis, gum dis-
eases and cavities. 

• B r u s h  f o r  t w o — Wo m e n
should brush for two minutes
twice a day, using a low-abrasion
toothpaste such as Crest Rejuve-
nating Effects. It is formulated
specifically to help keep women’s
smiles looking and feeling
younger longer with special prop-
erties that remineralize tooth
enamel, refresh breath and
restore whiteness to teeth. 

• Make an appointment to
smile—Visit the dentist twice a
year for professional cleanings
and dental screenings. Due to hor-
mone fluctuation, women who are
pregnant, take birth controls pills
or are menopausal have an
increased susceptibility to oral
care problems such as gum dis-
ease and tooth decay. 

• Drink right—Beverages con-
taining a high level of phospho-
rous can deplete the body’s level of
calcium, causing oral care prob-
lems such as tooth decay and gum
disease. Additives commonly
found in drinks such as corn syrup
and food dye can leave pearly
white teeth appearing dull and
discolored. Choose beverages such
as water and milk, which help
strengthen teeth and build
stronger enamel to create a
healthy, bright smile.

• Beauty sleep for a beautiful
smile—Eight hours of sleep allow a
woman’s body to be replenished
and renewed. According to the
National Sleep Foundation, women
are more likely than men to
experience insomnia, which may
cause a woman’s immune system
to become run-down and depleted.
The result leaves the mouth prone
to infection from oral bacteria
which can hinder the appearance
of a youthful smile.

• Put Smoking Out!—Smoking
cigarettes is one of the greatest
contributors to the aging mouth.
According to the Centers for Dis-
ease Control, over 22 million
women in the United States
smoke cigarettes. In addition to
staining teeth, smoking interrupts
calcium adsorption in the body
and can also cause diseases such
as oral cancer, which may be life-
threatening. 

Log onto www.youthfulsmile.com
to take Dr. Salzer’s “Youthful Smile
Profile” test or www.crest-re.com,
for additional oral care tips and
information. 

Strategies For Obtaining 
An Ageless Smile

A beautiful, radiant smile is
easy to achieve and can keep
women looking years younger.

(NAPSA)—In a recent survey
of child-care professionals in the
United States, 78 percent agree
that low self-esteem among pre-
adolescent and adolescent girls
leads to high-risk behavior includ-
ing drug and alcohol use, smok-
ing, risky sexual behavior, eating
disorders and dropping out of
school. More than 70 percent
agree that low self-esteem among
tweens and teens is a critical
problem in the U.S.

A new program developed by
Girl Scouts of the USA and
Unilever addresses this alarming
problem by fostering self-esteem
in girls, ages 8-to-14, across the
country and in Puerto Rico—with
a focus on girls in underprivileged
communities. uniquely ME! THE
GIRL SCOUT/UNILEVER SELF-
ESTEEM PROGRAM integrates the
latest research on self-esteem
issues from the renowned Girl
Scout Research Institute and
helps girls develop the skills nec-
essary to face life’s challenges.

Olympic gold medalist, gym-
nastics superstar and uniquely
ME! program partner, Dominique
Dawes, will help raise awareness
of self-esteem issues and will visit
girls across the country to talk
about building confidence and
appreciating one’s best attributes.

“Everyone has to deal with self-
esteem issues—even celebrities
and top athletes,” said Dominique
Dawes. “I hope that through
uniquely ME!, we can empower
girls to fulfill their dreams.”

A few of Dominique’s self-
esteem tips are to:

• Find a role model in your
own community.

Spend time with someone who
believes in you and will work with
you to set high goals.

• Celebrate you! Reward
yourself when you have accom-
plished something.

• Challenge yourself to try
new things. Try a computer

course, learn some new dance
steps, speak in front of a large
group or join an after-school activ-
ity club.

• Give back to your commu-
nity. Helping others is an excellent
way to feel great about yourself.

• Be good to your body. Re-
member to exercise, eat well and
get plenty of sleep.

T h e  c o r e  c u r r i c u l u m  o f
uniquely ME! includes three activ-
ity booklets designed for specific
age groups: 8-10, 11-12 and 13-14
years of age. The booklets are
available in English and bilingual
English/Spanish versions and will
be accessible to Girl Scout troop
leaders, adult volunteers and girls
across the country.

The booklets focus on appreci-
ating one’s best attributes, han-
dling peer pressure, healthy eat-
ing habits,  hygiene, general
wellness and other important
issues as a way to boost self-confi-
dence. Empowering activities
enable girls to build an under-
standing of what self-esteem is
and how to foster it in themselves.
Select activities will be available
on the GSUSA Web site for girls
who are not involved in Girl
Scouts. Visit www.girlscouts.org
for more information.

uniquely ME! PROGRAM
Alleviates Low Self-Esteem

Olympic champion Dominique
Dawes talks to girls about build-
ing self-esteem.

(NAPSA)—High school seniors
who have overcome adversity in
their lives now have a chance to
be rewarded for their persever-
ance. These dedicated students
can now apply online for 100
scholarships totaling $1,000,000.

The Horatio Alger National
Scholars program pays tribute to
individuals who have overcome
such adversities as critical finan-
cial need, abandonment, physical
and mental abuse, alcohol and
drug abuse within the household
and serious illness and the death
of immediate family members.
Each scholarship recipient will
receive $10,000.

Students are encouraged to visit
the Web site at www.horatio
alger.org/scholarships to learn
more about the scholarships avail-
able to them, as well as the oppor-
tunities available in our country’s
free enterprise system. The appli-
cation process is straightforward
and takes less than 45 minutes to
complete. The application requires
biographical information, academic
information, community service
activities and an essay describing
the adversities the student has
faced in his/her life. Applications
must be completed by October 15,
2002.

Integrity, perseverance and ini-
tiative in overcoming adversity
are foremost among the qualifica-
tions used to select the students
who will receive the scholarships.
Other criteria include critical
financial need, community and
public service and academic
achievement. Students must also
be residents of, and attend high
schools within the United States.

Scholarships may be used to
attend any college or university in
the United States. Students
selected to be Horatio Alger Na-
tional Scholars will be notified of
their selection by December 31,
2002.

The Horatio Alger National
Scholars program is made possible
through the generosity of the
members of the Horatio Alger
Association Inc., an organization
comprised of Americans who have
overcome adversity and humble
beginnings to achieve professional
and personal success. The Horatio
Alger Association is a nonprofit
educational association providing
more than $4 million in college
scholarships annually.

For more information about the
organization and its scholarship
programs, visit the Web site at
www.horatioalger.org.

Apply Now For $1,000,000 In College Scholarships

Turning Young Voters On
To Off-Year Elections
(NAPSA)—A national coalition

of over 90 organizations, the
Youth Vote Coalition, is working
to increase political participation
among young people.

This nonpartisan group lists
such national organizations on its
board as ACORN, League of
Women Voters, The Leadership
Institute, Youth Service America
and National Council of La Raza.

Youth Vote Coalition, has
worked with 1,500 community
and state member organizations
to increase voter turnout rates
and community engagement
among 18 to 29 year olds. 

One of its primary goals in
2002 is to take the grassroots
efforts to scale and to reach one
million young voters. Historically,
young citizens vote at lower rates
than older citizens in what are
known as off-year elections, when
there is no presidential race.

The 2002 campaign will be
working in 12 sites: Little Rock
and Pine Bluff, Arkansas; Oak-
land, California; Denver, Color-
ado; Miami, Florida; Des Moines
and Ames, Iowa; Ann Arbor,
Michigan; St. Paul/Minneapolis,
Minnesota; Kansas City and St.
Louis, Missouri; Durham/Raleigh/
Chapel Hill, North Carolina; Port-
land, Oregon and Houston, Texas.

Local Youth Vote Coalitions
will conduct voter registration
efforts, conduct forums in each
location where candidates can
meet young voters and conduct
grassroots door-to-door and phone
canvassing to encourage every
young person in their site to vote.

To learn more, visit their Web
site at www.youthvote.org.

Fossils of palm trees have been found as far north as Greenland.

***
The great secret of power is never to will to do more than you can
accomplish.

—Henrik Ibsen
***

***
There three things I always for-
get. Names, faces—the third I
can’t remember.

—Italo Svevo
***

***
To read without reflecting is
like eating without digesting.

—Edmund Burke
***
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