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(NAPSA)—The 2006 hurricane
season is expected to be an active
one. The National Oceanic and
Atmospheric Association (NOAA)
predicts 13 to 16 storms including
up to six major hurricanes.
Accuweather has a similar out-
look, predicting one in six Ameri-
cans could be directly impacted.
President Bush and the NOAA are
warning people to be prepared fol-
lowing last year ’s devastating
hurricanes. 

During a recent news confer-
ence at the NOAA National Hurri-
cane Center, Deputy Secretary of
Commerce David A. Sampson said,
“The impact from these storms
extends well beyond coastal areas
so it is vital that residents in hur-
ricane-prone areas get ready in
advance of the hurricane season.”

Three Days Of Supplies
The Federal Emergency Man-

agement Agency (FEMA) says
families should have a response
plan and an emergency prepared-
ness kit. The Red Cross says a kit
should include enough supplies
for each family member for three
days and it should be checked
every six months. Emergency pre-
paredness kits should include
water, food, first aid and medical
supplies, clothing, blankets, tools,
sanitation items and important
documents.

Power outages are a real threat
during severe storms, so backup
power is also an important ele-
ment of an emergency prepared-
ness kit. Gas generators are a
common choice, but they have
some drawbacks. First, they need
fuel, which can often be in short
supply during emergency situa-
tions. They are also noisy and pro-
duce dangerous fumes, so they
can’t be used indoors. 

Backup Power Is Important
Another option for backup

power without these drawbacks is
a high-powered battery pack that
can provide portable electricity in
an emergency. These are available
at major retailers and one popular
brand is XPower by Xantrex.
XPower offers products that range
in power levels depending on your
needs. XPower products can also
jump-start vehicles, inflate tires
and include flashlights or built-in
radios. These products are clean,
efficient, quiet and fumeless, so
they are perfect for use inside the
home, where generators are not
safe. 

Having power during an emer-
gency enables people to contact
emergency services, keep in touch
with family, and stay informed
through news and weather up-
dates. Backup power can also pro-
vide light, heat or air-conditioning,
keep food and medicine refriger-
ated, and can even power a sump
pump to help keep the house dry.

With the high potential for hur-
ricanes striking the U.S. this year,
it’s time to be prepared. Look for
backup power products, such as
the new XPower PowerSource
400, at your local Best Buy or
select Staples stores. 

Prepared for the 2006 Storm Season?

POWER OUTAGES are a real threat
during severe storms, so backup
power is an important element of
an emergency preparedness kit.

Fishermen: Watch Your Step
(NAPSA)—Good fishing may be

about more than just what’s in your
tackle box—it could be about what’s
in your shoe box, too. The right
shoes can keep fishermen dry, help
them grab traction against big
catches and keep them comfortable. 

These tips for choosing fishing
shoes come from Sperry Top-Sider,
the company that invented the
boat shoe in 1935:

1. Water compatibility—Look
for quick-drying materials, remov-
able footbeds, drainage systems and
anti-microbial treatments.

2. Traction—Look for wave-
siped, nonmarking rubber outsoles
to provide superior traction on both
wet and dry surfaces. 

3. Stability—Look for extra
lateral support, wide outsole sur-
face areas and adjustable closure
systems to ensure extra stability.

4. Shock Absorption—Look for
shock-absorbing midsoles to cush-
ion impact.

For more information and a
complete selection of f ishing
shoes—from the  h igh- tech
Fathom Fisherman shoe and
Hydrofoil sandal to the luxuri-
ous Gold Cup Collection—visit
www.sperrytopsider.com.

Fishing shoes provide traction to
help anglers reel in the big fish.

(NAPSA)—There’s good news
for people at risk for limb amputa-
tion due to complications from
diabetes: A new laser procedure
has been shown to be highly suc-
cessful in “salvaging” limbs, thus
providing a new alternative in the
fight against amputation. 

More than 1 million people in
the U.S. suffer from critical limb
ischemia (CLI), the most severe
form of peripheral arterial disease
(PAD)—a common condition in
people with diabetes. CLI is the
progressive accumulation of
plaque and thrombus in the arter-
ies of the leg, resulting in obstruc-
tion of blood flow. Left untreated,
the condition can lead to pain, foot
ulcers and limb loss. An estimated
160,000 amputations are per-
formed in the U.S. each year,
directly stemming from CLI—and
many of them are preventable. 

CLiRpath (Cool Laser Revascu-
larization for Peripheral Artery
Therapy) uses a “cool” excimer
laser to treat arterial blockages
common in CLI.  The laser
catheter is fed down patients’ leg
arteries to the blockage that is
causing their wounds and pain.
CLiRpath vaporizes the blockage,
allowing blood flow to resume,
which may increase the chances
that wounds can heal, limbs can
be saved and patients’ psychologi-
cal and physical well-being can be
improved. 

“CLiRpath is less intrusive and
requires less recovery time than
bypass surgery, and may provide
CLI patients an alternative to
amputation. While CLiRpath is
not a cure for CLI, the therapy
provides a minimally invasive
treatment option for a potentially
deadly condition,” said Dr. Craig

Walker, an interventional cardiol-
ogist with the Cardiovascular
Institute of the South, and a pio-
neer in developing and perform-
ing this advanced treatment.

CLiRpath, developed by Spec-
tranetics Corp., is a critical break-
through in helping prevent ampu-
tation. The procedure resulted in
a 95 percent limb salvage rate for
patients surviving to six months
in a clinical trial, the LACI CTRO
Registry.

Other Options
Conventional nonlaser treat-

ments for blocked arteries in-
clude angioplasty, bypass surgery
and medication. Angioplasty on
its own is sometimes inadequate
as a stand-alone treatment. In
those cases, several techniques
might be utilized, including ex-
cimer laser and rotational
atherectomy. Your physician will
make decisions on which is most
appropriate. 

To learn more about CLiRpath,
call (800) 231-0978 or visit
www.spectranetics.com.

New Treatment For Blocked Arteries 
May Save Limbs

CLiRpath the “cool” laser—
vaporizing a blockage in the leg
artery.

(NAPSA)—Catfish is on a roll.
A Southern-style po’ boy stuffed
with crispy-coated U.S. farm-
raised catfish and all the trim-
mings can be ready in less than
10 minutes. For recipes, visit
www.catfishinstitute.com. 

**  **  **
Tampa is the perfect fit for the

family that wants action-packed
adventure on a shoestring budget.
To offset the off-putting gas
prices, visitors to the Tampa Bay
area, for example, can save money
with a 3-Way Getaway Pass,
which offers families low admis-
sions to popular attractions, such
as the Museum of Science &
Industry (MOSI), Lowry Park Zoo
and the Florida Aquarium. To
learn more about what to see,
visit www.VisitTampaBay.com.

**  **  **
If you know a Southern hero,

you can share his or her story by
taking a moment to visit www.
southernheroes.com and submit-
ting the short online entry form
between August 1 and August 31,
2006. Entry forms can also be
found at any SouthernLINC Wire-
less retail location. To learn more,
visit www.southernlinc.com.

**  **  **
Boat owners say high gas

prices won’t sink their plans this
summer. However, according to a
new survey, higher prices will
have them easing off the throttle
more often. The survey also indi-
cated that one in five power boat
owners and one in three bass boat
owners do not have insurance on
their boat. To learn more, visit

www.nationwide.com.
**  **  **

As part of its summer barbe-
cue celebration, the ALPO Hot
Air Balloon is traveling across
the country and helping dogs
waiting for their forever homes.
For every mile the balloon trav-
els, the ALPO Brand is donating
one can of food for a total of
16,000 cans; shelters along the
way will share in this mouthwa-
tering donation. For more infor-
mation, visit www.alpo.com.

**  **  **
The Microsoft Phishing Filter

alerts people to and blocks known
or suspected phishing sites.
Already available for no charge in
the Windows Live Toolbar and as
an MSN Search Toolbar Add-in,
the filter is also included in Inter-
net Explorer 7 and Windows Vista.
For more tools and tips: http://
www.microsoft.com/athome/secu
r i t y / e m a i l / p h i s h i n g . m s p x ;
http: / /www.microsoft .com/at
home/security/online/phishing_fil
ter.mspx; http://safety.msn.com/
phishing and http://www.stay
safe.org/toolbox/scams/default.
html.

(NAPSA)—You can conquer
pain. When the strains of physical
activity or disease start to affect
your joints, there are some effec-
tive ways you can fight back,
without the sometimes serious
side effects of many drugs. 

• One of the latest therapies
being used by health professionals
is a natural compound composed
of special fatty acids, available in
supplement form. In clinical stud-
ies conducted at the University of
Connecticut and published in the
Journal of Rheumatology, the
compound, called Celadrin, was
shown to alleviate pain and
increase range of motion, with no
reported side effects. 

Actor Dick Van Patten, an avid
tennis player, was temporarily
sidelined with severe shoulder
pain. Facing painful cortizone
shots or surgery, he tried a cream
containing the compound. 

“In a couple of days, the pain
started to subside, and soon I was
back to playing the game I love.”

Research has shown that the
special fatty acids in Celadrin
inhibit inflammation in endothelial
cells that line the inside of various
body cavities, and decrease the
pro-inflammatory effects of arachi-
donic and other fatty acids. In
addition, they may help to lubri-
cate an affected joint, resulting in
pain relief and increased mobility. 

Here are some additional
things you can do to help fight
joint and muscle pain naturally: 

• Touch can be comforting, par-

ticularly from a partner or a pet. 
• Maintain your ideal body

weight and exercise regularly. 
However, not just any type of

exercise will do. Exercise pro-
grams should be individualized,
because people have different
needs. 

• Applying heat to the affected
area can help relax muscles and
joints and thus prevent painful
spasms. Use a heating pad for 20
to 30 minutes at a time—going
longer can lead to burns. 

• Counterintuitively, cold can
have the same effect as heat. In
addition, the numbing properties
of an ice pack—wrapped in some-
thing; never apply ice directly to
the skin—can dull the pain, mak-
ing it easier to go about your day. 

For additional information on
battling joint and muscle pain
without drugs, visit celadrin.com.

Fight Back Against Joint And Muscle Pain

Actor Dick Van Patten conquered
his shoulder pain without drugs
or surgery.  

***
What is important is to keep
learning, to enjoy challenge, and
to tolerate ambiguity. In the end
there are no certain answers.

—Martina Horner
***

***
Whenever you are asked if you
can do a job, tell ’em, “Certainly
I can!” Then get busy and find
out how to do it.

—Theodore Roosevelt
***

***
If we value the pursuit of knowl-
edge, we must be free to follow
wherever that search may lead
us. The free mind is not a bark-
ing dog, to be tethered on a 10-
foot chain.

—Adlai E. Stevenson Jr.
***




