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(NAPSA)—When it comes to a
healthy living, specialization is
one of the latest trends. A growing
number of consumers are turning
to specific supplements to enhance
particular aspects of their health
and well-being.
For example, when it comes to

a diet that fights the aging pro -
cess, some say that vitamin D is a
nutrient essential to the preven-
tion of osteoporosis. Others look to
daily doses of vitamin E as a way
to reduce the risk of heart disease. 
Fruits and vegetables rich in

antioxidants—such as blueberries,
blackberries, red beans, artichokes
and russet potatoes—are said to
stimulate the immune system and
protect the nervous system and
brain from the oxidative damage
some associate with aging.
This trend toward specialization

is evident in a new line of juices—
called Drenchers—that contain
supplements that are designed to
deliver specific benefits:
For example, the beverage

called Endurance is said to fight
fatigue and enhance energy. Made
with a grape-apple flavor, it’s for-
tified with 20-plus essential vita-
mins, nutrients, amino acids, elec-
trolytes and herbs.
The juice called Power (Orange

Crème) is designed to fuel and
repair muscles. It’s also fortified
with essential vitamins, nutrients,
amino acids, electrolytes and
herbs and contains 20 g of protein
per 8-oz. serving.
Restore contains apple, kiwi

and mango juices to boost the
immune system and is said to pro-
mote longevity by restoring the
balance of essential nutritional
elements in the body. It’s also
charged with electrolytes and for-

tified with 25-plus essential vita-
mins, nutrients, amino acids, elec-
trolytes and herbs.
Berry-flavored Immunity was

created to assist those who are
looking for ways to boost their
immune system. It is fortified with
25-plus customized and essential
vitamins, nutrients, amino acids,
electrolytes and herbs.
Heart Healthy features a Trop-

ical Passion flavor and contains
over 15 customized and essential
vitamins and nutrients thought to
promote heart health and fight
stress and fatigue. It also contains
amino acids, electrolytes and
herbs.
Said Chris New, founder, chair-

man and CEO of NBI Juiceworks,
producers and distributors of
Drenchers and Sun Shower brand
products, “We have developed five
great flavors and each one has a
name that clearly identifies the
major consumer benefit to be
enjoyed.”
Each juice also contains the

combination of vitamins and
nutrients that the company calls
Bodyguard.
To learn more, visit www.nbi

juiceworks.com.

A Specialized Approach To A Healthy Lifestyle

Consumers are turning to spe-
cific supplements to enhance
particular aspects of their health
and well-being.

(NAPSA)—Most home builders
will tell you that the foundation of
a house helps determine the qual-
ity of a home. But did you know
the same can be said for a home or
deck’s outside paint or finish?
The fact is, proper prepping is

a vital first step in painting or
staining the exterior of your home
or in refinishing a deck. And if
you’re wondering if prep work
pays off, consider this: Many
homeowners skip the prep work
when refinishing their wood sur-
faces, assuming it is too tedious,
difficult and time-consuming, but
don’t realize this compromises the
quality of the finish and creates
more work down the road. A num-
ber of new premium wood prep
products allow homeowners to
prep with ease and efficiency,
helping them achieve a beautiful,
long-lasting finish.
Here’s a closer look at proper

wood-surface preparation:
Strip It

If you need to clean and strip
an exterior wood surface, try a
product like Behr Premium Stain
& Finish Stripper. Ideal for decks,
siding, fences, shakes and shin-
gles, it has been upgraded to
remove all coatings, including 100
percent acrylic stains and finishes
on both horizontal and vertical
surfaces. Don’t forget to wear pro-
tective clothing, goggles and acid-
resistant gloves while working
with a stain and finish stripper.

Clean Up
Next, you need to clean the

surface you plan to paint or stain.

Behr Premium Mildew Stain
Remover is an enzyme-based,
bleach-free interior/exterior
cleaner that’s designed for wood
and composite decking as well as
brick, stucco and vinyl/aluminum
siding. It removes severe stains
caused by mold, mildew, algae and
fungus without whitening or dam-
aging wood.
If you’re looking to brighten

and clean wood, you might try
Behr Premium 2- IN-1  Wood
Prep. It’s an exterior cleaner
formulated to clean, brighten
and condition exterior wood sur-
faces prior to applying wood-
toned finishes, paints or stains.
It also removes light-to-medium
mildew stains, rust and red clay
stains.

Finishing Tips
Of course,  after  the prep

work comes the finish. Try these

tips for getting the type of finish
you’re looking for:
• You’ll need rubber gloves,

plastic drop cloths (to protect flow-
ers and vegetation), goggles, a
broom and garden hose with a
spray nozzle for cleanup. Also, use
a 3⁄8-inch-nap paint roller or stain
pad with an arm extension and
nylon/polyester paint brush.
• Pour stain or finish into a

lined paint tray and apply to a
small area at a time with a lamb’s
wool pad, roller or brush, being
certain to maintain a wet edge on
the surface.
• Always remove excess product

and evenly distribute the finish by
back-brushing on the surface dur-
ing all application methods.
• Apply the product end-to-end

or to entire board lengths to pre-
vent lap marks from being left on
the finished surface. This happens
when the first coat’s edge dries
before the edge of the subsequent
one and could result in an uneven
film thickness. 
• If possible, coat wood on all

sides for optimum performance
and always follow manufacturers’
label instructions.
As a final tip, remember that

it’s important to maintain exterior
surfaces throughout the year.
Clean them as needed and keep
them free of debris—that way you
can maximize the durability and
beauty of your wood.
For more information, visit

www.behr.com. Behr products are
available exclusively at The Home
Depot.

Prep School: A Guide For Do-It-Yourselfers

The right products can make it
simple to prep a surface before
you put on the perfect finish.

(NAPSA)—The nerve-rattling
volatility in the stock market and
fears of a recession have made
many Americans uncertain about
the state of the U.S. economy.
What is certain is that economic
changes raise questions and pose
complex personal finance choices
for individuals. That is why it is
now a better idea than ever to
consult with Certified Financial
Planner™ professionals for objec-
tive advice during these uncertain
times.

Keep Focused On
Long-Term Goals

“The Internet has made it
incredibly easy for people to see
short-term fluctuations in their
investments,” said David G.
Strege, CFP® of Des Moines, Iowa.
“At times when there are broader
concerns about the economy, it’s
easy for short-term changes to
seem bigger than they may be. It’s
important to keep focused on long-
term goals to put those daily fluc-
tuations in perspective.
“Actions you take with your

finances should be based on your
personal goals—not what seems
good at the moment or what your
neighbor or co-worker suggests,”
he said. “Having a financial plan
allows you to take charge of your
financial choices and avoid reac-
tions that may be shortsighted.” 
“No one approach will fit every

situation,” said Marilyn Capelli
Dimitroff, CFP® of Bloomfield
Hills, Mich. “Financial goals vary,

based on factors such as a person’s
age or tolerance for risk. But
that’s just scratching the surface.
Financial planners who hold the
CFP® certification have the train-
ing and experience to help people
make financial decisions based on
their personal life goals, taking
into account all aspects of their
financial situation.” 

Questions To Ask
With more than 58,000 finan-

cial planners across the U.S. who
have met CFP Board’s rigorous
education, examination, experi-
ence and ethics requirements and
attained CFP® certification, it’s
easy to find a financial-planning
professional who can help estab-
lish objective and attainable
financial goals. Consumers can
find local CFP® professionals
through CFP Board’s Web site at
www.CFP.net/search. 
So how do you go about choos-

ing a financial planner? Here are
some questions you might ask:

What are your qualifica-
tions and history? Ask about
credentials and licenses and
whether the planner has ever
been publicly disciplined for
unlawful or unethical conduct.

What’s your approach to

financial planning? Some plan-
ners develop a plan that brings
together all of your financial goals.
Others provide advice on specific
areas. Some may have attorneys,
insurance agents or tax specialists
assist in developing your plan. 

How are you compensated?
Ask for a written description of
services and associated fees,
whether commissions, flat fees,
percentage of assets or whether
the planner receives a salary.
It’s important to select a CFP®

professional with whom you feel
comfortable, one whose business
style suits your financial-planning
needs. CFP Board has developed
a Financial Planning Resource
Kit that includes tips for finding
a financial planner who meets
your needs, including an inter-
view questionnaire and checklist.
To order a free kit, visit
www.CFP.net/request. 
“It can be scary to encounter

words like ‘recession’ all over the
news. Having a financial planner
to turn to can help people get
beyond the emotions and take an
objective look at how current
events may affect their situation,”
said CFP® practitioner Dan Can-
dura of Braintree, Mass. “When
you feel secure that you have a
good plan and a trusted profes-
sional to turn to for a big-picture
view of your financial situation,
you can take your thoughts away
from your finances and put your
focus back on living your life.”

A Sound Financial Plan Will Help You Through A Turbulent Economy

“Having a financial planner to
turn to can help people get

beyond the emotions and take
an objective look at how current

events may affect their
situation.”

(NAPSA)—With soaring food
prices, global grain shortages and
increasing demand for biofuels,
the need for crops capable of pro-
ducing more is becoming increas-
ingly important. Thanks to ad -
vances in crop breeding and
biotechnology, yield thresholds in
various crops are rising, helping
farmers keep up with the growing
demand for feed, food and fuel. 
One such crop is a new genera-

tion of soybeans that has been
proven in research studies to sig-
nificantly raise yield. Called
Roundup Ready 2 Yield, this latest
breakthrough in soybean technol-
ogy is expected to increase yield by
7 to 11 percent over the first-gener-
ation Roundup Ready soybeans,
which are currently planted on 96
percent of U.S. soybean acres.
Mature soybean plants typically

have either two-bean or three-bean
pods, explained soybean expert
Dion McBay. The new soybeans
take those pods to a new level. “We
have observed significantly more
three-bean pods per plant with
Roundup Ready 2 Yield compared
with the first generation of
Roundup Ready soybeans,” said
McBay. “That ‘power in the pod’
means more beans per plant,
which equates to more for food and
fuel as well as more profit poten-
tial for the farmers who grow it.” 

The Science Behind
The Soybean

This soybean was developed
through extensive gene mapping
that allows the scientists at Mon-
santo—the company that developed
the beans—to identify specific DNA
regions in soybeans that are known
as “yield positive.” Using advanced
insertion and selection technolo-
gies, they are able to situate the
gene in one of these DNA regions,
resulting in higher yield potential.
“Roundup Ready 2 Yield soy-

beans are among the higher-yield-
ing crop technologies coming
through the Monsanto research
pipeline that will help address the
rising demand for food and fuel,”
added McBay.

New Soybean Technology to Help Meet 
Growing Demand for Food and Fuel

A new generation of soybeans
helps farmers do more with less.




