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(NAPSA)—Every year, home-
owners spend an average of nearly
$4,000 on new décor for their
homes. From elaborate whole-
room furniture ensembles to sim-
ple decorative accents, these
important details make a big
impact on the overall look and feel
of a room. In fact, most American
homeowners believe décor is what
makes a house a home.

Unfortunately, keeping up with
new trends and style directions on
a yearly basis can be a costly ven-
ture. That’s why, before you throw
out things that were trendy yes-
terday, you should see if they can
be quickly updated for tomorrow.

Personalization is another rea-
son to revamp existing pieces
before buying new. There are
many great home products avail-
able today in different styles, col-
ors and materials. Updating an
item is a good way to make it
more unique; a true personal
design statement that sets you
and your piece apart from your
neighbors’.

Here are some quick and easy
projects that can be accomplished
in a matter of hours and a few
coats of paint:

• Oversized mirrors that sit on
the floor have become staples in
modern homes. Reinvent any
basic shape or style, no matter the
material, by spray painting the
frame with stripes of alternating
colors of an attention-grabbing
hue. For even more graphic ap-
peal, stencil an interesting geo-
metric pattern, a whimsical say-

ing or an inspirational quote
directly onto the mirror surface
using a specialty Frosted Glass
spray paint.

• Floating shelves are all the
rage. While these typically come
in standard colors, such as white,
dark brown and black, the trend
in 2006 is expected to be spray
painting a pair in an unexpected
texture to give weight and sub-
stance to these otherwise airy
accents. An alternate design idea
is to add character to a shelving
unit with a weathered, distressed
or crackle finish.

• Small collections of black-
and-white photography grouped
together and framed in matching
neutral-toned frames, or in all
black, are definitely “in.” For
2006, keep the timeless look but
update it by simply showcasing

the photos in frames all spray
painted the same bold color, vary-
ing the intensity from light to
dark tones. Another idea is to
spray paint each frame with an
antique finish to add even more
warmth to the photography.

• Sophis t i cated  back less
benches in different sizes, shapes
and materials are showing up
everywhere in the home—in living
rooms as extra seating, as replace-
ments for traditional chairs in din-
ing rooms and as storage at the
foot of many beds. Give these chic
furnishings a new look for 2006 by
spray painting the legs and bases
a different color and adding a per-
sonal, artistic touch with small,
hand-painted details, such as flow-
ers for a bench in the hallway, the
name of herbs for a piece in the
dining room or kitchen, and a
whimsical group of different-sized
“Z’s” in the bedroom. New Ameri-
can Accents Paint Pens from Rust-
Oleum make adding these details
fun and easy.

• Organizers of all kinds, from
bins to boards, are big on the
home front. In 2006, make these
utilitarian pieces a lot bigger.
Take a cool new approach to orga-
nization by transforming an entire
wall into a giant message and
memory board—innovative paint
technologies, such as Rust-
Oleum’s exclusive Magnetic Paint,
make this possible.

For more decorating ideas from
designers and savvy do-it-your-
selfers across the country, visit
www.paintideas.com.

Easy Ideas To Update Your Home Décor

Stencilled designs are a great
way to update a mirror.
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(NAPSA)—Someone I knew died
the other day. I didn’t get a chance
to say goodbye, but I have thanked
him for the life he led as a member
of America’s Greatest Generation. 

He came from an ordinary fam-
ily that taught traditional values
like right from wrong and respect
for others. He learned that the
measure of a man was in deeds,
not words, and that hard work
wasn’t something to fear. He also
learned to take care of his neigh-
bors, so when the world needed our
help during World War II, he and
16 million other Americans an-
swered that call to military duty.

World War II was a defining
moment for America. We saw the
end of the Great Depression and
the emergence of the United
States as a world leader, but we
also witnessed the impact of the
war on the home front, and the
tremendous resiliency of the
American public to overcome all
challenges. Women entered the
workforce in greater numbers and
in nontraditional roles. Families
had to ration sugar, coffee, gaso-
line, and other commodities we
now take for granted, and entire
communities banded together to
recycle rubber and metals. 

After the war, the only thing
this generation asked for was to be
normal again—to wear the current
styles, watch the latest movies,
and settle down and raise families.
Most of them took advantage of

the GI Bill, whose home loan pro-
gram created the suburbs, and
educational benefits produced the
leaders who guided the tremen-
dous era of growth and prosperity
our country enjoyed in the second
half of the 20th century.

America has been blessed to
have had three Greatest Genera-
tions: one founded our country,
another saved our Union, and the
most recent one helped save our
world from tyranny. 

Fewer than 3.5 million World
War II veterans remain, a number
that is expected to halve within
the next five years. I was able to
thank my friend for his service to
country before he passed; now I
urge all Americans to do likewise.
They are living national trea-
sures, and they and their genera-
tion deserve our eternal gratitude
and remembrance.

Jim Mueller, a Vietnam veteran
from O’Fallon, Mo., is the com-
mander-in-chief of the 2.4 million-
member Veterans of Foreign Wars
of the U.S. and its Auxiliaries.
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(NAPSA)—A recent College
Board report shows that the aver-
age price tag for a four-year uni-
versity or college is more than
$29,000 a year. Now through June
30, 2006, all college-bound stu-
dents are eligible to submit the
Free Application for Federal Stu-
dent Aid, also known as the
FAFSA, and get a jumpstart on
the financial aid process. Eight
million students failed to complete
the FAFSA, according to a 2004
survey by the American Council
on Education. 

Filing the FAFSA is the first
important step in the financial aid
process that makes students eligi-
ble for more than $129 billion in
grants, student loans and school-
based aid to help pay for college. 

After the FAFSA is submitted,
the government determines the
Expected Family Contribution.
This is the amount of money a
family can be expected to con-
tribute each year to higher educa-
tion costs. The school tries to meet
the difference between the total
cost of education and the family’s
Expected Family Contribution
through a financial aid award.

Nelnet spokesman Eric Solomon
recommends that every high school
senior fill out the FAFSA, regard-
less of his or her financial situation.

“Don’t miss out on receiving free
money or low-interest federal loans.
The earlier you apply for aid, the
better your chances.”

Patrick McTee, Director of
Financial Aid at the University of
Colorado Denver, has seen his fair
share of the FAFSA forms and
urges families to take their time
when completing the application.
“The FAFSA is a complicated
form, but if you prepare ahead of
time it’s much easier to complete.
Gather the required tax returns
and other documents first, and
then carefully follow the direc-
tions to ensure there are no
errors.”

Many students and parents do
not submit the FAFSA because
they haven’t received their tax
statements from the previous
year. It is suggested that families
estimate their tax information.
Nelnet also recommends that fam-
ilies file their FAFSA online at
www.fafsa.ed.gov to avoid errors
and speed up the process. 

One of the leading education
finance companies, Nelnet provides
free assistance to students complet-
ing the FAFSA. FAFSA forms and
other valuable tools, including a
tutorial video and podcast, are
available at www.nelnet.net/fafsa
or call toll-free 1-866-866-7372.

Time For College-Bound Students To Get
A Jumpstart On The Financial Aid Process

By Completing The FAFSA

(NAPSA)—Even when the tem-
perature drops, there are steps you
can take to keep your safety up
and your risk of injuries due to
cold-weather hazards down. That
can be wise, since experts say one
in three people 65 years of age and
older experience falls each year. 

To protect yourself and your
loved ones, consider these tips: 

• Shovel safely—Before you
tackle the snow, make sure you’re
in good physical health. Check
with your doctor before engaging
in such a strenuous activity. If you
are up to the challenge, pace your-
self and listen to your body. If your
back hurts, take a break. Always
lift with your legs and use a snow-
blower to lighten the load, if possi-
ble. If you must lift the snow, scoop
small amounts into the shovel and
walk to where you want to dump
it. Holding a shovelful of snow with
your arms outstretched puts too
much weight on your spine. It’s not
wise to remove deep snow all at
once. Instead, shovel an inch or
two at a time and never throw
snow over your shoulder.

• Get your muscles feeling
“cozy”—Take some time to stretch
to prepare your body, since warm
muscles work better. If possible,
wait until the afternoon before
engaging in any outdoor activity.
Many disc injuries occur in the
morning, when there is increased
fluid pressure in the disc.

• Bundle up—Light, layered,
water-repellent clothing provides
both ventilation and insulation. It
is also important to wear an appro-
priate head covering, mittens or
gloves and thick, warm socks. 

• Warm up to working out—

Exercise helps improve strength,
coordination and balance, which
can not only help prevent falls, but
in the event of an injury, can help
you bounce back faster.

• Drink your hot cocoa—Don’t
forget your calcium. This impor-
tant nutrient helps build strong
bones and prevents osteoporosis.
That can minimize the damage
from a fall and aid in recovery.

• Boots are better—Shoes with
heels and no traction make it diffi-
cult to keep your balance. Walking
on snow or ice is especially treach-
erous, so a pair of well-insulated
boots with good rubber treads is
essential. Keeping a pair of rubber
overshoes with good treads that
fit over your street shoes is also a
good safety precaution. 

• Walking in a winter wonder-
land—On ice or snow, take short
steps and stroll at a slower pace so
you can react quickly to a change
in traction. Hold onto a railing or

firmly grip the arm of a friend. 
• Outsmart the cold—Pay at-

tention to your surroundings. Most
falls occur out of carelessness. Do
not go sledding at night when
potential hazards can be hidden.

• Salt those sidewalks—Many
people slip and fall on outdoor
steps and walkways. Make sure
your neighborhood streets are fre-
quently plowed and salted to pre-
vent other accidents.

• Fun in the snow—When en-
gaging in sporting activities, use
protective equipment and make
certain your skis, skates, shoes
and other gear fit you correctly.
Helmets are a must for skiing,
sledding and snowboarding. If you
will be competing, make sure you
condition in the off-season. If
you’re trying a new sport for the
first time, get proper instruction
from an expert. 

The North American Spine
Society (NASS) president Joel
Press, MD, says, “Just because it’s
winter does not mean you have to
stay inside all day in order to
avoid the elements and the risk of
falling or slipping. It’s a great sea-
son to be active and enjoy the out-
doors. Just make sure you dress
appropriately, warm up your mus-
cles and follow these helpful tips
to prevent potential hazards to
keep your spine safe and sound.”

NASS is the nation’s leading
nonprofit, multidisciplinary med-
ical society dedicated to advancing
spine care. Individuals interested
in locating a spine care professional
or improving their spine health can
access helpful information at
www.spine.org or by calling (877)
SPINE DR.

Ten Tips To Help You Stay Safe 




