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(NAPSA)—It’s not unusual to
find mold and mildew in bath-
rooms, basements, laundry rooms
or kitchens. Unsightly and often
difficult to control, mold and
mildew grow best in warm, humid
areas of your home. 

Cleaning may remove it—but
the trick to controlling mold and
mildew is to prevent them before
they start! Follow these easy mold
and mildew solutions from
Zinsser.

Control Moisture: Keep air-
flow constant in high-humidity
areas by installing exhaust fans.
Remove excess moisture with a
dehumidifier and consider replac-
ing solid doors with louvered
doors to improve ventilation.
Eliminate stagnant water by wip-
ing down shower walls after each
use and cleaning spills from leaks,
wet raincoats and laundry imme-
diately. By improving airflow and
eliminating moisture, you’ll create
a dry environment that discour-
ages the growth of mold and
mildew.  

Clean: Remove the mold and
mildew with a cleaner specifically
formulated to remove mold and
mildew stains, like JOMAX® Mold
& Mildew Stain Remover. The
fast-acting bleach formula cleans
and removes mold and mildew
stains from walls, ceilings and
other surfaces prior to painting.    

Prevent: After removing the
mold and mildew, prevent them
from coming back with two coats
of PERMA-WHITE® Mold &
Mildew-Proof ™ Interior Paint. It’s
the only paint guaranteed to pre-
vent the growth of mold and
mildew for five years and is
backed by a lifetime durability
guarantee! 

PERMA-WHITE beautifies as
it protects. Available in three pop-
ular sheens, the beautiful white

finish can be tinted to any off-
white, pastel or medium-tone
color to match any décor. And it is
durable and stain and moisture
resistant to keep your paint job
clean and fresh looking longer.
Low odor and easy to use, it’s
great for painting bathrooms,
basements, laundry rooms, kit-
chens—any high-humidity area
where the growth of mold and
mildew is a concern!

Maintain your mold- and
mildew-free home: Surfaces not
painted with PERMA-WHITE
may still develop the occasional
mold and mildew spot or two. Use
a cleaner such as JOMAX Mold &
Mildew Stain Remover around
sinks, bath and shower stalls
during your weekly household
cleaning routine. It is an easy,
effective way to clean, remove
and prevent mold and mildew
stains and soap scum buildup on
tile, fiberglass, grout, vinyl, plas-
tic and more.

For more helpful mold and
mildew solutions, call Zinsser at
732-469-8100. Or visit www.zins
ser.com. 

Mold And Mildew Solutions

Keep your home looking beauti-
ful by preventing mold and
mildew before they start.

(NAPSA)—Real estate consul-
tant Robert Hanley, 71, had just
returned from a week’s vacation
in Florida when some bumps on
his back began to itch. He thought
it was just some bug bites from
sitting alongside the pool. But his
wife urged him to see the doctor.
Much to his surprise, Hanley was
diagnosed with shingles, a fre-
quently painful disease that is
marked by a blistering rash on
one side of the body or face. Shin-
gles is caused by the reactivation
of the virus that caused chicken-
pox and can affect anyone at any-
time without warning.

It is estimated that 1 million
cases of shingles are diagnosed in
the United States each year, 40 to
50 percent of which occur in peo-
ple 60 and older. 

Hanley recalls that when he
heard the word shingles, he had
no idea of what to expect. While
for most people the pain associ-
ated with the shingles rash
lessens as it heals, some people
develop long-term nerve pain
called postherpetic neuralgia
(PHN), which can last for months
or even years. Hanley suffered
long-term nerve pain that lasted
for nearly a year. 

Lack of awareness about shin-
gles is not uncommon. A national
survey of 1,064 older people in the
United States who reported not
having had shingles found that 15
percent had not heard of a med-
ical condition called shingles.
Approximately three-quarters of
the 1,064 respondents admitted
that they knew only some (24 per-
cent), a little (27 percent) or
almost nothing/not sure (26 per-
cent) about the disease. Only 8
percent of the respondents said
they knew a lot about shingles.

More than 90 percent of adults
in the United States have had
chickenpox, placing them at risk
for shingles, and the frequency
and severity of shingles increase
with age. 

The survey was released by the
American Pain Foundation (APF),
which is leading a national health
education program, Spotlight on
Shingles: Know what you can do,
to educate older people in the
United States and their friends
and family about shingles and its
potential complications. Support
for the program was provided by
Merck & Co., Inc.

“Our message is simple: If you
are an older American and have
had chickenpox, talk to your doctor
or healthcare professional about
your risk for shingles,” said APF
Executive Director William Rowe.
“The early baby boomers are reach-
ing 60 and the older people get, the
greater their risk for shingles. This
is a topic that more people should
know about and talk about.”

A free copy of the Spotlight on
Shingles: Know what you can do
disease brochure is available at
www.spotlightonshingles.com or
by calling 1-877-RISK-4-SHIN-
GLES (877-747-5474).

American Pain Foundation Shines Spotlight On Shingles

Shingles is marked by a blister-
ing rash on one side of the body
or the face. 
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Health And Wellness

(NAPSA)—By reading food
labels and making nutritious
choices for their dogs, “pet par-
ents” can help ensure that their
canine companions enjoy longer,
healthier and allergy-free lives.

A majority of dog owners feel
their pets suffer from some sort of
allergy. While such reactions can
be caused by seasonal environ-
mental factors, they are more
likely caused by food sensitivities
year-round.

Natural foods for dogs and cats,
made with human-grade ingredi-
ents, can be an allergy remedy.
Pets can avoid allergies by eating
a healthy diet made from the
same ingredients people would
eat, choosing boneless meat,
wholesome grains and fresh
fruits, vegetables and herbs, while
avoiding suspected allergy trig-
gers, such as added hormones and
steroids.

Less is more when approaching
existing allergy challenges—or
preventing them from occurring.
Wellness Simple Food Solutions is
the perfect example. It contains
only five simple, balanced ingredi-
ents selected for their nutritional
value and health benefits.

“The few ingredients that go
into the Wellness Simple Food
Solutions are less likely to cause
an allergic reaction,” said Deborah
Ellinger, President of Wellness.
“We believe that a limited-ingredi-
ent, all-natural diet is the best
approach to alleviating allergies.”

Wellness products are avail-
able only through local, indepen-
dent and specialty pet retailers.
To learn more or to find a store
near you, please visit www.wel
lnesspetfood.com.

(NAPSA)—If you want a guilt-
free way to indulge your sweet
tooth, try a healthful snack such
as DOLE Fruit Parfaits. They
offer refreshing fruit, like apples,
peaches and pineapples, layered
over a light-tasting crème and
served in take-along containers
that make for easier portion con-
trol. They provide approximately
25 percent of the RDA for vitamin
C, only have about 115 calories
and are low in fat.

**  **  **
America’s number-one fitness

expert, Denise Austin, has tai-
lored her approach to workouts
with two DVDs that target differ-
ent exercise challenges. In “Fit &
Firm Pregnancy” (Lionsgate,
$14.98), Austin delivers three
complete, energy-boosting preg-
nancy workouts that focus on
everyday strength, perfect preg-
nancy posture and reshaping
after-baby body flab. If you’d love
to wear the latest fashions but
find you have one or more annoy-
ing trouble spots that such fash-
ions underscore, check out
Austin’s “Hit The Spot Core Com-
plete” DVD (Lionsgate, $14.98). 

**  **  **
Anxiety and stress about

school are normal for a child and
usually pass within the first few
days or weeks. If your child con-
tinues to seem anxious or
stressed, it may be time to seek
help. Talk to your pediatrician
about what you can do as a par-
ent. If problems persist, consider

a referral to a trained and quali-
fied mental health professional.
For information on helping your
child cope with stress as well as
supporting his or her social and
emotional development, contact a
nearby Mental Health Association
or the National Mental Health
Association at www.nmha.org or
(800) 969-NMHA (6642).

**  **  **
Now, there’s a new drug called

CHANTIX™ (varenicline). CHANTIX
was developed to help people quit
smoking. In two studies, about 44
percent of patients who took
CHANTIX (1 mg twice a day) quit
smoking by the end of the 12
weeks of treatment. About 30 per-
cent of patients who took bupro-
prion SR (150 mg twice a day)
quit after 12 weeks. And about 18
percent who took a sugar pill quit
by the end of the same 12-week
treatment period. For full pre-
scribing information, patients and
health care providers can go to
www.CHANTIX.com or call 1-877-
CHANTIX to learn more about
CHANTIX. 

(NAPSA)—A new spin on pro-
pellers is making it easier for visi-
tors and the people who live and
work on the Outer Banks to come
and go. A fleet of double-ended
ferries with Voith Schneider Pro-
pellers is now adding a new ferry
in the Bay of Hatteras.

**  **  **
Not all water is created equal

and your child should drink only
the best. You can buy quality min-
eral or artesian waters that have
naturally occurring minerals,
such as FIJI Water (www.fijiwa
ter.com), rather than municipal
water that has been filtered and
bottled. To encourage your child
to drink more water, give him or
her a manageable serving size,
such as FIJI Water’s 11.16-oz. bot-
tles, labeled Lil’FIJI, now avail-
able in convenient 9-packs at Tar-
get stores. The new, smaller FIJI
water bottles will fit into just
about any lunch box.

**  **  **
Fresh flowers are an impor-

tant ingredient for a truly magi-
cal winter wedding. Your choice
of flowers can infuse the occasion
with warmth, rich color and sea-
sonal beauty. Even in the midst
of winter, a vast variety of flow-
ers and greens is available from
California to make your wedding
distinctive. For more information
on the magic of wedding flowers,
visit the California Cut Flower
Commission Web site at
www.ccfc.org.

**  **  **
One popular new system for

sizing bras is tailor made for each
cup size, so a D cup will have
more support in varying degrees
than a B cup. Instead of propor-
tioning cup sizes from one stan-
dard sample size, the Warner’s
TrueFit collection approaches
each cup individually, offering
bras designed for a B, C and D
cup. The invisible support system
provides full coverage. For more
information, visit www.warner
struefit.com.

**  **  **
The world’s largest organiza-

tion dedicated to educating young
people about business, economics
and entrepreneurship has
unveiled five new educational pro-
grams. Announced by JA World-
wide president and chief execu-
tive officer David S. Chernow, the
new programs are designed to
provide an expanded economic
education experience in the areas
of entrepreneurship, financial lit-
eracy and workforce readiness. To
learn more, visit www.ja.org. 

(NAPSA)—A beautifully writ-
ten debut novel that skillfully
mixes horror and the paranormal
and cuts it with an edge of sus-
pense, “The Keeper” (Harper-
Torch, $6.99), by Sarah Langan,
heralds a brilliant new voice in
commercial fiction. Langan stud-
ied with Michael Cunningham,
Nicholas Christopher, Helen
Schulman, Richard Russo and
Maureen Howard, among others,
all of whom have been instrumen-
tal in her work. Look for “The
Keeper” at bookstores.

**  **  **
With the release of Thomson

Delmar Learning’s “About Wine”
(Thomson Delmar Learning,
$54.95), chefs, hospitality profes-
sionals and consumers finally
have the guide to the wonderful
world of wine—and wine strat-
egy—they’ve long been searching
for. It offers the basic information
that will serve as a foundation for
both a successful career in wine
and increased enjoyment of it.
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