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by Tim Kang
Actor, “The Mentalist”

(NAPSA)—As a new dad, I am
more aware than ever of the dan-
gers that children face and
understand how parents would
do anything possible to keep their
children safe. That’s why I have
partnered with the National Cen-
ter for Missing & Exploited Chil-
dren (NCMEC) to share impor-
tant information about what
parents can do to keep children
safe.

An analysis of more than 4,000
attempted abductions over the
past five years found that children
were at greatest risk going to and
from school or school-related
activities. Most predators, nearly
all men, were driving a vehicle
when they tried to abduct a child
walking alone or riding a bicycle.
The most common lure was offer-
ing a ride, typically to girls be-
tween the ages of 10 and 14, or
trying to tempt them with candy
and money or ask them to help
look for a lost pet.

Here’s the good news: It
showed how children were able to
get away. Those who escaped did
something proactive instead of
being passive or polite. They
yelled, kicked, pulled away or
attracted someone’s attention. Or
they simply walked or ran away.
Children need to know that it is
okay to say no to someone who
may be acting nice to them.

Just spending a few minutes
teaching your child about safety
could mean the difference between
life and death. That is why
NCMEC’s “Take 25” national pub-
lic awareness campaign urges par-
ents to take 25 minutes to talk to
their children about safety. More
information about Take 25 can be
found at www.take25.org.

Every day, a staggering 2,000
children are reported missing. You
can prevent your child from
becoming a statistic. Teach kids to
always take a friend when biking
or walking or standing at the bus
stop—and never take shortcuts.
They should never accept a ride
from anyone or money or gifts
unless you have said it is okay.

NCMEC is a nonprofit organi-
zation that operates a toll-free 24-
hour national missing children’s
hotline (800-THE-LOST). In its 26
years, it has assisted law-enforce-
ment in the recovery of more than
161,000 children. Its CyberTipline
has fielded more than 1 million
reports of child sexual exploitation
and its Child Victim Identification
Program has analyzed more than
45 million pornography images
and videos. For more information
or to make a donation, visit
www.missingkids.com.

• Mr. Kang is a sought-after and
versatile actor in both television
and film. He can currently be seen
on the hit CBS drama “The Mental-
ist” where his character “Kimball
Cho,” the straight-arrow investiga-
tor, has emerged as a fan favorite.

What Actor Tim Kang Wants You To Know
Could Save Your Child’s Life
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Help Cheer Up A Hero
(NAPSA)—Even the greatest

heroes need to relax now and then.
For U.S. Armed Forces in Iraq and
Afghanistan, however, quality, safe
entertainment is, at best, difficult
to get. Traditional activities such
as baseball and softball games are
at a high risk because of IEDs,
snipers, mines, bombs and other
terrorist activities. Fortunately,
thanks to modern technology and
good-hearted citizens, they can get
entertaining DVDs.

Patriotic Americans can donate
new and used DVDs to be shipped
to the nation’s fighting men and
women. The DVDs will be avail-
able at all bases in Iraq and
Afghanistan for the entertain-
ment of soldiers, sailors, airmen
and Marines.

The aim of the project, known
as AMVETS Task Force DVD, is
to ultimately have hundreds of
titles in rotation at each base.

To donate, you, your agency,
club, organization or business can
send a new or good-quality used
DVD to AMVETS Task Force
DVD, 1395 E. Dublin Granville
Road #222, Columbus, OH 43229,
or call (877) 726-8387, ext. 4031.

Entertainment, for an hour or two
provided by a DVD, is frequently
the only diversion American
troops overseas can look forward
to for weeks at a time.

(NAPSA)—The face of hunger
in America may be aging. Of the
51 million Americans who face the
threat of hunger, nearly 6 million
are older than age 60, according to
AARP—and that number is only
expected to grow in the coming
years.

In fact, from 2006 to 2008 the
percentage of older Americans
struggling with hunger more than
doubled. Fortunately, there are
actions that can be taken to help
combat the problem.

Here are a few ways you can
help:

• Donate to your local food
bank

• Organize a food drive
• Volunteer with a local food

organization
• Take an older friend to din-

ner or to the grocery store
• Donate by using your AARP®

Visa® Card from Chase
In 2011 and 2012, Chase will

donate $0.03 for every purchase
made with the AARP® Visa® Card
from Chase and $1 for every new
account, up to $2 million each year,

to AARP Foundation through Drive
to End Hunger, a national cam-
paign led by AARP and AARP
Foundation to end hunger among
older Americans. It’s the only credit
card endorsed by the AARP—an
organization that provides mean-
ingful resources and benefits to
senior Americans and its members.

“Hunger among older adults is

escalating at an alarming rate in
America,” said Anisa Tootla, vice
president of hunger impact pro-
grams at AARP Foundation. “We
know Americans want to help
their older neighbors in need, and
we are pleased that Chase has
joined the Foundation’s efforts to
get people engaged in giving
back.”

America’s Seniors Get A Helping Hand In The Fight Against Hunger

In 2025, an estimated 9.5 million senior Americans will experience
some form of food insecurity—about 75 percent higher than the num-
ber in 2005.

(NAPSA)—Making healthy life-
style changes may have just got-
ten a little easier.

Many health clubs are opening
their doors, free, for several days
as part of the annual Get Active
America! program.

Participating clubs will enroll
members and nonmembers in the
Presidential Active Lifestyle
Award’s (PALA) “Million PALA
Challenge,” asking people to com-
mit to being active five days a
week for at least six out of eight
weeks. For adults, this entails 30
minutes of exercise a day—or
8,500 steps. For children, this
entails 60 minutes a day, or
11,000 steps for girls and 13,000
steps for boys.

The clubs will provide enrollees
with support and encouragement,
including club-based activities,
community walks and sometimes
e-newsletters. This includes
“Bring a Friend” days, when clubs
invite current members to bring
their friends and family to get
physically active at the club; and
“Open House” days, when clubs
open their doors to the public, free
of charge, to help everyone feel
supported in adopting more physi-
cally active, healthier lifestyles.

A joint initiative between the
President’s Council on Fitness,
Sports and Nutrition and Let’s
Move!—championed by First Lady
Michelle Obama—the “Million
PALA Challenge” aims to get at
least 1 million Americans to sign
up and achieve the award.

“It’s hard to make healthy life-
style changes without the support
of those around you,” says Joe
Moore, president and CEO of the
International Health, Racquet &

Sportsclub Association. “Health
clubs offer inspiration and the
support people need to spring-
board into healthier, more active
lifestyles—so they won’t feel alone
in doing it.”

Here are some easy ways to get
started:

• Join a gym.
• Sign up for a group exercise

class.
• Take the stairs instead of an

elevator.
• Bike to work or school, to run

errands or to visit friends.
• Walk the dog.
• Join a sports team.
• Do yard work.
• Walk to the store.
• Park at the far end of the lot.
Anyone who wants to live a

healthier, happier and more ful-
filling life is encouraged to partici-
pate in Get Active America! and
the “Million PALA Challenge.” To
find participating clubs, visit
http://healthclubs.com/getactivea
merica. You can enroll at www.
millionpalachallenge.org.

Fitness Made Simpler

Many health clubs are opening
their doors, free, as part of the
Get Active America! program.

(NAPSA)—Ambius, www.ambius.
com, a leading provider of interior
landscaping solutions, recently
became a Planet Positive–certified
business due to a commitment to
reducing its environmental effect.
This gained it an international envi-
ronmental mark that recognizes a
company’s commitment to creating
a better way of living.

* * *
Genuity SmartStax RIB Com-

plete refuge-in-the-bag product
blends 95 percent trait-protected
seed for broad-spectrum above
and below ground insect control
with 5 percent refuge (non-Bt)
seed in each bag. For more infor-
mation, visit www.genuity.com.

The 4-H Study of Positive Youth
Development—conducted by Tufts
University—found that 4-H’ers,
thrive through the healthy living
education and experiences received
through 4-H programming. Visit
www.4-h.org/revolution for more
information.

2622 12 pica.qxp:12 Pica 2622 5/4/11 12:07 PM Page 2




