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(NAPSA)—You don’t have to
spend a lot of green to keep your
garden green. In fact, there are
ways to conserve water, save on
your water bill and still have a
lush garden.

Many homeowners save water
and money by using drip irriga-
tion systems that deliver the right
amount of water slowly and
evenly at the plant’s roots—where
it is needed most.

Today’s drip systems are easily
set up and operated. They draw
water directly from an outside
faucet or an automatic irrigation
system and precisely deliver it to
drip zones. By using a sprinkler
timer, you can automatically
water all your flower beds, shrubs,
garden, hedges and potted plants
with drip irrigation, even when
you are not at home.

Here are some drip basics to
help you save water from the
experts at Rain Bird, a global
leader in drip irrigation:

1. Start by estimating the
water needs of your plants. Knowl-
edgeable and helpful staff at your
local garden center can assist you
to determine just how much water
your plants need to be healthy. Dif-
ferent plants will have different
requirements depending on their
variety and the conditions of your
yard, such as sun exposure and soil
type. You can also check with local
university horticulture depart-
ments or resource books at the
library.

2. Choose the right drip prod-
ucts to deliver the required water
efficiently. A well-designed drip
system can deliver water faster or
slower depending on the individual
needs of each plant by using differ-
ent types of emission devices.

3. For optimum performance,
keep your water pressure under
control with a pressure regulator.
These simple devices keep your
water pressure in the ideal range
of within 20-50 psi. If your water
pressure is too high, you may
experience misting and inefficient
watering.

4. Include a filter in your sys-
tem to prevent clogging. Drip irri-
gation uses smaller-diameter open-
ings than traditional sprinklers, so
tiny bits of dirt and debris may
clog your system if you don’t use a
filter. The good news is that filters
are relatively inexpensive and new
designs are even self-cleaning for
worry-free operation.

A well-designed drip irrigation
system will lose practically no
water to runoff, deep percolation
or evaporation.

Rain Bird offers an online step-
by-step guide to drip irrigation in
addition to interactive demos, and
even a drip calculation program to
help homeowners and contractors
design and schedule drip irri-
gation systems correctly, at
www.rainbird.com.
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(NAPSA)—Most people don’t

give their digestive tract the atten-
tion it deserves. Digestive health,
however, is vital to day-to-day
well-being and plays a key role in
long- term health. Studies show
that a properly functioning GI
tract ensures optimal absorption
of nutrients into the body and the
timely elimination of unwanted
waste and harmful compounds
such as carcinogens. Since the
intestines produce protective im-
mune substances, researchers are
also beginning to understand the
value of a healthy digestive system
in boosting immune function.

When it comes to promoting
digestive health, what you eat is
top of the list. Here are five must-
eat foods to keep your digestive
health in good form.

1. High-fiber breakfast ce-
real. Bran flakes and the like are
packed with insoluble fiber, the
type that bulks up in your intesti-
nal tract by holding water. This
eases the passage of waste and
helps prevent constipation. Not
only do you feel more comfortable
day to day, but avoiding constipa-
tion also means lessening your
risk for developing hemorrhoids.
In the long term, you may even
lower your risk for colon cancer.
Select cereals that supply at least
six or more grams of fiber per
serving. Top off your bowl with
fresh fruit for added nutrition and
even more fiber.

2. Kefir (liquid-style yogurt)
and yogurt. These fermented
dairy products contain live benefi-
cial bacteria that help establish a
friendly bacterial colony in your
intestinal tract. Studies show that

eating foods regularly with live
beneficial bacteria (called probi-
otics) not only helps promote good
digestion but helps boost the
immune system. The digestive
tract contains 70 percent of the
body’s immune system, and if pop-
ulated with harmful bacteria, the
body becomes more prone to infec-
tions. When shopping for yogurt
and kefir, look for live active cul-
tures listed on the label. Aim for
eating a one-cup serving daily,
which also supplies about 30 per-
cent of your calcium needs. Also
reach for other foods with added
probiotics such as Attune wellness
bars, Vive breakfast cereal and
certain cheeses if your intake of
yogurt is limited. Look on the
package label for bacteria names
that include Lactobacillus aci-
dophilus and Bifidobacterium lac-
tis, which are healthy bacteria
strains that help keep your diges-
tive health optimal.

3. Onions. This savory veg-
etable, along with a few more
obscure ones such as chicory root
and Jerusalem artichokes, sup-
plies a type of fiber called inulin.
Referred to as a “prebiotic,” inulin
serves as “food” for the healthy
bacteria in your intestinal tract.
Studies with inulin show that

digestive health is improved by
promoting more regular bowel
movements. Also, the absorption of
certain nutrients, such as calcium,
is boosted with inulin as part of
the diet. Use onions in soups,
stews, stir-fries and egg dishes.
Fresh, frozen and even freeze-
dried onions all contain inulin.

4. Beans. Whether black,
white, navy, pinto or kidney, these
powerhouse foods should make a
regular appearance in your diet
for excellent digestive health.
Beans are not only a super source
of insoluble fiber but also of the
soluble type, which has many
health benefits as well. Soluble
fiber helps control the rate that
stomach contents empty into the
intestinal tract, which in turn aids
the rate of nutrient delivery into
your body. Research on soluble
fiber suggests this steadier flow of
nutrients may help control dia-
betes and other chronic ailments.
Use canned beans over salads and
in burritos, soups and casseroles.

5. Water. Your digestive tract
needs ample fluid throughout the
day for optimal digestive health.
Each day, about seven liters of flu-
ids are used to mix with the food
you eat during the digestive
process. This allows the nutrients
from your food to make their way
into the circulation to be used by
the body. Also, along with fiber,
fluids, both with meals and in
between, help move food through
the intestines. Aim for 10 to 14
cups of fluids throughout the day,
more during the warmer months,
as several additional cups of fluid
may be lost to perspiration.

Keep these tips in mind and
you may find you can keep your
digestive system in good working
order for a longer, healthier life.

Five Foods For Digestive Health

(NAPSA)—You may be among
the 130 million Americans who
could get an economic stimulus
payment from the Internal Rev-
enue Service (IRS). For most peo-
ple, getting it is simple: Just file
your income tax and wait for the
check to arrive. For 12 million
older Americans who don’t ordi-
narily file taxes, however, the
process requires an extra step.

To help, AARP, Tax-Aide (an
AARP Foundation program) and
the National Council on Aging
have teamed up to create tools
that streamline the application
process. They also have volunteers
online to answer any questions
not covered in the materials.

“We are encouraging friends,
family and community organiza-
tions across the nation to join the
32,000 volunteers at AARP Foun-
dation’s Tax-Aide program who
are looking out for and helping
older Americans securely receive
their stimulus payments,” said
Tom Nelson, AARP’s chief operat-
ing officer.

At www.aarp.org/stimulus you
will find step-by-step instructions
on how to apply and tips to avoid

scams. You can print out a com-
pleted economic stimulus form after
answering a few simple questions.

It’s important to know that even
if Social Security, certain veterans’
benefits, certain railroad retire-
ment benefits or earned income is
all you earned in 2007, you may
still be eligible for the payment.

What many do not know is that
people have plenty of time to
apply for the payment. The IRS
will be accepting applications
until the fall.

AARP warns there are scams
and con artists poised to use this
opportunity for their own profit.
The IRS will never call you to ask
for your Social Security number or
bank account information or send
you a letter asking you to respond
by phone or e-mail and no IRS
agent will ever come to your home.

If you have already filed your
taxes or applied for the economic
stimulus payment, spread the word
to friends, family and neighbors
who might need a little help. With
online materials, thousands of vol-
unteers across the country and
trusted family and friends, there
are many resources people can use.

Don’t Miss Out OnYour Stimulus Payment
(NAPSA)—With the Interna-

tional OnePrice calling plan from
Time Warner Cable, people have a
convenient way to make interna-
tional calls to over 100 coun-
tries—while paying one low fixed
price each month. For more infor-
mation about this and other ser-
vices, go to www.timewarner
cable.com.

**  **  **
If you own a pool, here’s a

safety tip: Make sure everyone
leaves the pool area and seeks
shelter indoors if the weather
takes a turn for the worse. More
pool safety tips are available at
www.nsfconsumer.org.

**  **  **
A loophole in U.S. law allows

the use of 17 place names on wine
bottles that are not produced in
those locations. Opponents say
the labels are misleading and that
while they might be legal, “they
aren’t right.” For more informa-
tion, visit www.wineorigins.com.

**  **  **
Shady Day, Inc., a company

started by two moms looking for a
better way to protect their fami-
lies from the sun, offers a com-
plete line of sunscreen wipes,
sprays, lip balms and face sticks,
made with all-natural ingredients

and offering waterproof SPF 30
sun protection. Shady Day prod-
ucts can be found at retailers
nationwide, including Ulta
(www.ulta.com) and Saks Fifth
Avenue (www.saks.com). For more
information, visit www.shady
 dayinc.com. 

**  **  **
According to the International

Association of Amusement Parks
and Attractions, visiting an
amusement park, attraction or
waterpark can be a great way to
spend your vacation—and a bit of
planning can go a long way. To
learn more, visit www.ticket for
 fun.com.

**  **  **
“Owning a home is a long-term

investment, not a quick-in, quick-
out transaction,” said Lawrence
Yun, chief economist of the
National Association of Realtors.
“Over the past six years, the
median price has risen nearly 40
percent.”

**  **  **
While the arrival of monthly

bills is never a surprise, the
charges are not always as pre-
dictable. Some cable providers, in
particular, entice customers with
introductory offers that often
change into bigger, second prices
later—sometimes as early as the
second month. To learn more, visit
embarq.com.

**  **  **
“A proper sleep surface that

allows a woman to control the
level of comfort every night, like a
Sleep Number bed, can help
ensure the best sleep possible,”
said sleep researcher Pete Bils.
For tips about getting a good
night’s sleep, visit sleepnum
ber.com. 

**  **  **
“Oceans Apart” (Avon Books),

by bestselling author Karen
Kingsbury, is a riveting story of
secret sin and the healing power
of forgiveness. It is available
wherever books are sold.




