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(NAPSA)—Here’s a surprising
statistic: More than 4 billion pre-
scriptions are written every year
in the U.S. and approximately 40
percent of these drugs aren’t
taken according to directions.
Failing to finish a prescription
medication is one of the most com-
mon issues, with Americans leav-
ing 200 million pounds of medica-
tion unused annually. In some
cases, patients may stop taking a
drug once they feel better. Other
situations leave caretakers with
significant amounts of excess
medications.

These unused medications can
pose a number of problems. If left
in the medicine cabinet, they can
cause accidents with young chil-
dren or may be abused by teens
and adults. The problem is not as
uncommon as some might think—
nearly 7 million Americans over
the age of 12 report having used
prescription drugs in the past
month for nonmedical reasons and
the numbers are increasing.

The Lack of Good
Disposal Options

In light of these figures, many
people are seeing the importance
of disposing of unused medication.
Even when motivated to do so,
however, people can be faced with
limited options for getting rid of
medications responsibly. In the
past, some sources recommended
flushing unused medicine down
the toilet, but recent evidence
shows trace amounts of pharma-
ceuticals in waterways and drink-
ing water supplies. There have
been over 1,000 published reports
of pharmaceuticals in sewage, sur-
face waters, groundwater and
elsewhere, and an estimated 40
million people in the U.S. are

exposed to it. Due to these find-
ings, government authorities now
say pharmaceuticals should not be
disposed in the toilet or sink.

Throwing medication in the
trash does not effectively neutral-
ize the potentially harmful sub-
stances in the drugs. Mail-in dis-
posal products are also available,
but only for a limited range of sub-
stances, and they also require
labels to be left on the medications,
raising privacy concerns. Finally,
some communities organize collec-
tion programs, but these can be
inconvenient to access due to lim-
ited hours and the necessity for
law enforcement to be present.
Even when drugs are successfully
collected through these programs,
their eventual incineration can
cause air pollution.

ANew Method For
Easy Disposal

Fortunately, a new product has
recently been introduced to meet

the need: a pouch with a specially
designed inner packet of a drug-
deactivating ingredient. Users
simply place their medications
into the pouch, add a small
amount of water, seal it and dis-
pose of the pouch in the household
trash. A proprietary activated car-
bon system in the pouch neutral-
izes the medication, chemically
deactivating the drug. After dis-
posal, the pouch continues to work
by keeping the drugs chemically
bound so they cannot leach into
groundwater from the landfill.

The main ingredient in the
pouch, activated carbon, is used
extensively in municipal water
purification and in emergency
treatments of drug overdosage.
The pouch works with any pre-
scription pharmaceutical product,
including controlled drugs and
narcotics. It’s compatible with
drugs in tablet, capsule, liquid or
patch form.

The Medsaway Medication Dis-
posal System is an affordable and
convenient way to increase the
safety of your home and dispose of
medications responsibly. It’s avail-
able in drugstores and online.
Retail locations can be found at
www.medsaway.com.

Getting Unused Medications Out OfYour Home Safely

Every year, Americans leave
some 200 million pounds of
medication unused.

It’s a good idea to dispose of pre-
scription medication so no one is
tempted to try it who shouldn’t.

(NAPSA)—While many people
are excited about the warmer
weather and blooming flowers
that springtime brings, nearly 40
million Americans are also
preparing for the onslaught of sea-
sonal allergy symptoms. For some,
springtime allergies can feel like a
cold that just won’t go away, but
for others, spring allergies can be
a trigger for more serious respira-
tory conditions like asthma.

People with asthma can experi-
ence chronic inflammation in both
their large and small airways,
which in turn can make the air-
ways of the lungs very sensitive.
Similar to tree limbs, the airways
of the lungs are divided into
“branches,” or bronchial tubes
that begin with the large, main
bronchi and then break off into
many small airways in the lungs.
Increasing evidence suggests that
these small airways, when
inflamed, may play a significant
role in contributing to asthma
symptoms and attacks. If inflam-
mation is not treated properly,
each time the airways are exposed
to triggers, like pollen or other
spring allergens, the inflamma-
tion increases and asthma symp-
toms are more likely to occur.
There have been many advances
in drug delivery over the past sev-
eral years, which have led to the
availability of treatments that
target the small airways in partic-
ular—and when used daily, as
prescribed, have the ability to
improve asthma control.

“About half of all asthmatics
also have allergies,” said Dr.
LeRoy Graham, pediatric pulmo-
nologist at Georgia Pediatric Pul-
monology Associates. “Spring
allergies may seem like a small
inconvenience to some people, but
for a person with persistent
asthma, allergy season can be
very problematic, particularly
among people who may not have
been keeping up with daily
asthma treatments before spring
allergies hit. During spring aller-
gies, daily asthma management is
critical to help reduce inflamma-
tion in the large and small air-

ways of the lungs and control
asthma.”

While inflammation can be a
defense mechanism for the body, it
can also be harmful if it occurs at
the wrong time or lingers when it
is no longer needed. When aller-
gens, like pollen, are inhaled, the
body can mistake them for an
invader and attack them. When
this occurs, the body produces
chemicals that cause inflamma-
tion around the allergen to isolate
and destroy it. The airways of peo-
ple with asthma are even more
sensitive to allergens, which can
cause the inner linings of the air-
ways to become inflamed, leaving
less room for air to move through.
Additionally, the muscles sur-
rounding the airways tighten up
and the mucus glands in the air-
ways may produce thick mucus,
which can further block the large
and small airways.

While asthma is a chronic con-
dition and has many triggers
beyond just spring allergens, it
can be successfully managed and
may not hinder people from doing
the things they enjoy. A new web-
site, www.GetSmartAbout
Asthma.com, offers tips about
managing asthma and inflamma-
tion in the large and small air-
ways. The website also offers
downloadable materials, like a
symptom tracker, doctor discus-
sion guide and asthma diary, so
that patients can track their own
asthma symptoms and triggers,
during spring allergy season and
throughout the year.

Spring Can Be Especially Challenging For
Asthma Patients

Spring Allergies May Trigger Increased Inflammation in the Airways

For tips about dealing with asthma,
you can go to www.GetSmart About
Asthma.com.

(NAPSA)—Once the leading
cause of cancer death for women
in the United States, cervical can-
cer is now the most preventable
female cancer. Yet it affects
women of color more than it does
white women.

One reason is that women of
color are diagnosed with cervical
cancer at a later stage than are
white women. Black women are
more likely to die from cervical
cancer than women of other races
or ethnicities, possibly because of
decreased access to Pap testing or
follow-up treatment.

Almost all cervical cancers are
caused by a persistent infection
with human papillomavirus
(HPV). Almost everyone who is
sexually active will be infected
with HPV sometime in his or her
life. Most of the time the infection
goes away, but sometimes, HPV
infections can lead to cancer.

Fortunately, many of the HPV
infections that cause cervical can-
cer can be prevented with vaccina-
tion. HPV vaccine can decrease
cervical cancer rates and help
improve the health of women of
color in every community.

Dr. Iyabode Beysolow, a pedia-
trician in the Immunization Ser-
vices Division at the Centers for
Disease Control and Prevention
(CDC), explains: “We have an
entire generation of girls we could
protect from getting cervical can-
cer. Every year, 12,000 women are
diagnosed with cervical cancer and
4,000 die. If we can protect girls
now with HPV vaccine, we could
drastically reduce these numbers.”

HPV also causes vulvar, vagi-
nal, penile, anal and oropharyn-
geal (back of throat, base of tongue

and tonsils) cancers. Screening
programs don’t exist for these can-
cers, so HPV vaccine is even more
important for prevention.

There are many ways to reduce
your risk for HPV-related cancer:

•Get the HPV vaccine for boys
and girls when they are 11 or 12
years old.

•For adult women, see your
doctor regularly and get a Pap
test when your doctor recom-
mends it.

•Follow up with your doctor if
your Pap test results are not nor-
mal.

•If your doctor says you have
cervical cancer, ask to be referred
to a doctor who specializes in
treating cancers like this.

•Help spread the word that
HPV vaccine is cancer prevention.

For more information, visit
www.cdc.gov/Features/HPVvaccine/.

Preventing Cancer In The Community

Preventative vaccines and prompt
and proper treatment can save the
lives of many women of color who
are susceptible to cervical cancer.

(NAPSA)—For many, one of the
most appealing aspects of timeshare
exchange is the ability to regularly
sample vacation destinations all over
the world. That’s the word from the
travel experts at Endless Vacation
Rentals. Learn more at www.
evrentals.com.

* * *
A pool water enhancer can cre-

ate softer-feeling water and protect
swimmers’ skin and hair from harsh
chemicals in the pool. Called Silky
Swim Goodbye DRY!, it can be

poured directly into the pool and
works in about 20 minutes to cre-
ate softer-feeling water. Learn more
at www.silky swim.com.

* * *
To help the professionals who

operate RoGator self-propelled
sprayers from AGCO Corporation
feed the world, recent advances in
application equipment have focused
not only on providing greater pre-
cision and productivity but improved
cab comfort and safety. Learn more
at www.applylikeapro.com.

Most lipstick contains fish
scales!

Eric Meissner is said to have
made the world’s smallest violin
in 1977 in an effort to get listed
in the Guiness Book of World
Records. It measured just over
11⁄2 inches long.




