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(NAPSA)—To become success-
ful readers, students need positive
reading role models both in and
outside the classroom. Increas-
ingly, community members are
stepping in to fill that role and
support the work parents and
teachers are doing to encourage
children to read.

“Children become successful
readers when they have tremen-
dous support—from their families,
their teachers and even their
whole community,” said Carol H.
Rasco, president and CEO of
Reading Is Fundamental (RIF®).
“At RIF, our hope is that commu-
nity members across the nation
will work to encourage and chal-
lenge children to read every day.”

One way community members
can get involved in promoting lit-
eracy is through Read With Me:
The 2004 RIF Community Read-
ing Challenge, presented by
MetLife Foundation. The chal-
lenge, which takes place in 1,100
RIF sites across the country, seeks
to motivate children to read by
involving families, businesses and
community members.

“Businesses have the opportu-
nity to inspire children by con-
necting them with adults who love
to read,” said Sibyl Jacobson,
president and CEO of Metlife
Foundation. “MetLife is pleased to
partner with RIF in building a
corps of community volunteers
who are helping to create a nation
of lifelong readers.”

Many communities are taking
the challenge to heart. In the 2003
challenge, the Juan Linn Math
and Science Magnet School in Vic-
toria, Texas, found thousands of
eager readers.

Even if there is no RIF site

nearby, a community can support
reading using these tips:

For families:
✔ Read with your children for

at least 10 minutes every day.
✔ Encourage older children to

read whatever catches their inter-
est—novels, comic books, maga-
zines or anything else.

✔ Keep plenty of reading mate-
rials available in your home.

For businesses:
✔ Encourage your employees

to volunteer with local literacy
initiatives.

✔ Donate to RIF or other liter-
acy programs in your area
(www.rif.org).

✔ Participate in your school
district’s literacy activities and
programming, such as the Com-
munity Reading Challenge.

✔ Promote local initiatives that
support literacy.

For community groups:
✔ Volunteer with or support

local after-school literacy sites. To
volunteer at a RIF site near you,
visit www.rif.org.

Communities Encourage Children To Read

The Community Reading Chal-
lenge is a fun and motivational
approach to children’s literacy.

March Is National Craft Month

(NAPSA)—Did you know that
80 percent of families include a
crafter? They scrapbook, knit,
bead and paint while enjoying the
benefits of crafting, which range
from relaxation to higher self-
esteem.

To help spread the word on
crafting, the Hobby Industry Asso-
ciation (HIA) sponsors National
Craft Month every March.

In celebration, craft retailers
around the country will offer spe-
cial classes, demonstrations, tips
and projects throughout the whole
month to get customers involved. 

National Craft Month will cul-
minate on Saturday, March 27
with a one-day event called “Look!
I Made It Myself...A Kid’s Craft
Day.” To mark the day, craft and
hobby retailers will offer a variety
of fun filled craft activities so that
everyone can discover all the plea-
sures of crafting. 

To find out what is going on
during National Craft Month, call
your local craft store or visit
www.i-craft.com. This site also
sponsors a weekly contest with
four winners who will be awarded
a $100 gift certificate for their
favorite craft store.

Craft and hobby retailers offer
fun filled craft activities.

(NAPSA)—2004 is a great year
to be a rose lover. So, why not
“Carpe Diem,” or pick a real
“Honey” of a rose for your home
garden this growing season.

“Seize the Day,” indeed!—In
this case, make it Day Breaker or
Memorial Day, which along with
Honey Perfume make a formida-
ble All-America Rose Selections
(AARS) winning trio for 2004—
AARS’ 65th year of recognizing the
most outstanding new roses.

Day Breaker, Honey Perfume
and Memorial Day have truly
earned the AARS designation of
roses that are “Tested. Tried. Truly
beautiful.”

With its multi-shade yellow
blooms, blending to pink and apri-
cot, Day Breaker is an awakening
of the senses. It’s an upright,
bushy floribunda with pointed and
shapely buds. Its spiraled blooms
contain 30 to 35 petals per flower,
each nestled among dark, glossy
green foliage. Day Breaker is
characterized not only by its bril-
liantly colorful, long-lasting clus-
ters of flowers in a hardy, continu-
ous bloom but by its sharp
moderate tea fragrance.

Ah! The sweet scent and sight
of Honey Perfume. This second
award-winning floribunda’s spicy
scent is as rich as its bright apri-
cot yellow blooms that grow in
large, open clusters. Honey Per-
fume’s flowers are four inches in
diameter with 25 to 30 petals
each. With its dark green and
glossy foliage, Honey Perfume’s
total growth is about 3 feet high
and 2 feet wide. It also is very
resistant to disease, including
rust and powdery mildew.

The second heralded “day” of
celebration for 2004 is Memorial

Day, a hybrid tea with clear pink
flowers accented with a lavender
wash. This medium-tall, upright
and bushy variety features very
large, full, spiraled blooms with
more than 50 petals per flower.
Memorial Day’s long cutting
stems are beautifully clothed with
rich green foliage to accent the
large blossoms. The flower pos-
sesses a strong damask rose fra-
grance and is a vigorous and pro-
ductive performer with strong
resistance to disease and hot
weather.

Now is the time to start think-
ing about how this year’s “best of
the best” new roses will look in
your garden come springtime. The
2004 AARS Winners will be avail-
able at retail garden stores,
through selected catalogs, and
online.

For more information about the
2004 winners and past AARS win-
ners, visit the AARS Rose Resource
Web site at www.rose.org.

New Award-Winning Roses Make Tantalizing Trio

AARS award-winning roses like
these can make the day of any-
one who’s fond of America’s
favorite flower.




