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(NAPSA)—Homeowners today
have little time to tackle house-
hold projects or may avoid them
altogether because they appear
intimidating. Installing a shower
door can be just that—a cumber-
some and frustrating process,
sometimes taking three to four
hours and requiring an assort-
ment of tools. Making a mistake
in measuring, cutting or drilling is
costly and could mean several
trips to the hardware store. 

Now one company has devel-
oped a solution: a shower door
that eliminates guesswork, re-
duces installation time to under
15 minutes, and requires just one
tool—an Allen wrench—that is
already included in the kit. The
Finesse™ Quick Install™ shower
door from Sterling features an
adjustable frame that accommo-
dates a wide range of openings, so
there is no cutting. Its patented
design requires none of the mea-
suring and drilling tools associ-
ated with regular door installa-
tions.

In just four trouble-free steps,
homeowners can easily install the
Sterling Quick Install shower
door:

1. Secure the side jambs by
placing the bottom track on the
tub ledge between the jambs and
tightening the expansion mecha-
nism with the Allen wrench;

2. Place the top track on the
wall jambs, tighten the compres-
sion-fit mechanism with the Allen
wrench at one end and slide the
header cap over it;

3. Hang the inside and outside
frameless door panels on the
header track with the pre-installed
rollers and place the center guide
on the bottom track to cover the
compression-fit mechanism;

4. Install the towel bars, adjust
the rollers to even the door, and
place a bead of silicone caulk
around the doorframe. 

With pre-assembly occurring at
the factory to minimize the num-
ber of loose parts, tedious assembly
is no longer an issue. Another
great convenience of the Sterling
Finesse Quick Install shower door
is the bottom of the side jambs that
features a curved corner on one
side and straight surface on the
other side. Homeowners don’t need
to file their shower door’s jambs to
accommodate the curved surface
found on many one-piece shower
enclosures. If they have a 90-
degree tile-to-tub sill opening, they
can simply turn and invert the
jamb around to the straight side. 

The shower doors have been
designed to ensure that the com-
pression-fit mechanism is durable
and provides a leak-proof seal. Con-
structed of tempered glass with
round corners, the panels are safe
and easy to clean, with the metal
extrusions finished in Silver or Pol-
ished Brass. The shower door car-
ries a five-year limited warranty
and is available at The Home
Depot and through Sterling’s
authorized wholesale network.

For additional information, call
1-800-STERLING, or visit the Web
site at SterlingPlumbing.com. 

A new shower door can be
installed in 15 minutes with just
one tool.

Home Solution: A Shower Door 
That Eliminates Guesswork

Want A Baby?
(NAPSA)—If you’re young and

healthy, the National Institute of
Environmental Health Sciences
recommends you relax:

Have sex several times a week
and make sure the environment is
right. Easy enough?

Sure, but what the Institute
means by “right environment”
isn’t soft lights and romantic
music—though nobody’s opposed
to that.

The proper environment that
the Institute advises for the mom-
to-be includes a daily vitamin pill
containing folate or folic acid, no
mercury-containing fish like sword-
fish or shark, no soft cheese and an
avoidance of cats, undercooked
meat, pesticides and chemicals.

And there’s a “right environ-
ment” for the would-be-dad as
well—and “no smoking” is an
important part of it.

The National Institute of Envi-
ronmental Health Sciences will
send you its attractive booklet
“Ready, Set, Love” (which isn’t
about tennis) if you write: Love
Booklet, NIEHS PO Box 12233,
Research Triangle Park, NC
27709, call (919) 541-3345 or 
e-mail booklet@niehs.nih.gov.

“No smoking” is part of the
right environment for couples
who want to have a baby.

(NAPSA)—Enticing menus, value
room rates and exciting activities
add up to an enchanting holiday gift
for you and your loved ones—an
extra special way to say “Buon
Natale” and “Nuovo Anno Felice.”

From December 20 to January
6, the Rome Cavalieri Hilton
offers special room rates to cele-
brate the holiday season. Situated
in a 15-acre private park, this
magnificent hotel features 372
guestrooms, including 25 suites—
all with private balconies over-
looking the city’s monuments.

The winter holidays are fun for
all ages, with special activities for
children and elegant events allow-
ing adults to celebrate in style. Hol-
iday menus are showcased in the
hotel’s restaurants, including La
Pergola, Rome’s award-winning
restaurant with two Michelin stars.

The Rome Cavalieri Hilton’s
concierge can arrange private lim-
ousine service, personal shoppers
and provide advice on the best
places in Rome for last-minute
holiday gifts. Complimentary
shuttle service is available to Via
Veneto and the shopping area.

The deluxe hotel offers six food
and beverage venues, indoor and
outdoor pools, a full-service spa
and tennis courts. A highly prized
art collection is featured through-
out the public spaces and suites.
The main lobby and bar showcase
original 19th century oils and
paintings by the Italian artists
Margherita Caffi and Giuseppe
Zais, displayed above the con-
cierge and reception area.

Superior rooms are priced from
$278 and deluxe rooms, with
panoramic views of the Eternal
City, start at $326. Visitors may
also opt for the new Executive
Floor Rooms that start at $395
and allow guests Clubroom access
with all-day snacks, drinks and
private concierge services. All
rates (contingent upon Euro ex-
change rates) are per room, per
night, single or double occupancy,
and include tax and a full buffet
breakfast.

For reservations, call the Rome
Cavalieri Hilton directly at 011-
39-063-5091, send a request by
fax to 011-39-063-509-2241 or
visit www.cavalieri-hilton.it.

Spectacular Festivities Highlight Roman Holidays

The spectacular view of the Eternal City from the Rome Cavalieri
Hilton’s rooftop garden add to lasting holiday memories.

(NAPSA)—Car crashes are the
number one killer of American
teenagers, with about 20 young
people dying on U.S. highways
each day. Yet a recent survey
found less than half of parents
check on the safety of the vehicle
they’re considering for their teens.

To help drive down crash sta-
tistics, a number of families and
organizations have public pro-
grams to help make teen drivers
safer. For example, Carfax, a com-
pany consumers use to check the
history of used cars, recently
launched the Carfax Safe Car-
Safe Teen Driver Program. It fea-
tures an interactive website with
comprehensive information on
safe driving and an e-mail service
that sends weekly tips to parents
and teens. 

The company has gathered
information and resources from a
vast array of the industry’s top
experts. Many of the e-mail tips
are designed to remind parents of
techniques they may already be
practicing every time they get
behind the wheel—but that they
may be hard pressed to remember
when instructing their eager teen. 

In addition to driving informa-
tion, experts at Carfax offer valu-
able advice to help parents choose
safe, reliable cars for novice teen
drivers. They recommend parents:

• Buy old, large cars such as
station wagons or four-door

sedans with small engines for
their teens. These vehicles tend to
be more solid than many smaller
cars and can better withstand
impacts. 

• Learn the vehicle history.
Has the vehicle been in a crash
before? Has it been rebuilt? Was it
in a flood? These are the types of
details in a vehicle’s history that
can affect how safe it is today.

• Do not race into buying
cars for their teens. Waiting just
one year can help keep a teen
safer. Sixteen-year-old drivers are
12 times more likely to be
involved in vehicle crashes than
any other age group. 

For more information, visit
www.carfax.com and click on the
Teen link.

Helping Teens Choose Safe Cars

When buying a used car for
your teen, be sure to check its
history. That can tell you if it has
been rebuilt in the past and if it’s
not as safe as it could be.

(NAPSA)—In the event of an
emergency, people must be pre-
pared to safely evacuate—includ-
ing the one in five Americans
affected by a disability. In
response, Easter Seals created
s.a.f.e.t.y. first: working together
for safer communities. The new
community-based outreach pro-
gram helps raise awareness about
personalized planning for people
with disabilities and provides
proper planning tools and
resources. To learn more about
how to implement the s.a.f.e.t.y.
first program, visit www.easter-
seals.org or call the toll-free num-
ber 1-866-BE-SAFE-5.

If you are postmenopausal
and have osteoporosis or are at
risk for it, you should know that
Fosamax was clinically proven to
help reverse bone loss and
strengthen bone. Fosamax also
was clinically proven to help
build bone; increases in bone
mass were seen as early as three
months after therapy started.
Available in a once weekly
tablet, Fosamax is nonhormonal.
A recent study examined the dos-
ing preference and convenience
of once weekly Fosamax, and
nearly nine out of  10 post-
menopausal women with osteo-
porosis said they prefer the once

weekly dose to a daily dose. For
more information about osteo-
porosis and bone density testing,
call  1-800-363-3507 or visit
www.bonedensitytest.com.

Shauntay Hinton, Miss USA®

2002, introduced Eli Lilly and
Company’s new LillyforLife™

Awards to honor the everyday
accomplishments and outstanding
achievements of people with dia-
betes. Shauntay’s grandmothers
both had diabetes. The new
awards are an expansion of the
Lilly Insulin 50-Year Medal pro-
gram that has been honoring peo-
ple since 1974. Nominations are
now being accepted and the first
award will be presented in 2003.
More information and applica-
tions for the LillyforLife Awards
can be obtained by calling 1-888-
545-5115 or visiting www.Lillyfor
Life.com.  

The impala is a swift, graceful
antelope that can leap up to 30
feet in a single bound.

The Irish Water Spaniel is
sometimes called the clown of
the dog family.




