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(NAPSA)—There has never
been a better time to obtain the
financial security a life insurance
policy can provide.

Life insurance pays a specified
amount of money to designated
beneficiaries upon the death of
the person insured. With Ameri-
cans living longer—according to
the Centers for Disease Control,
the average life expectancy for
men and women in 2000 was 74
and 79 years respectively, com-
pared with 70 and 77 years in
1980—many insurance companies
are reducing rates on life insur-
ance, up to 35 percent in some
instances, allowing policyholders
to potentially save hundreds of
dollars each year.

“Now is an opportune time to
purchase life insurance with
today’s lower rates and the ease of
comparing prices online,” said
Kristi Matus, president and CEO
of USAA Life Insurance Company.
“Life insurance helps simplify dif-
ficult financial decisions for loved
ones, during the grieving process
and years down the road.”

To help families with life insur-
ance planning, USAA offers
answers to some of the most com-
mon life insurance questions: 

Who Needs It?
Primary caregivers or those

with dependents typically need
life insurance to help cover their
expenses after death, including
funeral costs and outstanding
debt, and to provide financial sup-
port for loved ones’ expenses in
the future, such as house pay-
ments or college tuition.   

How Much Should You Buy?
In general, you should have

coverage equal to seven to 10
times your annual income,
depending on your income level
and stage in life. Ideally, you
should have enough coverage so
your beneficiaries could invest the
death benefit after paying final
expenses, and maintain their
lifestyle in the near term by
spending the interest only.  

What Type Do You Need?
There are two basic types of life

insurance coverage—term and
permanent. It’s important to
understand and consider the ben-
efits and drawbacks of each type
of life insurance:

• Term insurance offers cover-
age for a specified timeframe,
such as 30 years, and provides a
cash death benefit only. With this
type of insurance, beneficiaries
will receive the death benefit only
if the person insured dies during
the specified timeframe. Because
it is “no frills” insurance, term
insurance is typically the more
affordable option for young fami-
lies on a budget.  

• Permanent insurance, while
more expensive, provides options
for the future.  

This type of coverage offers life-
time protection and combines a
death benefit with a tax-deferred
savings component called “cash
value.”  The cash value is paid if
coverage is cancelled, and it may
be possible to borrow or withdraw
a portion of the cash value while
keeping the life insurance in
effect. The availability of fixed
premiums and tax benefits can
make permanent life insurance
the more affordable choice in the
long run.

How Should You Choose?
Compare companies before

making any purchasing decisions.
Research the same type of policy
with each provider, so you can
accurately compare policy perfor-
mance and other benefits.  

It also is a good idea to ask the
company you’re considering if it
will provide any additional ser-
vices beyond the life insurance
contract. For example, some com-
panies offer survivors free finan-
cial plans and special assistance
to help with financial decisions. 

In addition, review insurance
companies’ financial strength rat-
ings given by independent organi-
zations, such as Moody’s Investors
Services. This will help ensure
you choose a policy from a finan-
cially sound company.

By following this plan, you
should be well prepared to pur-
chase the right life insurance pol-
icy to meet your needs. For more
information on life insurance
options, call USAA at 1-800-531-
8263, or current USAA members
may visit usaa.com and enter key-
code LZP007 to access the USAA
Life Insurance Guidance Center.

Americans Living Longer, Enjoying Cheaper Life Insurance (NAPSA)—Dive in, girls. Don’t
just pack one suit in your vacation
getaway bag! From hanging out
on the beach, snorkeling in the
ocean and poolside parties…you’ll
need a wardrobe of suits—to fit all
the fun you’ll be having in the sun.

You don’t have to spend a for-
tune to get a different look! Your
wardrobe can be as diverse as
your activities and not have to
cost a month’s paycheck. Catalina
swimwear has the hottest looks
starting at under $13! 

The “trick” to being a swim-
suit model. How do swimsuit
models look so picture perfect?
Try these simple tricks: Choose a
cut that flatters your body type. If
you want to lengthen your legs,
try a high-cut bottom. If you’re
thinking of doing some tummy
hiding, vertical ribbing can mini-
mize and create a slimming effect. 

Have fun in the sand and
sun. Go everywhere and make
sure your suit stays with you! Try
a tankini for better coverage on
top and go for more coverage on
the bottom—the new boy-cut bot-
toms are hot and super-flattering.

Mix it up! If you like one bot-
tom and another top, make your
own personal suit! Ocean Gear by
Catalina has red-hot bandana
prints and denim and satin solids
that mix and match. Try a ban-
deau top and boy short bottom or a
halter top and string bikini bottom.

The secret slim-down. Why
throw a fit, if nothing fits, espe-
cially on those certain days (why,
why on vacation?!). A sexy one-
piece can be your new best
friend—so consider packing a
slimming, perfect tank suit such
as Catalina’s “Every Body” into
your “Catalina” bag.

Size doesn’t always matter.
We all love wearing the smallest

size we possibly can, but the best
fitting swimsuits may be one size
larger than your regular size.
Don’t sweat it. Tear the size label
out and be way more comfortable
as you dive into the pool!

No need to dread swimsuit
shopping! Get a free on-site fit
consultation from a swimwear
pro at Catalina Swim Fit Clinics
in Wal-Mart stores nationwide.
Visit www.Catalinafitclinics.com
or call 1-800-770-6858.

Hook Up With A Hot Swimsuit Wardrobe

by Amy Ridenour
(NAPSA)—What do al Qaeda

and mercury pollution have in
common? 

The answer: Clinton appoin-
tees who did little about either

one now are claim-
ing in MoveOn.org’s
political TV ad cam-
paign that—thanks
to President George
Bush—both threaten
your health.

Al Qaeda’s terror-
ist threat is real. On
the other hand, cur-
rent levels of mer-

cury pollution—despite activist-
induced hype—stand little chance
of doing you any harm. 

Richard Clarke recently charged
that President Bush “ignored ter-
rorism for months,” although
Clarke himself served as the
nation’s anti-terrorism chief for
eight years under President Bill
Clinton compared to only eight
months under Mr. Bush.

Carol Browner, Environmental
Protection Agency chief under
President Clinton, now is promot-
ing TV ads that contend Bush is
blocking a national cleanup of
mercury pollution from power
plants. That’s a bit hypocritical.
Browner herself never imposed a

crackdown on power-plant mer-
cury emissions during the eight
years she ran the EPA.

Bush, by contrast, has pro-
posed a plan to cut such mercury
emissions 40 percent by 2010, and
70 percent by 2018.

Not that another mercury
crackdown matters as much as
people are being led to believe. 

Harvard researchers recently
failed to find any mercury-related
health effects among regular con-
sumers of swordfish, the most
likely source of mercury exposure
among Americans.

The Rochester School of Medi-
cine found no adverse mercury
impacts among children in the
Seychelles Islands, although
Islanders have little to eat except
mercury-contaminated fish.

In fact, there’s only one case of
fish causing mercury poisoning in
the scientific literature: At Japan’s
Minamata Bay, where tons of
industrial mercury waste was
dumped into the water for more
than 20 years, 46 people died and
hundreds were sickened by this
heavy, localized pollution. But that
sort of polluting has been illegal
here in the U.S. for many decades.

While there have been reports
of kids getting dangerous expo-
sure after stealing mercury from

school science labs, Americans’
exposure to mercury was radically
cut by the industrial cleanup that
followed passage of 1972’s Clean
Water Act. 

That mercury cleanup, in fact,
was one of the reasons for today’s
larger populations of fish-eating
eagles and ospreys.

The EPA has since cut remain-
ing mercury emissions about 50
percent through regulations on
municipal, medical and hazardous
waste incinerators.

During the Clinton Administra-
tion, the EPA said: “People who
consume average amounts of a
variety of commercially available
fish as part of a balanced diet are
not likely to consume harmful
amounts of mercury.” And the
EPA is not an organization to min-
imize a juicy health risk.

The real risk here is that a
politically-motivated fish/mercury
scare will frighten people away
from including heart-healthy fish
in their diets.

President Bush’s policies are
not the danger here. The danger is
that we will listen to his critics.

Amy Ridenour is president of
The National Center for Public Pol-
icy Research, a Washington think-
tank. Readers may view its web site
at http://www.nationalcenter.org/.

Clinton EPA Czar On Mercury:“Do As I Say, Not As I Did”
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(NAPSA)—When you purchase
a house or property, a title profes-
sional searches the public records
looking for outstanding liens or
other problems that could affect
the title. Such professionals often
fix problems without ever telling
the buyer, seller or real estate
agent. The American Land Title
Association recommends that you
purchase an Owner ’s Policy of
Title Insurance. For a one-time
fee at closing, an Owner’s Policy
will protect you against any title
problems that were not found dur-
ing the search. For more infor-
mation on title insurance, visit
the Consumer Information section
of www.alta.org.

Preventing insect damage is
better than dealing with insect
problems. A product called Bayer
Advanced Garden Tree and Shrub
Insect Control is said to protect
against aphids, borers, Japanese
and leaf beetles, leafhoppers, leaf
miners, scales, thrips and others.
One application protects for up to
12 months, which is longer than
many other products. There is no
need for spraying. Just mix with
water and pour around the base
of the tree or shrub. To learn
more, visit the Web site at
www.bayeradvanced.com or by

calling 1-877-BAYERAG.
Equally adept on the ground

with an exquisite equine or in the
air on a thin trapeze, “Circus
Siren” Sylvia Zerbini is one of the
most versatile performers Rin-
gling Bros. and Barnum & Bailey®

has ever known. Zerbini is a
ninth-generation circus per-
former, the daughter of an exotic
animal trainer and a celebrated
trapeze artist. As a child, she fol-
lowed her family into show busi-
ness, first as an aerialist, but was
eventually drawn to work with
animals—specifically horses.
Now, audiences witness her two
loves in one daring act, which
highlights her bond with the
horses and her graceful trapeze
abilities. To learn more about The
Greatest Show On Earth®, visit
www.ringling.com.




