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(NAPSA)—It may finally be
time to retire the idea of “the June
bride” as the be-all and end-all of
weddings. According to the wed-
ding site www.theknot.com, more
than half the 2.4 million weddings
that take place in America each
year—52 percent, to be exact—are
thrown in the fall and winter
months.

For that bride who fancies
walking down the aisle in a win-
ter wonderland, many bridal
designers offer beautiful gowns to
complement the season. Holiday
bridal fashion draws its inspira-
tion from the glamour and
romance of eras past. The strong
“retro” influence on bridal gown
styles reflects the drama of Holly-
wood in its golden years, the ethe-
real beauty of the classical Greek
goddesses and the romance of Vic-
torian gowns. One stunning inter-
pretation is a David’s Bridal satin
A-line gown with beaded metallic
embroidery on both empire waist
and envelope back, exuding sheer
elegance. Looking for luxe? Add a
faux fur wrap for the ceremony to
warm bare shoulders.

For brides who don’t fear the
cold, “the back of a wedding gown
is as important as the front,” says
Carley Roney, co-founder and edi-
tor-in-chief of The Knot, “so deep
V, scooped-out and apron backs
are prevalent, as well as dramatic
trains.” Hand-beaded lace, rhine-
stone-encrusted straps, and crys-
tal beading are also are among
the season’s favorite embellish-
ments. Corset bodices, sweetheart
necklines and cascading trains
take center stage in the way of
shaping, creating a look that is
soft, feminine and romantic. Many
winter brides shy from the typical
summer strapless silhouette, opt-
ing for a cap-sleeve or off-the-
shoulder neckline.

And while a bride in white is
always in fashion, many holiday
brides opt for a warmer hue of
ivory—often easier to wear when
summer tans fade, in classic satin,
organza and tulle. Warm colors
are not the only trend, as destina-
tion weddings continue to drive
couples to tropical sites. The
Galina Collection from David’s
Bridal speaks to this trend, offer-
ing sleek, modern gowns, with del-
icate, but minimal details in airy
fabrics that flatter the bride and
suit a wedding with an ocean
view.

No matter what your style, you
can find all the latest looks and
accessories for brides, grooms and
the wedding party at David’s
Bridal, the nation’s leading bridal
retailer. With over 220 locations
nationwide and incomparable
bridal gown prices ranging from
$299—$1400, David’s Bridal is
the essential wedding destina-
tion. For more information, visit
www.davidsbridal.com or call 
1-800-480-BRIDE.
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Satin A-line gown with beaded
metallic embroidery.

(NAPSA)—With winter just
around the corner, thoughts are
turning to warm-weather escapes.
For snowbirds looking to own a
vacation home where the sun
always shines, residential commu-
nities in Phoenix’s new East Valley
are an appealing option because of
the abundant amenities and tight-
knit camaraderie they offer. 

Word of mouth has led groups
of friends to the East Valley,
which is growing popular as a
quiet, laid-back alternative to
neighboring Scottsdale. Case in
point is Superstition Mountain
Golf and Country Club. Located
in a spectacular desert setting,
the club offers a small-town feel,
award-winning club facilities,
stunning architecture, two Nick-
laus-designed golf courses and an
emphasis on community. The club
welcomes new members with a
year-round social calendar that
includes everything from block
parties and nature hikes to clam-
bakes and black-tie dinners.  

Christine and Bob Zamora, of
Lodi, Calif., began their hunt for a
vacation home in popular North
Scottsdale, but chose the East Val-
ley for its open spaces and inviting
community. Christine recalls the
surprise housewarming party they
enjoyed on their first night at
Superstition Mountain: “We had

two pieces of furniture and here
they come with beautiful hors
d’oeuvres, flowers and champagne.
Everyone was so eager to meet
us—we had instant friends.”

For Floyd and Pat Hamus from
Marshfield, Wis., it was their love
of hiking and golfing combined
with the expansive vistas and
small-town feel that made the
club a perfect match. “The air is
cleaner, there’s less traffic and it’s
still close to everything we’d want
in the city. [It’s] a first-class com-
munity with top-notch amenities,”
Floyd said. 

When searching for a vacation
home, it’s important to focus on a
few criteria. Steve Elliott, CEO of
The Lyle Anderson Company, one of
the Southwest’s premier develop-
ers, recommends the following:

1) Consider the community’s
character.  Ask how many members
are from your home state or, better
yet, your hometown. For example,
Superstition Mountain attracts
members from the Midwest, while
Las Campanas, its sister commu-
nity in Santa Fe, draws members
from across the U.S.

2) Ask about the amenities, both
existing and planned. Are you
golfers? Tennis players? Hikers?
Spa-goers? Knowing which recre-
ational activities you want out of
your second home will help you
narrow your choices. 

3) Research what the commu-
nity does to introduce new mem-
bers. Superstition Mountain, for
example, welcomes new members
with housewarming parties the day
they move in and hosts activities
year-round to promote camaraderie
and build friendships.

4) Building the family estate?  A
family estate is something your
children and grandchildren can
enjoy now. It’s also an investment
with a strong potential to increase
in value. Look for a community
that your children and theirs will
be excited to return to.  

For more information about
Superstition Mountain or
Phoenix’s East Valley, please visit
www.superstitionmtn.com or call
1-877-983-3300.

Your Warm-Weather Escape:
What To Look For In A Vacation Home

Superstition Mountain in Phoenix’s
new East Valley.

(NAPSA)—Coal bed methane—
CBM—is emerging as an abun-
dant-low-cost domestic resource
that has significant potential for
discovery and development.

That’s the opinion of a number
of experts in the energy invest-
ment field. Some believe that the
relatively low cost associated with
finding and developing CBM
resources is what differentiates it,
as a resource, from other, more
conventional sources of oil and gas
deposits as an investment target.

Many experts contend that nat-
ural gas—because of its versatility,
ease of production and minimal
impact on the environment—
should be thought of as the clean-
burning fuel of choice in the U.S.

Clearly, the consumer demand
for natural gas is significant. At
last count, 65 percent of homes in
the U.S. heat using natural gas.
The U.S. Energy Secretary’s oil
and gas advisory committee
recently forecast that natural gas
use could grow by about 30 per-
cent in the next 10 years.

At the same time, developed
domestic natural gas resources
are, by most accounts, diminish-
ing. That’s one reason a number of
investment pros believe that com-
panies that have experience devel-
oping CBM resources might pre-
sent interesting investment
opportunities. 

There are still significant coal
deposits in the U.S. Many of these
contain untapped CBM deposits
that could be developed in less
time than it would take to access
natural gas deposits in the Arctic—
and at less capital outlay.

Plus, CBM wells are shallow
and do not require specialized off-
shore technology to retrieve the
gas. In addition, these wells can
often tie in directly to an existing
pipeline infrastructure.

These are some of the reasons

why a number of investment pros
have been watching what are
described as junior resource com-
panies—companies that still
present opportunities for growth—
that have experience in developing
CBM deposits, the capacity to
bring added production online and
that are willing to use the profits
from successful wells to fuel their
own growth.

Lexington Resources, Inc.—
which trades in the over-the-
counter market under the symbol
LXRS—may be one such company.

The company’s management
has set up a comprehensive drill
and development program de-
signed to expand company partici-
pation in some of the most produc-
tive areas of the country. These
development efforts are said to use
environmentally suitable methods.

The company plans to seek out
known reserves and looks to drill
quickly at very low cost.

If successful, this approach
may strengthen cash flow and add
to an already escalating asset
base, which in turn could give the
company access to other coal bed
methane opportunities.

To learn more, visit the Web site
at www.lexingtonresources.com.

CBM—A Low-Cost Source Of Natural Gas

Companies involved in develop-
ing new sources of natural gas
may present valuable investment
opportunities.

(NAPSA)—Safe computing is
about more than just protecting
against break-ins and viruses. You
also have to protect your computer
against bacteria.

With today’s hectic workloads
and longer work hours, you’re
probably spending more time than
ever at your desk. Keeping it
clean, along with the desktop
accessories that cover it—particu-
larly the computer—is often not a
top priority. In fact, a recent sur-
vey revealed that 75 percent of
U.S. adult computer users do not
clean either their computer key-
board or computer accessories,
such as a mouse or mouse pad, on
a weekly basis. Dirty desktops,
including unclean computers,
could lead to ideal conditions for
damaging microbes, such as bacte-
ria, to grow and reproduce. Even
more startling, under the right
conditions, some microbes can
duplicate every 20 minutes or less
on an inviting surface.  

That’s why there’s now a line of
antimicrobial computer acces-
sories featuring keyboards, mice
and mouse pads with Microban
product protection. This antimicro-
bial technology provides an added
level of cleanliness by inhibiting
the uncontrolled growth of damag-
ing microbes, such as bacteria,
that can cause stains, odors and
product deterioration. It works
continuously so that when
microorganisms come in contact

with the surface of a mouse, key-
board or mouse pad with Microban
protection, the technology pene-
trates the cell wall of the microor-
ganism, disrupting key cell func-
tions and making the microbes
unable to function, grow or
reproduce.  

Cleaning and disinfecting desk-
tops can reduce and may even
temporarily rid ordinary untreated
surfaces of microbes. However, the
effect is short lived and does not
prevent remaining or redeposited
bacteria from reproducing on the
surface over short periods of time.

Created by Fellowes, the new
assortment of input devices with
Microban antimicrobial product
protection includes basic, cordless
and ergonomic keyboards, an opti-
cal mouse, a cordless mouse and a
selection of mouse pads.

For more information, visit
www.fellowes.com. 

The Dirt On Getting A Cleaner Office

Added cleanliness right at your
fingertips.

***
Set me a task in which I can put
something of my very self, and
it is a task no longer; it is joy; it
is art.

—Bliss Carman
***

***
Employment is nature’s physi-
cian, and is essential to human
happiness.

—Galen
***

***
To set the world on fire, warm
up to your job.

—Arnold Glasow
***

***
A man at work at his trade is
the equal of the most learned
doctor.

—Hebrew proverb
***

***
He that labors and thrives spins
gold.

—George Herbert
***




