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(NAPSA)—The striking sand-
stone cliffs and rock formations
that first made Wisconsin Dells
famous can best be seen from the
water, and there may be no better
way to take in the spectacular
scenery than on a Dells Boat Tour.

For more than 150 years, trav-
elers have flocked to the unique,
7.5-mile stretch of the Wisconsin
River where it winds through nar-
row gorges lined by rocky banks
and towering pines. “The Dells,” as
it’s now known, is a geological won-
der with a rich history. Aboard a
Dells Boat Tour, visitors can enjoy
the sights and hear the legends.

“There’s no better way to expe-
rience the natural scenery that is
the heart of Wisconsin Dells than
on a Dells Boat Tour,” said Dan
Anchor, assistant manager of
Dells Boat Tours. “Passengers are
treated to spectacular views as
well as intriguing stories of the
people who have contributed to
the Dells’ colorful past.”

The Midwest’s leading family
vacation destination, Wisconsin
Dells is home to a variety of nat-
ural and manmade attractions.
From April through early Novem-
ber, Dells Boat Tours give visitors
a glimpse of the natural scenery
that first made the Dells a popu-
lar tourist destination. The tour
boats travel both the Upper and
Lower Dells, which are separated
by a dam on the Wisconsin River.
Guides lead the narrated tours,
explaining the geological and cul-
tural history of the area.

A variety of tours are available,
including a Complete Dells Boat
Tour that provides a comprehen-
sive look at both the Upper and
Lower Dells. Purchasing the com-
bined tour saves passengers 24
percent, and the tours do not have
to be taken back-to-back. Those
looking for excitement may opt for
the newest tour, Dells Jet Boat
Adventures, which are thrilling,
30-minute rides aboard high-
speed boats. For a more serene

excursion, Dells Boat Tours offer
Sunset Cruises featuring both a
wine-and-cheese cruise and a din-
ner cruise complete with live
entertainment.

While touring the Upper Dells,
passengers experience two unique
shore landings, one at Stand
Rock, the sandstone pedestal that
is a trademark of the Dells, and
one at Witches Gulch, a glen with
passageways given names such as
“Spooky Lane” for the mystery
and legend associated with them.
At Stand Rock, passengers watch
a specially trained dog leap the
five-foot chasm from the main cliff
to the rock ledge. The dog’s feat
commemorates the world’s first
stop-action photo, an image of a
man making the leap, which was
captured in 1888 by famous Dells
photographer H.H. Bennett.

“Our shore landings allow pas-
sengers to get an even better look
at some of the historically signifi-
cant, scenic features of the Dells,”
Anchor said. “Since our operation
has exclusive access to these loca-
tions, visitors interested in seeing

them won’t want to miss taking a
Dells Boat Tour.”

In addition to telling ancient
Native-American tales about the
Dells, tour guides recount the his-
tory of the notable tribal members
who once made the region their
home. Passengers also hear the
historical accounts of the raftsmen
who traversed the treacherous
narrow stretches of the Wisconsin
River in the 1800s as they moved
lumber southward.

To explain the prehistoric geo-
logical origins of the area, guides
describe how powerful glacial
forces transformed sand from an
ancient inland sea into huge cliffs,
then cut and shaped the rock,
leaving the dramatic formations
that today are the centerpiece of
the Dells.

Boat Tours Showcase Famous Wisconsin Dells Scenery

Dramatic sandstone cliffs along the Wisconsin River provide a
spectacular backdrop for a Dells Boat Tour.

For more information about Dells Boat Tours:
• Call (608) 254-8555
• Visit www.dellsboats.com
• For lodging information visit www.wisdells.com

(NAPSA)—The teen years can
be tough for parents as teenagers
come closer to understanding who
they are and who they are not.

One of the most important
issues teens come to terms with
involves their sexuality. Parents
can do a lot to make this issue a
more comfortable one.

Puberty is not an easy time for
any teen, and it is extra difficult if
your teen is realizing that he or
she is attracted to people of the
same sex. This is not an easy time
for you, the parent, but it is
important to keep the lines of
communication open in this chal-
lenging environment and be sup-
portive of your teen.  

“Most of the emotional distur-
bance experienced by gay men
and lesbians around their sexual
identity is not based on physiolog-
ical causes, but rather is due more
to a sense of alienation in an
unaccepting environment,” ac-
cording to a statement published
by the American Medical Associa-
tion’s Council on Scientific Affairs
in the Journal of the American
Medical Association.

Nevertheless, many people
may try to tell teens that they are
sick and need professional help to
change. There is, however, no sci-
entifically valid evidence that
shows people can change their
sexual orientation, although some
people do repress it, according to
the Human Rights Campaign, the
nation’s largest gay and lesbian
political organization. Indeed, the
most reputable medical and psy-
chotherapeutic groups say you
should not try to change your sex-
ual orientation.

As with any significant step in
their lives, teens may seek help in
understanding their sexual orien-
tation and telling people about it. 

Some teens come out when
someone asks them if they are
gay, lesbian or bisexual. Others

make a point of pulling people
aside and saying, “There’s some-
thing I have to tell you.”

If a teen chooses the latter
option, he or she may want to
approach the most open-minded
and caring person they know, the
person least likely to be shocked,
threatened or put off. Teens may
talk to a friend or a teacher before
they talk with their parents. As a
parent, you can help by being visi-
bly open and willing to discuss sex-
uality even before the topic arises.  

“If you are going through the
coming out process yourself ,
remember that you are not alone,”
said Candace Gingrich, the man-
ager of the Human Rights Cam-
paign Foundation’s National Com-
ing Out Project, a public education
and outreach program that pro-
motes honesty and openness about
being gay, lesbian, bisexual or
transgender on campus, in the
workplace and in the community.   

The National Coming Out Pro-
ject also publishes the Resource
Guide to Coming Out, a popular
and helpful tool for those going
through the coming out process.
For more information, or to down-
load a copy of the guide, visit the
Human Rights Campaign at
www.hrc.org.

Talking To Teens About Sexual Orientation

Teens should know that it’s
okay to get help dealing with 
confusing feelings about sexual
orientation.

(NAPSA)—Two centuries ago, a
French immigrant started a com-
pany on Delaware’s Brandywine
River, and since then both the
company and the U.S. have grown
in size and importance.

The company that E.I.  du
Pont started with one product—
black powder for blasting and
firearms—now is better known for
Dacron polyester, Lycra elastane,
Teflon non-stick coating, Stain-
master carpet, Kevlar fiber and
Corian surfaces.

The company’s long history is
told in 272 pages and 598 illustra-
tions in a new book, DuPont:
From the Banks of the Brandy-
wine to Miracles of Science, by his-
torian Adrian Kinnane. Distrib-
uted by Johns Hopkins University
Press, it is available from the dis-
tributor at www.jhubooks.com and
through online retailers.

In the country’s early years,
DuPont explosives helped build
canals, railroads, ports, harbors,
dams and mines. Its munitions
helped the U.S. win wars.

Kinnane writes: “The com-
pany’s diversification into plastics,
dyes and synthetic materials after
1900 matched new technologies to
the needs of a complex, maturing
society.” 

Its pioneering research yielded
new products such as neoprene
and nylon. Its services in the
Manhattan Project helped end
WW II and its materials were in

23 of the 25 layers of the suit Neil
Armstrong wore when he walked
on the moon in 1969.

The book has been praised by
historians such as Professor
Carol Hoffecker of the University
of Delaware, who said it “com-
mands the reader’s interest from
the moment one opens its dust
jacket until one finishes its last
page. It makes wonderful use of
historic and modern photographs
but its text is its most important
asset. Kinnane has used authori-
tative historical sources to pro-
duce an excellent introduction to
the 200-year-old history of this
ever-changing, complex American
business.”

Today, DuPont has operations
in 70 countries, providing some of
the world’s most advanced materi-
als, services and technologies.

U.S. History: 200 Years of Science and Progress

From black powder to poly-
ester and beyond, science has
fueled our country’s progress.

(NAPSA)——Law enforcement
agencies across the country are
launching Click It or Ticket cam-
paigns—high-visibility efforts to
enforce seat belt laws. Under the
campaigns, many states will use
newspapers, radio, TV and other
media to broadly publicize their
plans to increase enforcement and
warn people to buckle up or get a
ticket. Then they will begin the
stepped-up enforcement, issuing
tickets—not warnings—when peo-
ple aren’t wearing seat belts. To
learn more about the Operation
ABC Mobilizations or the Click It
or Ticket campaigns, visit www.
nhtsa.dot.gov.

One food storage container was
designed to combine the best of
both the disposable and non-dis-
posable worlds. Called Good Cook
Reusable Disposables, the contain-
ers cost 25 to 30 percent less than
most disposable containers, yet are
of the same quality as many tradi-
tional containers. The containers
are microwave, freezer and dish-
washer safe. For more information,
visit www.goodcook.com.

As many as 44 percent of con-
sumers call a plumber within one
year of purchasing a new home.
To help avoid unexpected and
costly problems such as water

damage, experts at Roto-Rooter
offer potential homebuyers help-
ful tips and a Plumbing Checklist
for Homebuyers. The checklist for
homebuyers can be found online
at www.rotorooter.com.

To keep yourself from being bit-
ten at your next barbecue or out-
door function, apply an effective
repellent to your body, clothing
and shoes. Traditionally, repel-
lents containing the chemical
DEET have been recommended
for long-lasting protection. How-
ever, a new natural repellent,
Repel Lemon Eucalyptus has been
clinically proven to last as long as
products with DEET. The product,
which comes in lotion form, lasts
six to eight hours per application
and is safe for the whole family.
For more information, visit
www.destinationoutdoors.com.

The National Heart, Lung, and
Blood Institute at www.nhlbi.
nih.gov.
Copaxone at www.copaxone.
com.
National Highway Traffic Safety
Administration at www.nhtsa.
com.
The Lee Pipes Get in Gear bike
safety program at www.leepipes.
com/GetinGear.
American Egg Board at
www.aeb.org.
Institute for Business & Home
Safety at www.ibhs.org.
The United States Tennis Asso-
ciation at  www.usta.com. 

Check Out
These Web Sites:

***
Imagination is more important
than knowledge, for knowledge
is limited while imagination
embraces the whole world.

—Albert Einstein
***

***
My idea is that there is music
in the air, music all around us,
the world is full of it, and you
simply take as much as you
require.

—Edward Elgar
***




