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(NAPSA)—With the recent suc-
cess of movies set in the 1950s
and 1960s, such as “Dreamgirls”
and “Hairspray,” many music
lovers are turning back to the
sound of the “golden oldies,” made
popular again by these films. As a
result, entertainment venues
across the U.S. are paying homage
to the music from these decades
by incorporating the era’s biggest
hits into their shows.

For instance, Pigeon Forge,
Tenn., is one city that has em-
phazised this trend by providing
entertainment and attractions
specifically themed around the
1950s and 1960s, such as concerts,
theaters and museums.

The new Dick Clark’s American
Bandstand Music Complex is home
to the Family Concert Series
Under the Stars, where famous
artists such as Brenda Lee,
Chubby Checker, Herman’s Her-
mits starring Peter Noone, Eric
Burdon and The Animals, Fabian
and Bobby Vee will take the stage.
Perhaps just as exciting as the con-
cert lineup is Dick Clark’s Rock-n-
Roll and Remember Museum,
where guests can view instru-
ments, costumes and more from
the chart-toppers featured on
“American Bandstand.” Visitors
can also enjoy the American Band-
stand Grill and a gift shop.

There are also two theaters in
Pigeon Forge dedicated to per-
forming the biggest hits from the
rock ’n’ roll and Motown days. The
American Jukebox Theater fea-
tures an ensemble cast belting out
hits such as “Rock Around the
Clock,” “Baby Love” and “Blue

Suede Shoes.” At the Memories
Theatre, impersonators of big
stars such as Elvis, Buddy Holly,
Tom Jones, Roy Orbison and more
twist and shout in the popular
“Elvis & Friends” show. 

Pigeon Forge even has an Elvis
Museum, featuring a large private
collection of authentic Elvis mem-
orabilia, including cars, jewelry,
clothing and more. Also at the
brand-new TCB Theater, located
in the museum, visitors enjoy
hearing music spanning Elvis’
entire career performed by an
Elvis tribute artist.

Additionally, Dollywood is
home to the award-winning
Dreamland Drive-In, where chart-
topping hits are performed in the
park’s newest music review.

Located at the foothills of the
Great Smoky Mountains, Pigeon
Forge, Tenn., has all of this and
much more. 

For more information on these
attractions or any other Pigeon
Forge event or attraction, call toll
free (800) 251-9100 or visit
www.MyPigeonForge.com.

Relive Days Gone By

Visitors to one resort town have
a rockin’ good time watching
shows with a retro twist.

(NAPSA)—Finding a good deal
on commercial auto insurance is
about more than finding the low-
est rate—it’s about finding the
best all-around coverage to suit
your company’s needs.

Understanding what coverages
and service options are available
is the first step toward making
better, more informed decisions so
that you and your business are
properly protected. Here are some
tips from the experts at Progres-
sive to help you find the right cov-
erage, service and price:

• Know the company you’re
dealing with—and its reputa-
tion for handling claims. Under-
stand that you may pay more for
“cheaper” coverage in the long run
if the company lacks experience
handling commercial auto claims.
In business, vehicles need to be on
the road—or you lose money.
Insurance companies that don’t
specialize in commercial auto cov-
erage often don’t have their own
claims representatives handling
the process, so it may take longer
to get vehicles back in service.

• Look for discounts. Before
initiating a quote for a policy,
gather your company’s loss and
financial records. This informa-
tion could help you save a lot of
money. You may qualify for dis-
counts if you’ve carried increased
liability limits in the past, if your
employee base consists of experi-
enced drivers or if your company’s
credit rating is good. 

• Don’t let your coverage
lapse. Proof of prior insurance is
important, so never let your insur-
ance policy lapse. If you do, you
will most certainly pay more for
your next policy.

• Ask for referrals. Find out
where colleagues in your business
have found the best coverage and
the best service. They may be able
to refer you to an agent or com-
pany that really understands your
business.

• Check driving records
before hiring. If they’ll be dri-
ving a company vehicle, be sure to
screen the Motor Vehicle Report
(MVR) for every potential hire. 

• Update the value of your
equipment. If you’ve added,
upgraded or phased out equip-
ment, you’ll want your policy to
reflect the true value of your fleet.
This ensures you have adequate
coverage where you need it and
that you’re not paying for cover-
age you no longer need.

• Check the options for
managing your policy. See if
you can handle routine tasks
online and over the phone instead
of having to visit an agency or
mail in forms. It saves time—and
in business, time is money. 

For more information about
commercial auto insurance, visit
driveinsurance.com.

Seven Tips To Finding The Right Commercial Auto Policy

Hiring drivers with good driving
records will help reduce your
insurance rates.

(NAPSA)—Here’s a healthy
reminder: The next time you
travel, don’t forget to pack your
prescription drugs. 

How To Travel With Drugs
The Academy of Managed Care

Pharmacy says the safest way to
travel with medications is to keep
them in their original containers,
but that’s not always practical,
especially for short trips. You don’t
want to take along several bottles
of 30 or more capsules for a four-
day weekend. Judy Cahill, the
Academy’s executive director,
advises, “Take along just enough
to last through the entire trip,
with perhaps two or three extra
days’ supply in case of travel
delays or trip extensions.” And
keep them with you—don’t take a
chance on checked luggage.

The next best thing to do is to
place your medications in a pill
carrier; many types are readily
available in any drugstore. In
addition, write down all the med-
ications you are taking on a sheet
of paper, including the medica-
tion’s name, the doctor’s name and
phone number, how much to take
and when to take it. If there’s any
chance of confusion, include a
description of the colors, shapes
and sizes. 

Your Pharmacist Can Help
Many pharmacies have these

records and would be happy to
provide you with a copy. Often,
when you pick up your drugs at
the pharmacy, you can get a dupli-
cate label. Peel it off the backing
and put it on a sheet of paper with
all your other medications and
keep this list in a safe place. Make
sure the doctor’s name and phone

number are included for each
medication. When you travel,
bring along a photocopy of the list.
If you’re worried about mixing up
your medications, make a copy of
each label and put the copy in a
secure plastic bag or container
with the medications. 
Your Health Insurer Can, Too

If you have prescription insur-
ance, you can ask the plan to send
you this information or help you
access your records on its Web
site. If you get drugs at more than
one pharmacy or clinic, your
insurance plan will probably have
the most complete records. Be
sure to pack your prescription I.D.
card, too, and keep a copy of both
the front and the back of the card
in a separate place.

With this information, you’ll be
able to easily replace any medica-
tions you may need and, if you fall
ill unexpectedly, you can easily
communicate which drugs you are
taking to a pharmacist or doctor.
Your plan should be able to help

you manage this process if you
call the customer service number. 

Who Needs It?
It’s important to do this for all

family members, from toddlers to
seniors, because you never know
who might fall ill or become injured
and unable to communicate. 

Further Precautions
If you take drugs that might

react with other drugs or foods or
if you have a serious medical con-
dition that might leave you uncon-
scious, talk to your doctor about a
bracelet or pendant with that
information and keep your med-
ical information in an easy-to-find
spot, such as a purse, pocket or
wallet. 

If you’re taking a trip of more
than a month, you may need to
bring along an extra supply or
refill your prescriptions where
you’ll be staying. Call your insur-
ance plan and ask whether you
can get additional medication for
the length of your stay, or whether
it has a pharmacy network in that
location. It’s a good idea to bring a
photocopy of your records for the
temporary pharmacy. Some have
the ability to obtain your records
electronically, for even greater
safety and convenience. If your
plan does have a pharmacy in the
temporary location, don’t forget
to bring your prescription card,
so your medications can be paid
for just like at home. If not, keep
all of your receipts so you can be
repaid.

Learn More
You can learn more about med-

ication at the Academy of Man-
aged Care Pharmacy Web site:
www.amcp.org.

Putting Medications On Your Packing List

If you take medication regularly,
don’t forget to pack it whenever
you travel.

by the experts at the National 
Diabetes Education Program
(NAPSA)—Being on vacation

doesn’t mean you should forget
your healthy food choices and
physical activity routine. If you’re
at risk for type 2 diabetes, plan
how to fit physical activity and
healthy food choices into your
travel plans. The key is small
steps that lead to big rewards—
you don’t have to knock yourself
out to prevent diabetes.

When you’re not preparing
your own food, it can be a chal-
lenge to make healthy food
choices. Take time to look over the
menu and check if it shows the
calorie content of a meal. Ask
about portion sizes and request
that foods be prepared with less
salt and no added fat. 

Healthy eating tips:
• Order first so others don’t

influence your choices. 
• Order a small or half-portion

meal or have an appetizer as a
main meal.

• Order a salad to start and
share a main dish. 

• Choose steamed, grilled, or
broiled foods instead of those that
are fried or sautéed.

• Order salad dressing, gravy,
sauces, or spreads “on the side”
and eat a small amount.

• It’s okay to share a dessert
once in awhile. Make healthier
food choices such as fresh fruit or
low-fat or fat-free yogurt. 

• Drink water or skim or low-
fat milk instead of sweetened
juices or soda. 

• If you drink alcohol, choose
wine or light beer. Avoid mixed
drinks. 

To avoid fast-food drive-
throughs, pack a healthy snack
such as a cooler of fresh fruit;

sliced, raw vegetables; fat-free or
low-fat yogurt; and bottled water
instead of sweetened soda or juice.
Bring dried fruit, nuts, and seeds
to snack on. Since these foods can
be high in calories, measure out
small portions (1⁄4 cup) in advance. 

Choose a fun, active vacation.
Go biking, camping, hiking or
canoeing. Swim, take a long walk,
or play a game at the beach. Walk
a few extra blocks instead of tak-
ing a taxi. Spend the evening
dancing. During long road trips,
include time for a walk every few
hours. Include at least 30 minutes
of physical activity each day. 

Being physically active and
making healthy food choices while
on vacation can help you prevent
or delay type 2 diabetes. To learn
more about diabetes prevention
and to order a free copy of “Your
GAME PLAN to Prevent Type 2
Diabetes,” contact the National
Diabetes Education Program at
www.ndep.nih.gov or call (800)
438-5383. 

The U.S. Department of Health
and Human Services’ National
Diabetes Education Program is
jointly sponsored by the National
Institutes of Health (NIH) and the
Centers for Disease Control and
Prevention (CDC), with the sup-
port of more than 200 partner
organizations.

Preventing Type 2 Diabetes When You’re On-The-Go

(NAPSA)—High summer tem-
peratures and lack of moisture
cause most lawns to go dormant.
For helpful lawn-care tips, visit
lawndoctor.com or call 1.800.4.
LAWNDR (1.800.452.9637).

**  **  **
The first annual National

Thank You Day launches with a
contest to search for one small
deed that deserves one big thank-
you. One grand-prize winner will
be awarded a prize with a value
of up to $20,000. For details, visit
www.nationalthankyouday.com.

**  **  **
It’s easy to keep water out—

and mold and mildew away—by
painting your concrete basement
walls with two coats of a water-
proofer that contains mold and
mildew protection, like Watertite™

Mold & Mildew-Proof Waterproof-
ing Paint. For more information
and home improvement tips, visit
www.zinsser.com. 




