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(NAPS)—Traffic law enforce-
ment is a proven method of in-
creasing pedestrian safety, and
seat belt, child safety seat and
helmet use; reducing the inci-
dence of impaired and aggressive
driving; and increasing the appre-
hension of dangerous criminals.

In recent years, the public has
been made aware of incidents that
have occurred between citizens
and law enforcement during traf-
fic stops. Most of these incidents
were positive and did much to
advance the public’s perception of
law enforcement. Some incidents
were negative, disturbing, and
created public mistrust.

The following tips discuss what
is expected of citizens and law
enforcement during a traffic stop.
Understanding what is expected
from both parties improves com-
munication, helps to reduce anxi-
eties and improves the public’s
understanding about the need for
traffic law enforcement. Improved
communication is also the first
step in eliminating community-
based divisiveness and creating
community-based partnerships.

If you are a motorist:
• Invoke the “Golden Rule.”

Treat the officer the way you
would like to be treated.

• Remember that you are re-
quired to cooperate with all rea-
sonable requests that law enforce-
ment personnel make.

• If an officer signals for you to
stop, remain calm and pull over
safely.

• Be prepared to produce your
driver ’s license and other docu-
ments, based on the laws in your
jurisdiction.

• Remain in the vehicle unless
the officer tells you otherwise.

• Keep your hands visible.
• If you are stopped by a non-

uniformed officer in an unmarked
vehicle, you can ask the officer for
identification.

• If you believe the reason for
the stop is vague or unclear, you
can ask the officer the details.

• If you are uncomfortable
about stopping because an area is
deserted or not well-lit, explain
this to the officer and ask if you
can proceed to a more populated
or better illuminated place.

• Procedural questions and
complaints about an officer ’s
treatment of you can be forwarded
to the officer’s supervisor.

• Don’t speed, drive aggres-
sively or drive while you are im-
paired. Always wear your seat belt
and correctly buckle up any chil-
dren who are riding with you.
Yield to pedestrians when they
have the right-of-way. If you fol-
low all traffic laws, you reduce
your chances that the police will
stop you.

• Try to find the “positive” in
the traffic stop. Use the informa-
tion you have received to make
yourself a better motorist.

If you are a law enforce-
ment officer:

• Invoke the “Golden Rule.”
Treat the motorist the way you
would like to be treated.

• State your name and identify
the law enforcement agency for
which you work.

• Explain the reason for the
traffic stop, state the action you
will take and be prepared to
answer the motorist’s questions
about the stop.

• If you are not in uniform, or
you are traveling in an unmarked
vehicle, you must present identifi-
cation to the person you have
stopped.

• Consider the traffic stop
“environment.” Some motorists
may be uncomfortable stopping in
a deserted or badly lighted area,
and may feel more comfortable if
you allow them to proceed to a
more populated or better illumi-
nated location.

• Be courteous and firm—but
flexible.

• Understand that a traffic
stop can be a frightening experi-
ence for a motorist, and fear can
bring out a person’s worst side.

• Try to find the “positive” in
the traffic stop. Use this opportu-
nity to inform and educate.

Improving Communications
At The Traffic Stop

Traffic stops can be more con-
genial when both parties under-
stand and respect each other.

Balanced Nutrition
(NAPS)—In her new book, The

Living Beauty Detox Program: The
Revolutionary Diet for Each and
Every Season of a Woman’s Life
(HarperSanFrancisco, $13), author
Ann Louise Gittleman reveals all
and shares diet and nutritional
techniques for looking good and
feeling good.

This respected nutritionist has
developed a diet that combines
the latest science with natural
healing practices. Gittleman
shows how to eat right, cleanse
yourself of toxins, and manage
your hormones to bring out your
best looks.

One of the highlights of The
Living Beauty Detox is the
remarkable Fat Flush Diet. In
only two weeks, following this diet
begins to clear away the many
beauty-dulling toxins that accu-
mulate in the body’s fat stores.
The results are dramatic: radiant
hair, skin, and nails; more energy
than you ever thought you’d have;
and, of course, the extra pounds
disappear.

The Living Beauty Detox Pro-
gram is available at local book-
stores nationwide.

A new book helps women of
all ages determine their “sea-
sonal type” to look and feel their
best.

(NAPS)—Fewer than half of
American parents read to their
infants and toddlers regularly, even
though a study says hearing a story
read aloud can stimulate brain cell
growth in young children.

According to a report by the
Carnegie Corporation, reading can
make little ones feel secure and
loved while they learn pre-reading
skills and begin to recognize let-
ters and words.

One of the Top 5 TV shows for
preschoolers is a PBS KIDS hit
called Caillou (pronounced kai-
you), based on a book series of the
same name. Now, a Caillou toy line
based on the TV series and book
has been created for preschoolers
by Irwin Toy. Just as reading aloud
helps in brain development, these
toys can help young children
develop their fine motor skills.

Caillou chronicles the adven-
tures of a little boy named Cail-
lou, say the show’s producers. His
experiences portray the relation-
ship between small children and
the world around them. Children
aged 2 to 5 see Caillou as a real
little boy to whom they can easily
relate. 

The show’s producer, CINAR,
in association with PBS, devel-
oped stories to help children
develop self-esteem, confidence
and independence. Research by
famed child psychologist Nicole
Nadeau guide the producers of
Caillou, which Child magazine
called “one of the best new
preschool series,” and the LA
Times called “a virtual guide book
for parents and caregivers.” The
TV series features a combination
of animation, puppets, music,
dance and live action.

An article in Early Childhood
News notes that play is the work of
children, providing the ultimate
curriculum for social, physical and
mental advancement as they accu-
mulate the basic knowledge needed

to learn language, math, science
and art.

Caillou toys, books and TV sto-
ries help fulfill America’s goal to
have children reading by the end of
third grade, a goal so important
that The American Academy of
Pediatrics wants to incorporate a
prescription for reading into stan-
dard pediatric care.

The Caillou game and toy line
brings Caillou’s world to life in
three dimensions. Fun interaction
between parent and child, such as
playing with Caillou puzzles and
board games, stimulates children’s
development and begins to teach
children the rules of life. 

The Caillou Discovery Game
teaches preschoolers about win-
ning and losing. The puzzles teach
them to observe and recognize
shape correlations. Caillou’s Flip
N’ Match, improves memory skills.
With the plush and two-inch Cail-
lou beanie, children can create and
act out their own adventures,
along with their TV pal.

By offering a four year old’s
perspective, Caillou helps parents
understand a child’s psychological
and emotional development, just
as he helps children learn how to
express themselves.

Caillou information is available
on the Web at www.pbskids.org/
caillou and www.irwintoy.com.

Reading To Preschoolers Opens World Of Words

A favorite book character has
inspired new toys.

(NAPS)—Time is money. So,
finding a way to save time paying
your bills could be considered
money in the bank, right?

The average person receives
ten to 13 bills every month and
the time it takes to pay these bills
is a valuable commodity. A recent
survey found that 51 percent of
those who responded to the survey
spent between 30 minutes and
more than two hours paying bills
every month.

Fortunately, there are alterna-
tives. It is possible to have your
monthly bills, such as cable, tele-
phone, rent, insurance and health
club membership, paid automati-
cally with your Visa® credit or
debit card. The advantage: one
bill with your complete record of
payment. Paying bills this way
means there’s less chance of for-
getting and less chance of incur-
ring late charges. There’s also the
added benefit of earning reward
points if you have a co-branded
card. Plus, bills are always paid
on time, safely and securely,
backed by Visa’s Zero Liability
consumer protection policies.

Automatic payment is quickly
becoming the more popular, conve-
nient way to pay as lives continue
to grow more hectic and time
becomes more valuable. 

Here’s how you can start an
automatic bill payment plan:

• Identify the bills paid on a

regular basis.
• Contact each company’s cus-

tomer service representative to
see if they offer automatic bill
payment.

• If not, make sure to express
your interest in such a program
and ask to be notified when they
begin one; more and more pro-
grams are starting each day.

• If the company does offer an
automatic billing program,
request an automatic payment
plan using Visa.

• Check your monthly state-
ment after establishing the pay-
ment plan to make sure the auto-
matic payment has begun and pay
one consolidated bill instead of
several.

• Spend more time doing the
things you want to do, not the
things you have to do.

The Check Is Not In The Mail Anymore

Paying bills with a credit card
helps reduce the chances of for-
getting or paying late charges.

(NAPS)—When your car is
repaired after a crash, using origi-
nal equipment manufacturer
(OEM) parts can save you time
and money. A recent survey by
Industrial Marketing Research
found that on average, using
after-market parts (unauthorized
imitations of OEM parts)
increases repair time by 26 per-
cent because of their poor fit.
Increased repair time leads to
more time without your vehicle
and increased rental car bills.

The Bonneville SSEi recently
outperformed some pretty classy
competition (Chrysler 300M,
Lexus GS300 and Lincoln LS) in
key acceleration tests held under
strict testing procedures. In simu-
lated highway merging (0-60 mph
sprints) the SSEi is reported to
have shown its competition noth-
ing but taillight. 

New York Times best-selling
author Debbie Macomber revisits
small-town America in 16 Light-
house Road, her new novel from
MIRA Books ($6.99). Drawn with

the deft hand that has made the
author a leading voice in women’s
fiction, the characters are warm,
humorous and poignant. With this
first title in a new trilogy, the
author introduces her readers to
the citizens of Cedar Cove, Wash-
ington, a picturesque Northwest
harbor town. As the central char-
acter, family court judge Olivia
Lockhart invites readers into her
world, introducing her family,
friends and neighbors, revealing
their stories and—sometimes—
even their secrets.

Liz Claiborne ’s Love Is Not
Abuse Program at www.lizclai
borne.com/loveisnotabuse.
The Consumer Protection Associ-
ation of America at www.con
sumerpro.com.
The Business Roundtable at
www.brt.org.
The United Arab Emirates at
www.emirates.org.
Dunkin Donuts at www.dunkin
donuts.com.
500 Plus  at www.500plus.com.
GetSmart at www.getsmart.
com.
Toshiba’s 1.8-inch hard disk drive
at www.harddrives.toshiba.com.
FEMA for Kids Web site at
www.fema.gov/kids.

Check Out
These Web Sites:

***
Choose the life that is most use-
ful, and habit will make it the
most agreeable.

—Francis Bacon
***


