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(NAPSA)—Do you have furni-
ture that’s an eyesore, but you
can’t stand the thought of getting
rid of it? Or, perhaps it’s a chair or
toy chest you’d like to personalize
for a parent or child? Most people
have at least one piece of furni-
ture they’d like to give a facelift.
Below are some ideas to turn bor-
ing into beautiful:

Decorate it—Use stencils and
sponges to create fun designs on
surfaces. Stencil flowers and but-
terflies on a drab storage chest for
garden tools or create depth and
texture on an old hutch with some
paint and a sponge. Hand-painted
designs add a personal touch to
any object, while also adding style
and elegance to the decor. 

Distress it—Give items like
dressers and bookcases a hint of
sophistication and age by distress-
ing the surface. Paint a base coat
on the object and then age it with
a second color. Using a rag, wipe a
bit of the second color on the cor-
ners and edges. Then, using a
paintbrush, fling tiny speckles of
paint everywhere. This will give
your furniture a stylish, yet aged
look. 

Personalize it—Add a unique
touch to any room with personal-
ized furnishings. Paint an old
rocking chair for the nursery—
add baby’s name or birth date to
create a special place to rock the
bundle-of-joy to sleep. Or, paint a
child’s desk with letters of the
alphabet or numbers to create a
cozy place to study or color—not
only will this make the child’s
workspace fun, but it will also
encourage learning.

Restore it—If you are not
ready to make a drastic change to
a piece of furniture, but it is start-
ing to look dull, restore it. Re-
paint or re-stain the piece to bring

it back to its original state and
beauty. This will bring a fresh,
new look to the piece, while carry-
ing on the tradition of the object.

Tile it—Add beauty and color
to boring tables and chairs with
mosaic-tiled artwork. Using bro-
ken pieces of tile and stained
glass, create a design of your
choice, adhering each piece with
super glue. A good super glue to
try is Loctite® Gel—a unique,
“squeeze-grip” dispensing system
gives users complete control of
glue flow, so there’s no need to
worry about super glue dripping
into unwanted places. Next, use a
grout to fill in the space between
tiles. For complete instructions to
create your own mosaic piece, visit
www.loctiteonhgtv.com.

Whether you want to give old
furniture a new look or give a spe-
cial person a unique gift, sprucing
up and decorating pieces adds
style and elegance to any decor.
For more information, visit
www.loctiteonhgtv.com or call
800/321-0253. 

Tips On Sprucing Up Old Furniture

One way to turn boring into
beautiful is to decorate your old
furniture with mosaic-tiled art-
work.

(NAPSA)—As part of its 50th
anniversary, America’s leading
sports weekly is hitting the road
to celebrate the best of sports.

America’s Sports Illustrated: 50
Years, 50 States, 50 Sports is a
year-long celebration that will
touch people of all ages, in every
state, between July 2003 and July
2004. For 50 consecutive weeks,
fans can follow the program
through the vast editorial cover-
age in the magazine, extended
coverage on SI.com, by visiting
the interactive mobile tour stop-
ping at sporting events across the
country, and a community sports
outreach program.

To bring its readers closer to
the sports action and history in
each state, SI is delivering a
series of 50 state-specific sections
in the magazine. Each week, the
publication will profile a different
state and identify the unique
events, historical figures and
memorable moments that make
up that state’s sports culture.

Bringing the celebration to life
for millions across the country
will be the Toyota Presents Sports
Illustrated’s 50th Anniversary
Tour, a football field-size interac-
tive extravaganza. Crisscrossing
the country, the Tour’s schedule
(available on SI.com/50) mirrors
the magazine’s coverage and fea-
tures sporting events as diverse as
the All-American Soap Box Derby
in Ohio and the Cheyenne Fron-
tier Days Rodeo in Wyoming.

There’s something for everyone
at the mobile experience, including:

• Toyota Field: Home of SI’s
Greatest Moments in Sports hosts
a short film documenting the most
memorable sports moments of the
past 50 years.

• The Starter All-American
Teen Headquarters offers several
interactive activities and recog-
nizes a young man or woman from
each state who participates in
athletics and inspires others off
the field.

• Best Buy’s Best Seat in the
House allows sports fans to expe-
rience “sports” in the ultimate

comfortable, yet advanced, digital
and technological setting.

• An SI Cyberimaging station
invites guests to get their picture
on the cover of SI.

For most athletes and fans,
sports begin at a young age on the
neighborhood fields, courts, rinks,
pools or tracks. Two organizations
that lead the nation in providing
these youth sports facilities are
SI’s 50th anniversary community
sports partners, the YMCA and
the National Recreation and Park
Association. Sports Illustrated is
working to enhance the quality of
sports in America’s communities
through alliances with these two
organizations.

Fans are able to purchase a six-
month subscription to either Sports
Illustrated or Sports Illustrated For
Kids for $10 while SI is celebrating
each state. Sports Illustrated will
return 100 percent of the subscrip-
tion revenue to the subscriber’s
local Y. The offer is available on the
Tour or via the Internet at
SI.com/50 or YMCA.net.

Through local parks and recre-
ation agencies, 50 Sports Illus-
trated Sportstowns—one from
each state—are being selected,
recognized in the magazine and
presented with a cash grant.

For more information about
America’s Sports Illustrated: 50
Years, 50 States, 50 Sports, visit
SI.com/50.

Celebrating Sports In Communities Across America

A nationwide tour is celebrat-
ing the 50th anniversary of a pop-
ular sports magazine.

OF SPORTS

(NAPSA)—Homeowners can
increase their chances of a great
looking lawn next spring by win-
terizing their lawn this fall.

Weed control, fertilizing, mow-
ing, raking and aerating are all
important steps to ensure a desir-
able lawn in the years to come,
advises Briggs & Stratton’s Yard
Doctor Trey Rogers, Ph.D., a turf-
grass expert who serves as a con-
sultant to the engine manufacturer.

“Many of the lawn care trou-
bles homeowners face in the
spring, like weeds and poor grass
growth, can be avoided by better
preparing the lawn for winter,”
says Dr. Rogers.

Tips from the Yard Doctor on
how to best winterize the lawn
include:

• Control broadleaf weeds such
as the dreaded dandelion in early
fall when they germinate. Apply a
regular broadleaf herbicide at a
low rate because the weeds are
still quite small.

• Fertilize in the fall because
when a lawn goes dormant in the
winter, well-nourished roots will
continue to grow in soil tempera-
tures above 35 degrees.

• If grass will be covered by a
blanket of snow in the winter, cut
the grass a bit shorter than one-
third of the grass blade at the end
of the mowing season. This will
remove leaf blades that turn
brown and go dormant during the
winter. It will also make the yard
look greener earlier in the spring.

• When raking, remove large
piles of leaves, twigs and other
debris from the lawn. These ele-
ments break down slowly, suffo-
cating the lawn and contributing

to rot, mold and other diseases.
Grind up leaves and return them
to the lawn to add nutrients to the
soil.

• Aerate in the fall to help
break up compacted soil and
remove excess thatch, allowing
fertilizer nutrients, sunlight and
air to infiltrate the soil. 

“Remember that too much or
too little of something isn’t always
a good thing,” says Dr. Rogers.
“The right combination of weed
control, fertilizing, mowing, rak-
ing and aerating will help ensure
that the lawn is ready for next
spring and looking better than
ever.”

Visit www.yarddoctor.com for
more tips, including region-specific
advice. 

Preparing The Lawn For Winter Leads To A Beautiful Spring

Yard Doctor Trey Rogers rec-
ommends removing twigs and
other debris from the lawn before
winter to ensure a healthy, beau-
tiful lawn in the spring.

(NAPSA)—According to ex-
perts at the Peter Coppola Salon
in New York City, it’s a good idea
to look for hair care products with
soy proteins and UV protectants.
For example, the new TRESemmé
Total Colour Care shampoos and
conditioners are specially devel-
oped to add twice the shine to col-
ored hair and address the needs
of women with different types of
color-treated hair. Formulated
with citrus extracts, the Total
Colour Care Healthy Highlights
shampoo and conditioner gently
cleanse and condition to keep
blonde and highlighted hair
bright. The Total Colour Care
Vibrant Color is formulated with
UV Protectants to keep darker,
colored hair looking rich and
vibrant. To learn more, visit
www.tresemme.com.

To make skin radiant during
warmer weather, you need to
exfoliate,  recommends Didi
Gluck, beauty director at Marie
Claire. You can do this daily if
you use a gentle exfoliator with
natural exfoliants. Cosmopolitan
experts suggest you exfoliate
your body dry before you get in
the shower to rinse off. A dry
exfoliation, before you shower,
will work to slough off the dry,
flaky, skin. You may want to try
St. Ives® Invigorating Apricot
Scrub, which uses 100 percent
natural exfoliants.

It is widely assumed that
Henry Ford invented the automo-
bile. Although false (the automo-
bile was conceived and born in
Europe in the late 1800s), this
popular misconception is a tribute
to the man who dreamed of build-
ing reliable automobiles that mil-
lions could afford. Ford, the
world’s second largest automaker,
will celebrate its 100th anniver-
sary this year with a variety of
activities and events. For more
information, visit  www.ford.com.

***
The ideal man bears the accidents of life with dignity and grace,
making the best of the circumstances.

—Aristotle
***

***
A classic is a book that survives
the circumstances that made it
possible, yet alone keeps those
circumstances alive.

—Alfred Kazin
***

***
There is one thing stronger than
all the armies in the world, and
that is an idea whose time has
come.

—Victor Hugo
***

***
True hope is swift, and flies with swallow’s wings. Kings it makes
gods, and meaner creatures kings.

—William Shakespeare
***

***
The natural flights of the human mind are not from pleasure to
pleasure, but from hope to hope.

—Samuel Johnson
***




