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(NAPSA)—As more and more
American consumers are taking a
vested interest in the quality of
the health care they receive,
Medicare is helping them get the
information they need. 

Because it understands the im-
portance of both consumer
involvement and quality improve-
ment, Medicare offers free access
to “Compare” tools on its Web site,
www.medicare.gov, and arranges
for health care quality experts,
known as Quality Improvement
Organizations, or QIOs, to help
health care providers. 

Consumer Involvement 
The “Compare” tools are a good

first step in the decision-making
process when you or a loved one
needs care. They provide quality of
care information about hospitals,
nursing homes, home health agen-
cies and kidney dialysis facilities,
as well as information to help you
find the right prescription drug
plan if you use Medicare. You can
rest assured the information you
see is based on the best science
available to the U.S. government,
and it is routinely enhanced and
updated to reflect the latest qual-
ity data. After reviewing the qual-
ity measures and information on
the Web site, you should have a
conversation with the provider
that interests you and talk with

your physician. 
Quality Improvement 

Health care providers do their
best to keep up with the latest
techniques and best practices. 

With increasing workloads,
however, many providers may
struggle just to keep up with
demands in providing treatment
and routine care. 

Fortunately, Medicare can help
there, too. The health care quality
experts at QIOs in every state and
territory in the country help make
sure providers have the informa-
tion resources to provide the right
care to every person every time. 

For the next three years, QIOs
will be working with health care
professionals to help them im-
prove their performance on the
quality measures featured on
Medicare’s Web site. The QIOs’
services range from providing per-
sonalized, on-site clinical quality
improvement assistance to activi-
ties as simple as distributing
information on the latest care
practices. 

Through the combination of
health care providers’ commitment
to quality and the assistance of the
QIOs, you can expect hospital
treatments will be safer, with
fewer errors, resulting in fewer
infections after surgery. In physi-
cian offices, QIOs help doctors give

better care than ever to patients by
using technology to help track
their treatment histories. 

In nursing homes, residents will
have less of a chance of being sub-
jected to physical restraints or the
pain and discomfort of bedsores. 

Meanwhile, patients receiving
home health care after a hospital
stay will be assured that agencies
are working with QIOs on ways to
reduce the likelihood that they’ll
need to return to the hospital. 

As part of their work, QIOs
help providers report the informa-
tion consumers use on the “Com-
pare” sites at www.medicare.gov. 

The information is updated
regularly so viewers can feel confi-
dent that the questions they
might ask of a provider will be
based on the latest reliable data. 

For those without Internet
access, 1-800-MEDICARE (800-
633-4227) is available for assis-
tance. Medicare and its QIOs are
committed to improving the qual-
ity of American health care. With
the help of consumers, and by
working together, the vision of the
right care for every person every
time can get closer to reality. 

This information has been pro-
vided by the Centers for Medicare
& Medicaid Services, an agency of
the U.S. Department of Health
and Human Services.

The Right Care For Every Person, Every Time
A Little Change

A Lot Of Tips
(NAPSA)—When was the last

time you looked at the bottom of
your golf shoes? If the answer is
never, you’re not alone. With
metal spikes now virtually obso-
lete in golf, even ardent golfers
who have switched to plastic
cleats never stop to check if those
cleats need changing. 

Now, the company that in-
vented plastic cleats is giving you
12 big reasons to change. In addi-
tion to providing great traction,
which is essential to a proper golf
swing, if you buy a set of Soft-
spikes® Pulsar™ cleats in 2006, you
will receive a 12-month subscrip-
tion to Golf Digest®, the premier
publication in golf. 

Not only does it feature top
travel, equipment and TOUR
news, it offers great instruction
tips, such as simple rules for a
better short game; keys to break-
ing 100; and how to get out of the
deep rough. 

For more information, log on to
www.pulsarcleats.com. 

Golfers can improve their trac-
tion, and their swing, with new
cleats and free advice.

Powerful Cranberries  
(NAPSA)—Science offers some

great news for the 20 percent of
women who, according to the
National Center for Health Statis-
tics, will develop a urinary tract
infection in their lifetime.  

Cranberries have long been
used to combat bladder infections
and to maintain urinary tract
health. Now, one supplement man-
ufacturer is making things easier
for women by providing high
potency cranberry extract in one
little pill. Nature’s Bounty Triple
Strength Natural Cranberry is
carefully manufactured under the
highest quality standards. Instead
of having to find lots of cranberries
and oranges for vitamin C and
other important nutrients, you can
try a supplement that delivers
over 1,040 mg of cranberry blend
and three times the daily value
(200 mg) of vitamin C for powerful
antioxidant and immune sup-
port—all in only two softgels per
day.

For more information visit
www.naturesbounty.com or call
(800) 433-2990.

Cranberries are known for their
ability to support urinary health.

(NAPSA)—One of the Depart-
ment of Veterans Affairs’ (VA)
highest priorities is ensuring that
America’s 24 million veterans are
aware of the benefits available to
them as a result of their military
service. 

VA is reaching out particularly
to veterans who have an injury or
medical condition they believe is
related to their active military
service to encourage them to con-
tact their local VA regional office
for information about the VA Dis-
ability Compensation Program. 

VA wants to do everything pos-
sible for the nation’s newest veter-
ans coming home from Iraq and
Afghanistan, and also make sure
that the veterans who served in
earlier periods, wartime or peace-
time, are not overlooked. Even
veterans of conflicts long past who
have never filed a claim for dis-
ability benefits may still be eligi-
ble, and VA regional office employ-
ees across the nation can assist
them. 

Veterans who received a VA
disability compensation rating
many years ago and whose ser-
vice-related disabilities have pro-
gressed in severity should also
contact their local regional office
for assistance in submitting a
claim for increased benefits. 

VA efforts to inform veterans
about their disability compensa-
tion benefits face a special chal-
lenge with older veterans who
may not have been in touch with
VA for decades, or who may not be
aware of the entire range of
expanded veterans’ benefits avail-

able to them or their families.
Veterans should not hesitate to

contact VA and apply for the bene-
fits they have earned in service to
our country. While VA cannot
guarantee that all benefits claims
will be granted, VA cannot grant
benefits unless veterans file or
reopen their claims. 

Veterans and their families
may call the VA toll free at 800-
827-1000 or visit the veterans
benefits Web site at http://www.
vba.va.gov/. Claims for disability
compensation or other benefits
may be filed in person, electroni-
cally, or by mail. 

VA also encourages veterans
to seek assistance from the vari-
ous national, state and local vet-
erans groups and service organi-
zations. Information on veterans
organizations can be obtained at
h t t p : / / w w w 1 . v a . g o v / v s o /  o r
http://www.va.gov/partners/state
office/index.htm. 

VA Reaches Out To Veterans Of All Generations

(NAPSA)—My fondest memo-
ries of the seasons involve food.
What could be better than a thick
slice of a vine-ripe tomato, sprin-
kled with fresh basil and drizzled
with olive oil? Or a crunchy apple
fresh from the orchard? Eating is
so enjoyable when we get in touch
with the flavor of food.

Here’s an easy
way to savor the fla-
vor—taste every
bite. Each type of
food has its own
unique flavor. For
example, foods made
with whole grain
such as Whole Grain

Total® cereal have a nut-like, rich
taste not found in refined grains.
“You can ease your taste buds into
the flavor of whole grain by gradu-
ally trying new foods. Set a goal of
trying one new food made with
whole grain a week. Then start
substituting foods on a daily
basis—instead of your regular
choice, experiment with a whole-
grain food choice. Soon whole-
grain foods will be a regular part
of your diet,” suggests Joanne
Slavin, Ph.D., a professor at the
University of Minnesota and
expert on whole grain.

Keep in mind that foods should
please all the senses. “Taste,
appearance and texture affect a
food’s appeal, as well as its nutri-
tion,” says Dr. Robert Henkin,
M.D., founder of the Taste and
Smell Clinic in Washington, D.C.
“For example, a bowl of cereal
made with whole grain, along
with skim milk and fruit, makes a
visually attractive, crunchy, and
flavorful meal.”

Sense of taste and smell natu-
rally diminishes in many older
adults. Others may lose the sense
of taste as a result of medications,
long-term illness or viruses. When
foods become harder to taste,
herbs, spices and condiments can
be added to bring out their flavor.
Supermarkets and gourmet stores
also sell concentrated flavors, in
the form of jellies and sauces, as
well as flavor enhancers such as
regular and low-sodium bouillon
cubes and broth. 

Flavor can also be enhanced by
including fruits and vegetables in
mixed dishes. Dr. Henkin notes
that in addition to being naturally
low in salt and fat, they are an
important and flavorful aspect of
healthy eating.

Ask Mindy
Q: Food doesn’t have much

flavor to me anymore, but I
keep eating it. I’m afraid I’m
going to gain weight. What
should I do? 

A: First, add flavor with fresh
herbs and condiments such as
lemon juice. Resist the temptation
to add extra salt and sugar. Then,
make your food more appealing
with colorful fruits and vegeta-
bles. Remember to eat slowly and
to stop eating when you feel full.

Savor The Flavor
To enhance flavor:
Lemon juice on grilled fish
Sesame oil, low-sodium soy sauce on 
vegetables
Low-sodium chicken broth in rice
Peppermint slivers on fruit salad
Fresh berries on Total® with strawberries 
cereal 

Mindy Hermann
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(NAPSA)—Sleep disturbances
may in fact be a symptom of a
larger problem, especially if they
are associated with irritability
and mood swings. The Depression
and Bipolar Support Alliance
(DBSA) has launched a new Web
site, www.sleeplessinamerica.org,
which offers educational re-
sources including a self-screener
for sleeplessness, information on
why sleep is so important, when
to see a doctor and a question-
naire to help determine when
sleeplessness might be sympto-

matic of a more serious illness.
The Web site is also available in
Spanish. For additional informa-
tion on depression and bipolar
disorder, confidential self-screen-
ers for both illnesses and the loca-
tion of a support group near you,
visit DBSA’s site at www.dbsal
liance.org or call (800) 826-3632.




