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Eagles Take To
Wisconsin’s Winter Skies

(NAPSA)—Well known for such
things as the Green Bay Packers
and cheese, Wisconsin is turning
heads, and binoculars, for another
r e a s o n  t h e s e  d a y s .  T h a n k s  
to  abundant  winter  f ishing,
Wisconsin is home to the largest
population of wintering bald
eagles in North America, provid-
ing rare opportunities for bird
watchers from throughout the
country.

Sauk City and Prairie du Sac
are among the state’s top eagle-
watching spots. The waters of the
Wisconsin River flowing below the
Prairie du Sac dam seldom freeze,
making fish available for the birds.
Staffed by volunteers who provide
insight into the eagles, the Eagle
Overlook in Prairie du Sac offers
one of the most spectacular views
of the area’s winter residents.

Cassville, located along the
Mississippi River, is another pop-
ular eagle-watching spot. Top
viewing locations include a new
wildlife observation deck at River-
side Park and nearby Nelson
Dewey State Park.  

For more information on eagle
and bird watching in Wisconsin and
a free copy of The Great Wisconsin
Birding Guide and Nature Trail,
contact the Wisconsin Department
of Tourism at 1-800-432-TRIP or
visit travelwisconsin.com.

(NAPSA)—The charitable gifts
of an international Catholic ser-
vice organization reached all-time
record highs in 2003. The finan-
cial donations of its 1.7 million
members—known for their com-
mitment to charitable works—
totaled $130 million. Members
also performed over 61 million
hours of volunteer service. 

According to the Knights of
Columbus’ annual Survey of Frater-
nal Activity, Knights at all levels
reported raising and contributing to
charity $130 million—$1.5 million
more than the previous year. 

The total includes $21.5 million
disbursed by the Knights’ interna-
tional office through various foun-
dations, including funds ear-
marked for the pope, Christians in
the Holy Land and the programs
of the bishops’ conferences of the
United States, Canada and Mex-
ico, among others. 

In 2003 the Knights partnered
with the Wheelchair Foundation
to send several thousand wheel-
chairs to land mine victims and
people with disabilities in
Afghanistan and other Middle
Eastern countries. 

Additionally, working with the
Archdiocese for the Military Ser-
vices, USA, the Knights published
200,000 copies of a Catholic
prayer book for U.S. troops sta-
tioned in Iraq, Afghanistan and
elsewhere.

“Charity is the first lesson a
member learns when he joins the
Knights, and these figures show
how much that means to him,” said
Carl A. Anderson, supreme knight
of the Catholic fraternal benefit
society and chief executive officer.

Knights of Columbus gifts went

beyond money, as members
reported volunteering an all-time
high of 61 million hours of time in
2003. 

“We are committed to our
communities,” said Anderson.
“Whether it is volunteering at
Special Olympics games, visiting
veterans in hospitals, or helping
out in our local Catholic parishes
and schools, we seek to better the
lives of our neighbors.” 

The Knights of Columbus is the
largest Catholic family fraternal
service organization. It offers top-
rated life insurance and related
products to its members and their
families through approximately
1,500 Knights of Columbus agents. 

Through its more than 15,000
local units, it offers a wide variety
of opportunities for volunteer ser-
vice to the church and community.
Founded in New Haven, Conn., in
1882, the Knights of Columbus
has members throughout North
America, the Philippines and sev-
eral other countries. 

To learn more, visit the Web
site at www.kofc.org.

Service Organization Breaks Its Record For Giving

Members of the largest Catholic
family fraternal service organiza-
tion gave 61 million hours of their
time in 2003.

(NAPSA)—Army Reserve sol-
diers, who specialize in convoy
operations, are the Army’s main
source of combat support forces,
with a significant focus on logis-
tics. Each day, Army Reserve sol-
diers transport thousands of
pounds of supplies such as food
and water, ammunition and fuel
to U.S. forces in highly volatile
areas and isolated outposts
throughout Iraq. Thus, it has
become increasingly necessary
that troops receive state-of-the-
art training in convoy operations
before deployment so that they
can remain safe in-theater while
accomplishing their missions. For
more information on Army, go to
GoArmy.com.

If keeping the inside of your car
clean is important to you, then it
makes sense to keep the engine clean
too. Leaks and other problems are
easier to find if the engine com-
partment is clean, too. A clean engine
will also run cooler, according to
automotive experts. There are engine
cleaners and degreasers designed
specifically for this task. Make sure
to follow the manufacturer’s direc-
tions. Afterwards, use disposable
SCOTT

® Shop Towels to wipe up any
grease or oil residue. 

The newest use for “crystal”
balls is as a unique portal for
party fun, dispensing jokes, illu-
sions and holograms. Great for
bringing your imagination to life.
Spencer Gifts offers three DVDs
that do just that. All you need is a
TV and DVD player to make
heads appear to float in the air,
see pictures move within por-

traits, allow centerpieces to talk
at your table, have images move
within a fireplace, make monsters
spout off toe-tingling one-liners
and whatever else your imagina-
tion can dream up. By letting
these DVDs play at your next
party, you can intrigue, spellbind
and entertain your guests—all at
the same time. To learn more,
visit www.spencergifts.com.

According to the U.S. Depart-
ment of Education, 61 percent of
low-income families have no
books in their homes for their
children. Additionally, over 80
percent of the preschool and after-
school programs serving at-risk
children have no books at all. The
survey was sponsored by broker-
age firm TD Waterhouse, who
recently launched a nationwide
online book drive for disadvan-
taged children and youth. The
campaign was developed in part-
nership with First Book, a leading
literacy nonprofit organization,
and Aidmatrix. For more informa-
tion, visit www.firstbook.com.

(NAPSA)—The hours after
school can be a wonderful time to
enrich a child’s life—especially if
that child has a quality after-
school program to attend. Such
programs help keep kids safe,
inspire them to learn and help
working families. Some 14.3 mil-
lion kindergarten through 12th
graders take care of themselves
after the school day ends, accord-
ing to an Afterschool Alliance
study funded by The JCPenney
Afterschool Fund. For more infor-
mation, visit www.afterschool
alliance.org.

Two smart ways to learn more
about colleges are to visit the
campuses and to schedule inter-
views. Visits are the best way to
get a sense of how you’ll fit in
with the lifestyle of a campus.
Visiting also tells admissions offi-
cers that you have more than a
superficial interest in their school.
Bring a campus visit tip sheet
with you when you visit. One can
be found at www.Destination-
U.net. To learn more about cam-
pus visits and college interviews,
visit www.Destination-U.net.

College-Level Examination
Program can save students both
time and money. CLEP provides
thousands of students of all ages
with a unique opportunity to
demonstrate academic achieve-
ment through a program of rigor-
ous exams in introductory college-
level subjects. There are 2,900
colleges that grant credit for
CLEP exams. CLEP is adminis-
tered by the College Board, a not-
for-profit membership organiza-
tion. For more information, visit
www.collegeboard.com/clep.

A new law is changing the way

banks clear checks. The legisla-
tion—known as the Check Clear-
ing for the 21st Century Act, or
Check 21—will benefit consumers
through faster check clearing,
decreased fraud, less paper and
increased security. The law makes
it possible for banks to send—and
accept for clearing purposes—dig-
ital images of checks electroni-
cally. This eliminates the need to
physically transport checks
between banks. To learn more,
visit the America Bankers Associ-
ation at www.aba.com and click
on “Consumer Connection.”

The creative minds behind the
latest trends believe fragrances
have a powerful ability to reflect
the spirit and mood of their collec-
tions. For example, Carolina Her-
rera’s 212 Sexy seeks to expand
women’s self expression through
the art of fragrance, just as she
has done with her infectiously
charming fashions. Paco Rabanne
reinterprets his fashion ideals
through his newest launch, Pour
Elle. Meanwhile, Prada’s first fra-
grance, Prada, incorporates heady
and sensual amber, sandalwood,
patchouli, labdanum and the
vanilla-like benzoin for a feminine
and seductive elixir. 

(NAPSA)—This year, more and
more Americans are watching their
waistlines and wishing for desserts
that are lower in sugar but still
great tasting. The solution? Chefs
around the country are recom-
mending SPLENDA® No Calorie
Sweetener, as it allows for a little
indulgence in sweet cravings, with-
out all the added calories from
sugar. SPLENDA® has proven itself
to be a healthy alternative in cook-
ing and baking. It can be used
almost anywhere sugar is used
because it retains its sweetness
under high temperatures. At a time
of year when many tend to
overindulge, try baking healthier
desserts for the whole family that
still have great taste without the
extra sugar.

Broccoli Rabe, pronounced
“rob,” is making consumers take
notice as restaurant chefs explore
new ways to enjoy this flavorful,
nutrient-packed classic Italian
vegetable. Often described as a
cross between broccoli and mus-
tard greens, broccoli rabe adds a
zesty flavor to meals. As a mem-
ber of 5 A Day The Color Way’s
green group, broccoli rabe is an
excellent source of vitamins A and
C and a good source of folate, cal-
cium and dietary fiber. For broc-
coli rabe recipes and informa-
tion, visit www.andyboy.com; for
more information about 5 A Day
The Color Way, v is i t  www.
5aday.org and www.aboutpro
duce.com.

It may be easier than you
think to delight guests with an
elegant treat that’s usually found

in Paris. Much like France’s fla-
vorful wines and cheeses, coffee
lovers around the world have also
fallen for the country’s darkly
roasted coffees. Now, a company
that built its reputation by deliv-
ering fine European coffee direct
to consumers is introducing a cof-
fee said to offer the distinctive
taste of France—Gevalia French
Roast.  The darkest coffee offered
in the company’s family of fine
coffees, Gevalia French Roast, is
made from beans harvested in
Colombia and Brazil. To learn
more, visit www.gevalia.com.

Coupons aren’t just for soccer
moms; husbands, wives, moms,
dads and singles in every income
bracket use them. According to
the Promotion Marketing Associa-
tion Coupon Council, the typical
family or individual can save up
to $1,000 a year just by clipping
coupons for as little as 20 minutes
per week. Putting those savings
aside, consumers can easily
splurge on a luxury item or go on
a vacation getaway. For money-
saving coupon clip tips, visit www.
couponmonth.com.

(NAPSA)—Innovative new im-
plant technology with enough
durability and longevity is provid-
ing new joint replacement options
for aging baby boomers. The new
technology is a ceramic-on-ce-
ramic implant developed by
Stryker Orthopaedics. The artifi-
cial joint uses a ceramic material
that is second only to diamond in
hardness and has demonstrated
significantly lower wear versus
conventional joint systems in the
laboratory. It is expected that
these improved wear characteris-
tics will result in a longer-lasting
implant. If you suffer from joint
pain, see your doctor. To learn
more about various treatment
options available go to www.stry
kerceramics.com or call 1.888.
stryker.

If you are lactose intolerant,
look for nondairy foods fortified
with calcium that you can con-
sume daily. Many are readily
available and affordable, such as
orange juice and cereal. Calcium
supplements can help meet the
optimum level for calcium. Sup-
plements containing calcium
citrate, such as Citracal®, have
the convenient advantage of
being highly soluble. They can be
taken at any time, with or
without meals. Consider taking
calcium citrate with vitamin D
during the winter months or
when daily exposure to sunshine
is restricted. Vitamin D helps
absorption.




