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by Brian A. Gallagher
(NAPSA)—While contributing

to various relief funds is an essen-
tial element of our response to a
hurricane or other national
tragedy, money alone doesn’t fix
broken lives. What is needed is a
human-based response that
addresses the less obvious, but no
less significant challenges created
by the devastation.

What America needs to do now
in addressing the long-standing
challenges facing communities
nationwide is to think and act
beyond the traditional stimulus-
response formula to serving those
in need.

The current delivery system for
relief and social services is heroic
but clearly inadequate. A new sys-
tem, can have a long-term, posi-
tive effect on those in need. 

• Adopt a human-based ap-
proach. Contrary to the system-
or institution-based approach,
which often results in bureaucratic
gridlock because agencies require
clients to conform to their individ-
ual intake and service systems,
the human-based approach caters
to the needs of the affected person. 

• Operate from a master
plan. Community leaders need to
develop a comprehensive plan to
cover a broad scope of services
ranging from crisis counseling,
housing and daycare to cash assis-
tance, education and job training.
This same comprehensive approach
is no less valid for communities
seeking to eradicate teen preg-
nancy, drug use or illiteracy. 

• Integrate the delivery of
services. There’s a need for a sin-
gle source of information regarding

relief services. Congress should
establish an integrated nationwide
network to let service providers
seamlessly help those in need.

• Stay committed to a com-
munity’s long-term needs. We
need to resist the temptation to
shape programs and deploy
resources based on the day’s head-
lines. Agencies need to set long-
term goals and make the necessary
commitments to achieve them. 

• Create a $10 billion
Human Development Fund.
Let’s invest in rebuilding human
lives through mixed income hous-
ing communities and neighbor-
hoods; jobs that pay enough to sus-
tain a family; and services like
grocery stores in all neighborhoods.
Let’s create family development
accounts for college and home own-
ership; neighborhood redevelop-
ment accounts that provide incen-
tives to establish small businesses
in challenged areas; and quality
early education and education sup-
port services that include the build-
ing of YMCAs attached to public
schools to better serve kids and
their families. 

With the well-being of hundreds
of thousands of people hanging in
the balance, isn’t it time that
America forged a new and better
way of serving those in need?

• Mr. Gallagher is the presi-
dent and CEO of the United Way
of America.

Fixing Broken Lives 

 

The customer-first principle is a 
hallmark of successful companies, 
but remains a stubborn challenge 
for public and private agencies. 

(NAPSA)—Millions of students
each year pursue a post-secondary
degree and for many, paying for
their continuing education is a
primary concern.  According to the
U.S. Department of Education,
nearly 73 percent of full-time
undergraduate students receive
some form of financial aid to help
them pay for college.  

During the past decade, an
estimated one million low-income,
academically qualified students
failed to attend college due in part
to financial need, according to the
Lumina Foundation Focus.  

Many high school graduates do
not continue their education
because they lack information
about how to prepare and apply
for college.  

For students seeking financial
aid, Scholarship America, the
nation’s largest nonprofit, private
sector scholarship and educational
support organization, offers the
following tips:

• Ask and learn. Knowledge
truly is power. Learn everything
you can by talking to high school
counselors, college financial aid
administrators, and friends who’ve
already gone through the process.

• Prioritize. Prioritize your
efforts, beginning with the federal
government and then moving on
to state programs and the private
sector for supplemental funds.
Several corporations offer scholar-
ship programs with specific crite-
ria for which you might be a good
fit.  

For instance, Mercedes-Benz
USA offers the annual Drive Your
Future Scholarship Program. This
awards $1 million in scholarship
funding to students who are the
first in their families to attend col-
lege. Visit www.mbusa.com/dri
vefuture for more information.

• Submit a FAFSA. Many stu-
dents refrain from submitting a
free application for federal stu-
dent aid (FAFSA) as they do not
expect to qualify. This is not
always the case. Forms are avail-
able at www.fafsa.ed.gov, through

high school guidance counselors or
by calling 1-800-4-FED-AID.

• Know Your Deadlines.
Applying early often increases
your chances at receiving finan-
cial aid; consider developing a cal-
endar with financial aid deadlines
so you don’t miss opportunities.
Submit forms early so your appli-
cation is quickly processed. 

• Investigate. Online search
engines specializing in financial
assistance for college, such as
www.finaid.org or www.scholar
ships.com are a great resource for
prospective scholarships. 

• Avoid Scams.  If an opportu-
nity sounds too good to be true, it
very well might be. Visit
www.ftc.gov for a list of common
fraudulent scholarship scams.

• Repeat the Process. Many
scholarships and financial aid
packages require you to reapply
each year to sustain funding.
Moreover, requirements frequently
change and new scholarships
become available each year, mak-
ing it crucial to revisit the process
on a regular basis.

Scholarship America has dis-
tributed more than one billion dol-
lars to more than one million stu-
dents by helping communities and
corporations establish scholarship
programs.  

Learn more by visiting:
www.scholarshipamerica.org and
click “For Students” to review
open scholarships and access more
scholarship links and information
on preparing for college.

Paying For College—Get Smart, Start Early

A number of corporations now
offer scholarships to students
who fit a particular profile.

(NAPSA)—When shopping for
kitchen knives, it can pay to have
a sharp eye. But there’s more to
cutlery than just how it looks.
Here are a few cutting-edge tips
from the experts:

1. Choose for comfort. Be-
fore you buy, hold the knives in
your hand. It’s important to have
a good fit, with knives that feel
comfortable when you use them.

2. Feel for balance. A knife
should be properly balanced and
constructed to give maximum
amount of control. If the knife is
well-balanced, it is easier to con-
trol and will be less tiresome.
Extreme weight in a knife is only
needed in cleavers for cutting
through bone.

3. Note the handle shape.
Knife handles should be contoured
to allow the user to hold the knife
naturally. The bolster near the
blade on forged knives is a safety
feature to prevent slipping when
the blade meets resistance.

4. Check the tang. On a qual-
ity knife, the tang (end of the
blade that extends into the han-
dle) will extend the full length and
width of the handle, providing
added strength and balance to the
knife. On molded polypropylene-
handled knives, the tang should
extend well into the handle.

5. Handle design. On quality
cutlery, such as J.A. Henckels Pro-
fessional “S” Series, the handle
scales are usually attached to the

tang with three no-stain rivets to
assure it does not loosen from the
blade. Polypropylene handles
should be permanently bonded to
the tang without seams or gaps.
Stainless steel handles should be
smooth and also permanently
bonded without gaps.

This holiday season, you can
certainly make a point by giving
this special value gift of a top-
quality carving set. The Profes-
sional “S” 2-piece set includes a
meat fork and an 8” carving knife.
Together, they make an excellent
combo for cutting through turkey,
ham, roast beef or whatever holi-
day fare graces the table. The set
is available at fine department
stores and specialty shops. For
additional information, visit the
Web site at www.jahenckels.com.

How To Recognize A Fine Knife

A professional-quality carving
set makes for an excellent holi-
day gift.

(NAPSA)—To reduce your risk
for dry eye, avoid dry environ-
ments and eye irritants such as
dust, pollen and tobacco smoke.
Limit consumption of sodas, alco-
hol and coffee, which usually con-
tain caffeine. Blink more fre-
quently. Increase humidity at
home and work. Remove contact
lenses when traveling by air. Use
lubricating eye drops, such as Gen-
Teal artificial tears, especially at
bedtime. For more information on
dry eye, visit: www.genteal.com.

Older Americans would be wise
to talk to their doctors about a
serious health issue—pneumococ-
cal disease. For more information
about pneumococcal disease, visit
www.niaid.nih.gov/factsheets/pne
umonia.htm.

The professionals at Prescrip-
tion Solutions recommend that
you bring current medications
with you when visiting your
physician(s) to ensure that they
are still needed. Then, once you
know that your prescriptions are
appropriate, it’s important to han-
dle them correctly. Store medica-
tions in a safe, dry place rather
than a damp bathroom medicine
cabinet. Keep all medicines and
vitamins in their correct bottles to

avoid mix-ups. Check to make
sure medications have not expired
and dispose of any that are out-
dated. For more information, visit
www.rxsolutions.com.

Even without the benefits of
insurance coverage or flexible
healthcare spending accounts,
having LASIK may still save peo-
ple money in the long run. When
compared to the cost of glasses or
contacts over a 20-year period,
LASIK becomes the less expensive
option. Glasses, for example,
would cost $6,000 and soft contacts
$12,000, according to industry esti-
mates. And most LASIK patients
would probably agree that you
can’t put a price on the ability to
wake up in the morning and
clearly see your alarm clock.

(NAPSA)—Slow cooking fans
are invited to share their culinary
creations with the nation in the
Second Annual Crock-tober Cook-
Off Recipe Contest, sponsored by
the Crock-Pot brand. For each
recipe entered, the Rival Crock-
Pot brand has pledged to donate
$1, up to a maximum of $5,000 to
the Feed Their Dreams Children’s
Foundation, a national nonprofit
organization devoted to educating
children about nutrition. You can
visit www.crocktober.com for offi-
cial rules and other important
information.

“Betty Crocker Cookbook, 10e:
Everything You Need to Know to
Cook Today” (Wiley Binder,
$29.95) is a complete, one-stop
cookbook with more than 1,000
favorite recipes. The 10th edition
is updated with contemporary
features while still containing the
cherished recipes that have made
this book a favorite, with over 32
million copies sold since 1950.
“Betty Crocker Cookbook, 10e” is
available where books are sold. To
learn more, visit www.wiley.com.

It can be easy to trim the fat
from holiday meals without cut-
ting taste. For instance, Quorn
Foods makes a meatless Turkey-
Style Roast that has two-thirds
less fat than roasted turkey
breast and only 90 calories. If
meatless eating is already on
your holiday menu, you could also
try an indulgent meat-free
Chicken-Style Gruyère Cutlet.
They can be cooked in the toaster
oven, have 11 grams of protein
and 3 grams of fiber. For more
information visit www.quorn.us.

(NAPSA)—A new study, “Tow-
ing Troubles: Danger on Amer-
ica’s Road,” from Master Lock and
Customer Profiles, Ltd., tracks
the safety—or lack thereof—of
the vehicles and trailers being
towed on the roadways of Amer-
ica. Some 57,000 crashes involv-
ing passenger vehicles towing
trailers occur annually, according
to the National Highway Traffic
Safety Association (NHTSA). For
information on safe towing tips,
visit www.masterlock.com.




