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(NAPSA)—River cruising con-
tinues to be a popular trend
among American travelers vaca-
tioning to top destinations such as
Europe, China and Egypt, but is it
right for you? If cruising along a
waterway, taking in beautiful
landscapes and docking at multi-
ple ports to explore exciting desti-
nations sounds appealing, a river
cruise may be the perfect fit for
you. 

Travel experts suggest you ask
the following questions to help
determine whether a river cruise
is the best choice for your next
vacation:

Do you like the idea of trav-
eling to several destinations
without the hassle of living
out of your suitcase?

Imagine traveling to Austria,
Germany and France, only pack-
ing and unpacking once. River
cruises let you visit multiple coun-
tries without the trouble of trans-
ferring luggage from one location
to another. Once you have settled
into your floating hotel room, you
are at home for the duration of
your vacation. When off the ship,
you can focus on your journey,
delving into the history and cul-
ture at each stop.

Are you looking for easy
access to “must-see” sights and
o f f - t h e - b e a t e n - p a t h
destinations?

River cruise vessels are smaller
than most ocean liners, allowing
for docking in the heart of small
towns and villages. This conve-

nience gives passengers additional
time on land, exploring romantic
castles and historic monuments,
visiting local shops or enjoying fa-
vorite beverages at outdoor cafés.
Between land excursions, you’ll
have plenty of time to relax, in-
dulge in fine dining or participate
in various onboard activities, such
as local entertainment.

Do you like to travel in
world-class accommodations?

River cruise ships’ amenities
and the intimate experience they
afford rival world-class boutique
hotels. According to Patrick Clark,
managing director of Avalon
Waterways, of the Globus family
of brands, “Guests traveling with
us enjoy state-of-the-art technol-
ogy and spacious accommodations.
In addition, we provide our pas-
sengers nightly piano music, wine
at dinner, turn-down service each
evening, nonsmoking interiors,

light reading materials, games
and puzzles in each ship library,
English-speaking staff and so
much more, ensuring a pleasur-
able onboard experience.” 

Do you enjoy all-inclusive
offerings and travel plans han-
dled for you?

As you travel from city to city
and country to country on most
river cruises, you won’t have to
worry about paying as you go.
River cruises feature all-inclusive
offerings—air, hotel, cruise, land
tours and meals—that help elimi-
nate the stress and extensive plan-
ning involved with international
travel. With all of the details
planned for you in advance, you’ll
have more free time to relax and
enjoy your vacation. 

For more information about
river cruises, call (877) 380-1535
toll-free or visit www.avalon
waterways.com.

Is River Cruising Right For You?

(NAPSA)—Approximately 20
million U.S. consumers with a
home or small-business network
use it for sharing the Internet and
creating mobility within their
environment. As more people
download movies and music and
generate photos, home videos and
documents, they need a way to
protect and share it. 

Today’s simple network storage
solutions mean you can easily add
centralized storage and automati-
cally back up PCs and Macs on
your network, saving you time
and giving you peace of mind that
your data is protected.

A network attached storage
(NAS) device is a data storage or
protection solution that connects
directly to a home or small-busi-
ness router via a standard Ether-
net port. With the help of auto-
matic network configuration and
discovery software, most NAS
devices install quickly and easily,
so you don’t have to be a network
administrator. The Maxtor Shared
Storage and Seagate’s Mirra Per-
sonal Server are two of the best
examples of NAS devices because
they are simple to use and offer the
best value and functionality.

A consumer NAS box can help
you:  

• Centralize digital content in
one location, making it easier to
find files when needed.

• Share photos, music and doc-
uments easily with family or co-
workers locally on a home or office
network or remotely over the
Internet.

• Protect your files by automat-
ically backing up data on a regular
basis. Most NAS boxes come with
backup software and some even

back up continuously as you make
changes to content and even sync
files automatically between all
your networked Macs or PCs.

• Access your digital life via
the Web anytime, anywhere. 

• Store and stream movies or
photos to your networked televi-
sion to show friends and family. 

• Organize and play music on
your connected stereo during din-
ner parties, social gatherings or
just for fun.

• Connect and share a USB
printer.

• Provide a storage solution
that allows you to designate fold-
ers as either public or private.

• Back up and rotate its con-
tents to a second storage solution
for offsite storage.

• Support up to 20 computer
users, making it ideal for a small
office.

When all these benefits are
combined with ease of use and
security, the result is a must-have
storage and backup solution for
any home or small-business net-
work. For more information, visit
www.maxtorsolutions.com or
www.seagate.com.

Simple Network Attached Storage, 
Not Just For Big Business

Consumer network attached
storage can help you share and
protect music, pictures and doc-
uments in a home or small-busi-
ness environment.

Break Breakouts
(NAPSA)—Although coping

with acne can be one of the hardest
parts of being a teenager, you’re not
in the clear once you reach 21.
Adults can have acne, too, and it
can make them feel just as awk-
ward. Fortunately, new treatments
can help eradicate acne, no matter
what age you are.

Acne is one of the most common
skin disorders in the United
States, affecting 85 percent of
teenagers and 20 percent of adults.

For effective and long-lasting
acne treatment, dermatologists
usually prescribe retinoids to dry
out clogged pores. In addition,
doctors recommend acne patients
include cleansing and moisturiz-
ing as part of treatment. Triax
Pharmaceuticals has developed
Tretin-X (tretinoin), the first and
only prescription retinoid for the
treatment of acne that also pro-
vides cleansing and moisturizing.

“Tretin-X is an exciting addi-
tion in the treatment of acne,”
says renowned Washington, D.C.-
based dermatologist Dr. Hema
Sundaram. “The cleanser and
moisturizer contain green tea
extract and CoQ10, which are
powerful anti-oxidants. The
Tretin-X system is a complete and
effective treatment regimen now
available for acne. It will enable
millions of acne sufferers to
achieve clearer skin.”

Learn more at tretinx.com.

Acne, the scourge of teenagers,
can happen to adults, too.

Charities Take Flight
(NAPSA)—Americans gave

more than 260 billion dollars to
their favorite causes in one year
alone, according to a report by the
American Association of Fundrais-
ing Counsel—and things continue
to look up. 

One reason is that churches,
schools and charities have found
ways to give back to people who
give. For instance, a number of
not-for-profit groups hold charita-
ble silent auctions. Money raised
goes to help a cause, and donors
receive items ranging from art to
nights on the town. 

Some groups even offer hot air
balloon rides. Those charities
partner with an organization
called FundraisingRides.org, a
group that provides not-for-profits
with hot air ballon rides for live
and silent auctions and raffles.
The ride takes about an hour and
is followed by a champagne
toast—an old European tradition.

The balloons take off from any of
Soaring Adventures of America’s
150 certified ballooning locations
nationwide. For more information,
visit www.FundraisingRides.org. 

The Sky’s The Limit—Thousands
of charities are auctioning off hot
air balloon rides to donors. 

(NAPSA)—Long celebrated in
Europe, Rosé is now more popular
than ever among Champagne con-
sumers in the U.S. Produced only
in the Champagne region of
France, Rosé Champagne was
shipped to the United States to
the tune of over 1.3 million bottles
in 2005, a whopping 126 percent
increase over 2003 figures. 

Experts say the increased pop-
ularity of Rosé Champagne in the
U.S. market is due to a variety of
factors. “Whether it is driven by
consumers’ curiosity or by the
aggressive marketing campaigns
of several prominent Champagne
houses, Rosé has become the bub-
bly of choice of many American
wine lovers,” said Office of Cham-
pagne, USA Director Sharon
Castillo. 

The wide spectrum of pink
hues and exceptional flavors
offered by Rosé, as well as its ver-
satility, makes this style of Cham-
pagne a favorite among chefs and
masters of wine. 

“Rosé is not sweet, as one
might infer by its color; it has a lot
more flavors of the Pinot Noir
grape—strawberry and bright red
cherry—combined with great acid-
ity. I have enjoyed Rosé with
grilled veal chops and it did not
miss a beat,” says Barbara Werley,
one of only 13 female Master Som-
meliers in the United States.

A perfect companion for any-

thing pink, from salmon and
turkey to strawberry tarts, Rosé
also enhances every sushi meal.
“Rosé tends to be richer and fuller
flavored so it stands up to rich,
oily-textured sushi,” states Werley.
While Rosé finds its fan base
among women, men are increas-
ingly drawn to it. Shipments are
projected to continue to rise as a
number of Champagne brands
introduce their styles of Rosé to
the U.S. market. So whether en-
joying it with a meal or by itself, it
does not appear that America’s
love affair with Rosé will end any-
time soon. 

To learn more about Rosé, visit
www.champagne.us.

Rosé Earns Its Place With Champagne Lovers

ROSÉ IS NOT SWEET, as one might
infer by its color; it has a lot more
flavors of the Pinot Noir grape—
strawberry and bright red cherry—
combined with great acidity. 

***
Music was my refuge. I could
crawl into the space between
the notes and curl my back to
loneliness.

—Maya Angelou
***

***
Music is the poetry of the air.

—Jean Paul Richter
***

***
Music is the mediator between
the spiritual and the sensual
life. 

—Ludwig van Beethoven
***

***
Music is your own experience,
your thoughts, your wisdom. If
you don’t live it, it won’t come
out of your horn.

—Charlie Parker
***




