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(NAPSA)—Here’s a hint on
keeping your cool during the win-
ter holidays: take a trip down the
frozen aisles of your grocery store.
There you can find “Secret
Weapons” to make holiday enter-
taining easier and more enjoyable.

Remember to shop early and
stock your freezer so you’ll have
secret weapons at your fingertips
for parties, unexpected company,
family and guests.

Try these time-saving, tasty sug-
gestions from the National Frozen
& Refrigerated Foods Association
(NFRA) that will help you go from
the freezer to table in minutes.

• Appetizer Thoughts: In the
frozen food aisle, all ready to heat
and eat are dips, egg rolls, quiche,
cheese sticks, meatballs, shrimp
and more. Serve on attractive hol-
iday platters and you’re ready to
enjoy your guests.

• Side Dish Suggestions:
Frozen vegetables, potatoes, pas-
tas and breads can help make any
holiday meal less work for the
cook for more time with family.

• Brunch Ideas: A freezer full of
frozen muffins, waffles, pancakes,
egg dishes, breakfast bowls, sand-
wiches, bagels and more can make

holiday mornings much more fun
• Delicious Desserts: Start with

delicious frozen pies, cakes, ice
cream and more—then make them
your own by adding special touches.

Try this holiday favorite
“Secret Weapon.”

Pumpkin Pie With 
Ginger Whipped Topping

1 frozen pumpkin pie
1 cup frozen or refrigerated

whipped cream topping
1⁄2 teaspoon ground ginger

In a medium bowl, mix
whipped cream and ginger.
Keep chilled until ready to
serve. Bake pie according to
directions. Serve with dollop
of whipped cream topping.

For more recipes, serving sug-
gestions and food safety tips on
frozen and refrigerated foods from
NFRA, visit www.BringUsToYour
Table.com. 

Holiday “Secret Weapons”

Holiday entertaining can be easy as pie when you stock up with
freezer favorites.

Keep Your Cool At Work
(NAPSA)—It may look like a

tool chest, but it’s a compact
refrigerator and it may just be the
answer to what to get the guy who
has everything.  

The 4.4 cu. ft. refrigerator may
be the perfect gift for the man who
likes nothing more than working
in the garage or workshop.
Intirion’s Craftworks refrigerator
was designed for mechanics, car-
penters and do-it-yourselfers.

Interestingly, studies across
the automotive service industry
point to the link between environ-
mental comfort and productivity.
The Craftworks refrigerator pro-
vides style and usability with its
tool chest look-alike red and black
exterior, a durable and easy-to-
clean countertop surface and a
locking system to keep contents
secure. The lighted black interior
offers plenty of storage space and
the smart door design holds two-
liter and half-gallon bottles. It
even has heavy-duty locking cast-
ers—just like name brand tool
chests.

To learn more, visit www.craft
worksfridge.com or call 1-800-577-
8041.

A MOVEABLE FEAST—This tool-
chest-style fridge even has
heavy-duty locking casters.

(NAPSA)—With only a few
weeks between Thanksgiving and
Christmas, the holidays can be a
very busy time. Among the many
items on people’s “to-do” lists is
sending cards and presents to
friends and loved ones. Since time
is of the essence during this hectic
season, here are a few practical
tips to save you time...and help
ensure that your holiday parcels
arrive on-time: 

How to best address: When
addressing holiday packages,
make sure both the delivery and
return addresses are printed on
only one side of the box. This will
help avoid confusion when parcels
are sorted. And, addresses should
be bold enough to be read from an
arm’s length away. If your pen-
manship is not always legible,
consider creating address labels
on your home computer. Not only
will it make the addresses easier
to read by the delivery person, but
the labels can be saved on your
computer and used year after
year!

International exchange: If
you are sending packages interna-
tionally, print the delivery and
return addresses in all uppercase
letters, and if possible, limit each
address to five lines. Save yourself
time at the post office by going
online, printing out any necessary
declaration forms from your home
computer, and filling them out
before you head out the door. 

Store more: Having some
boxes, packaging tape and pack-
ing materials handy at home can
save you the time and hassle of
having to purchase these supplies
and pack your items at the point
of shipping. In fact, new Scotch
packing noodles from 3M are easy

to store year-round, because
they’re sold in compact “slices.” To
package an item, simply break a
slice into a box, place your item
inside, surround it with more noo-
dles, then seal the box. The
unique interlocking shape of
Scotch packing noodles resists the
settling of items to the bottom of
the box, where they are most
likely to be broken or damaged
during transit. And, gift recipients
will appreciate that packing
noodles have no static cling—
which means no filler material
sticking to them or their furniture
when unpacking.

Don’t be boxed in: Need a
box, but don’t have a new one
handy? In a matter of minutes,
you can make an old box new
again. Simply use a utility knife
to carefully cut the entire length
of one edge of the box. Then, turn
the box inside-out so that the
“clean” side is now the exterior.
Use Scotch packaging tape to seal
the cut edge.

Time Saving Tips To Get Packages To Arrive On-Time

Avoid the holiday shipping rush
by keeping supplies, such as
packing noodles, at home instead
of purchasing at the last minute.

(NAPSA)—With the holiday
season upon us, thoughts are
turning toward holiday shopping
lists.  This year, you may wish to
incorporate a few healthy gift
ideas into the usual list of gifts.
The best ones are those that the
whole family can enjoy together,
all year round. Here are some
ideas for integrating healthy gifts
into the holiday season.

• Hit the trails! Give each
member of your family a pair of
hiking boots along with a book
that the whole family can enjoy on
local hiking hot spots. It’s a great
way to get in shape and learn
about the environment, too.

• Bikes aren’t just for kids.
Although they are tops on every
child’s list, parents can also join
the fun. Riding together either
each day or on weekend picnics is
an ideal way to weave exercise
into a regular routine—an impor-
tant lesson for all.

• “What’s for dinner?” It’s
never too early or late to learn
about healthy eating habits.
Treat the entire family to a cook-
ing class. There are classes that
are geared for younger children,
too. Choose one that focuses on
healthy, simple cooking and uses
lots of fresh fruits and vegetables.

• Drink up! Encourage your
family to drink enough water year
round. Brita’s new Water Cooler
makes this easier by giving your
family lots of great-tasting health-
ier water. They even have models
that allow you to get hot and cold
filtered water on demand. Best of

all, the Cooler uses the same Brita
filters you are familiar with to
remove 98% of lead that may be in
tap water (though the substances
removed or reduced may not be
the same in all users’ water) but
keep in the fluoride that’s impor-
tant for healthy teeth.

• Develop your mind and
test your memory. Puzzles and
board games that the whole fam-
ily can enjoy are a great way to
spend time together. After dinner,
turn off the television and encour-
age some quality family time.   

With a little creativity you can
find lots of options for including
unique and healthy gifts into the
coming gift-giving season—what
better way to celebrate the holidays
than with gifts that help develop a
lifetime of healthy habits. 

Healthy Presents And Family Fun
(NAPSA)—Many migraine suf-

ferers rely on over-the-counter
(OTC) pain relievers to fight the
pain. A recent study, published in
the journal “Headache,” finds
many of those not finding relief
with a commonly used OTC treat-
ment have an effective option. In
the study, 81 percent of migraine
sufferers who did not respond
well to Excedrin-Migraine experi-
enced significant headache relief
(mild or no pain) two hours after
taking Relpax® (eletriptan HBr), a
migraine-specific prescription
treatment in a class of drugs called
triptans. Patients also received
significant relief of migraine-
associated symptoms at two
hours. In the study, patients knew
they were taking Relpax to treat
their migraine. For more informa-
tion about Relpax, including full
prescribing information, visit
www.relpax.com or call 1-866-4-
RELPAX.

Moisture loss from skin is at its
highest at midnight and decreases
until noon. This means skin bene-
fits from hydration most during
the night. A slight elevation in
skin temperature in the evening
may also enhance the penetration
of topically applied products such
as moisturizers. That’s why NIVEA
body introduced Renewal Night
Creme and Lotion and Restorative
Night Hand Creme, which inaugu-
rated an entire new category in
body care. These products help to
smooth, firm and strengthen the
skin so it feels noticeably softer in
the morning and skin is improved

over time. You can learn more at
www.niveausa.com. 

What’s the leading cause of
death of teenage girls worldwide?
While traffic accidents are respon-
sible for more teenage deaths in
the United States, pregnancy and
childbirth are the leading causes.
The reason: Girls in many poor
countries are marrying as young
as 11 or 12 and having children be-
fore they are physically ready to be-
come mothers. For more informa-
tion, visit www.savethechildren.org.

Most people with multiple scle-
rosis are diagnosed between the
ages of 20 and 50. It causes symp-
toms ranging from weakness to
total paralysis that can come and
go without warning. There are
approximately 400,000 Americans
living with MS. Counting family
members, friends and caregivers,
the disease affects over three mil-
lion people. To learn more about
family life and living well with
MS, visit the National MS Soci-
ety’s online library of free publi-
cations at www.nationalmssoci
ety.org (some are available in Spa-
nish), or call 1-800-FIGHT MS.

***
Parents often talk about the
younger generation as if they did-
n’t have anything to do with it.

—Haim Ginott
***

***
The one thing children wear out
faster than shoes is parents.  

—John J. Plomp
***

***
As a child my family’s menu con-
sisted of two choices: take it, or
leave it.

—Buddy Hackett
***

***
Insanity is hereditary—you get
it from your kids.

—Sam Levenson
***




