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(NAPSA)—In France, they call
it “orange peel.” In America, it’s
“cottage cheese.” And on babies,
it’s simply “adorable.” But by any
other name, cellulite—and its
many forms of treatment—is, cat-
egorically, big business and highly
controversial. Why? Because an
antidote for the unsightly bumps
and unevenness it imparts on the
skin—especially around the but-
tocks, hips and thighs—remains
elusive despite the surplus of
products currently available.

Cellulite is a nonmedical term
to describe the waffle-textured fat
found on the buttocks and thighs
of many women. It can begin to
appear in girls around age 14 and
tends to increase as they mature.
Cellulite can also form in postna-
tal women and those who take
birth control pills because the
waste system can’t get rid of the
high flow of estrogen in the body.

Cellulite doesn’t just target
those who are overweight—it can
be found on very thin women as
well. However, cellulite does tend
to develop in the areas where
women are genetically pro-
grammed to store fat: hips and
thighs. In fact, women have six
times more fat-receiving cells in
these areas than the upper body,
and the higher percentage of fat
there is in an area, the more likely
it is that cellulite will appear.

Treatment options that some
women have tried include mas-
sage; endermologie, a machine-
assisted massage system that
reduces the appearance of cel-
lulite; and lymphatic drainage
massage, which helps boost the
functions of the lymphatic system,
encouraging the removal and fil-

tering of waste, toxins and excess
fluids from cells as well as boost-
ing the body’s natural immunity.

Another option is a clinically
proven product that features a
novel combination of powerful,
natural, anti-aging ingredients.
Nivea Body Reshaping Treatment
works:

• By enhancing the level of
skin’s own coenzyme Q10, a nat-
ural ingredient found in the body
that helps skin remain firm, toned
and young looking.

• With Active Soy Extract
derived from the soy plant, an
effective ingredient that helps
support the natural regeneration
of collagen in the skin and makes
skin appear less dimpled.

Nivea Body Reshaping Treat-
ment does not contain caffeine or
nicotine and the nourishing, ultra-
hydrating formula is light,
absorbs quickly and is dermatolo-
gist tested. To learn more, visit
www.niveausa.com.

Cellulite: What You Should Know

A new product can help women
reduce the appearance of cellulite.

(NAPSA)—For many, winter is
not always a wonderland. As skies
gray and temperatures drop,
moods often drift into doldrums.
In fact, according to the American
Academy of Family Physicians, up
to 20 percent of Americans experi-
ence some form of “winter blues.”   

“Low moods can indicate that
our bodies are lacking some nutri-
ents, which can cause lack of con-
centration, feeling disconnected
and unwarranted cravings,” says
registered dietitian Rachel Agnew.  

Agnew offers five simple tips to
replenish the body and BOOST
moods during the dreary winter
months.

• Be good to your body: An
unhealthy diet leads to an
unhealthy mind. Make sure to eat
a balanced diet rich in fruits and
vegetables. Concentrate on con-
suming fish and other high-qual-
ity proteins while avoiding refined
sugars, which can alter your
mood. I also recommend taking a
daily multivitamin that contains
folate and important B vitamins
such as B6, B12 and thiamine
that can be depleted when the
body is stressed.

• Opt for a natural mood lifter:
S-adenosylmethionine, better
known as SAM-e, is a naturally
occurring compound produced by
the body. There is a direct correla-
tion between low levels of SAM-e
and low mood. But buyer beware,
not all SAM-e supplements are cre-
ated equal. Make sure you go with
a reputable manufacturer that uses
Pharmaceutical Grade SAM-e. In
addition, look for enteric-coated
SAM-e that is preferably blister-
packed to ensure stability. Agnew
recommends Nature Made Mood-
Plus SAM-e.

• Omm...find your center: Pur-
sue meditative physical activities
to improve the body and mind.
Yoga is a great way to channel
energy and clear the mind of
stressful thoughts through bal-
ance, stretching, and breathing. A
subject of much clinical research,
yoga breathing and meditative
practices have been found to help
relieve feelings of anxiety.  

• Seek Support from Family &
Friends: Withdrawal is a classic
symptom of the winter blues.
Socializing with friends and fam-
ily engages the mind and forces
you to think constructively, help-
ing to overcome feelings of loss
and confusion.

• Try To Get Some Exercise:
As always, exercise is an impor-
tant part of feeling good. Just a
ten-minute walk indoors on a
treadmill or outdoors in the fresh
air, three times a day is enough to
help regain energy.  

In addition to Agnew’s tips, she
always recommends consulting a
health care professional first to
develop a personalized strategy
for combating low moods. To find
out more information on winter
blues visit www.naturemade.com. 

Don’t Let Winter Put A Damper On Your Mood 
Expert Offers Five Tips To Help Boost Spirits

(NAPSA)—Winter comes with a
unique set of special aromas: pine
needles, wood burning in the fire-
place, hot apple cider with cinna-
mon, freshly baked treats. But all
too often, with doors and windows
closed, those wonderful scents are
blunted or masked by household pet
odors. Plus, the smells are continu-
ally recirculated by the furnace vents
and build up to unpleasant levels
that greet your guests at the front
door.

To stop nasty pet odors, the
soiled areas and smells must
be completely eliminated—and
household cleaners can’t quite get
the job done. The reason is that
pet urine, when dry, takes on a
crystalline form that is impervi-
ous even to bleach. Now, by using
advanced bio-enzymatic technol-
ogy, a new formula goes to the
heart of the matter, and actually
attacks and breaks down the
urine salt crystal deposits—
thereby allowing specialized bac-
teria to digest the odor-causing
elements.

For complete household odor
elimination, you must treat all
your pet's accident spots, even the
ones you can’t see. By using a spe-
cialized “black light,” you can
make hidden urine glow brightly
for easy detection. Shine it along
the rug, wall or baseboard to
instantly locate, treat and elimi-
nate those stinky spots.

You can’t open the windows in
winter, but you can return the
fresh-air smell to your house and
greet guests and family with the

wonderful smells of the holiday
season with today’s high-tech
solutions. For example, one called
Urine-Off ™ easily eliminates urine
odor permanently. The product
works on fresh pet accidents and
old set-in deposits. Simply spray
and allow to dry for most sur-
faces—no guesswork or mixing
needed.

The spray is so effective it has
already been endorsed and sold by
thousands of veterinary clinics
and is the official odor-control
product for the world’s largest dog
show. Also available is a Urine-
Finder™ battery-powered black
light with an optimized wave-
length to expose even the faintest
of urine deposits.

To find out more about how bio-
enzymatic formulas work to elimi-
nate odors using a black light for
pinpoint location, additional pet
cleanup techniques and puppy
and kitten housebreaking tips,
visit www.urine-off.com.

Don’t Let Household Pet Odors 
Spoil Your Winter Wonderland

No matter how you try to cover
them, pet odors may still circu-
late in the house.

by: Barbara Dixon, LDN, RD
(NAPSA)—Widening waistlines

are a concern for most Americans,
but new research shows that we
all have much to gain and more
inches to lose by including more
milk in our daily diets. 

It’s time to start thinking about
eating better. About half of all
African American women are con-
sidered obese, and therefore more
likely at risk for developing dis-

eases such as
heart disease,
hypertension
and diabetes.
In addition,
many African
Americans fall
short of meet-
ing daily nu-
t r i t i o n a l

needs. For example, more than 75
percent of African Americans fail to
meet current calcium recommen-
dations. The common misconcep-
tion that all African Americans are
lactose intolerant has led many to
avoid milk and dairy products,
which are the highest dietary
sources of calcium. 

The good news is that small
changes in your diet can lead to
big changes in your health. One
step to slimming your waistline
and getting the nutrients you need
may be as easy as drinking a glass
of milk. It’s no secret that milk
provides nine essential vitamins
and nutrients, such as calcium
and vitamin D, but new research
from the University of Tennessee
shows that dairy foods may also
help you lose weight and body fat,
especially in your stomach area. 

The study consisted of obese
African American adults who typi-
cally drank little or no milk.
Researchers found that when the

number of servings of milk and
milk products was increased to
three per day, participants lost
more body fat than those who
drank only one glass or less. Plus,
they preserved lean muscle mass.
The research also found that
when participants increased their
dairy servings to three and re-
duced total calories by 500 per
day, they lost about twice as much
weight and body fat.

If you do not already drink the
recommended three servings of
milk a day, now there’s another
good reason to start. Adding more
milk to your diet is relatively easy.
Below are simple ways to incorpo-
rate milk into your daily routine.

• Start your day with cereal
and milk for breakfast.

• Instead of black coffee, enjoy
a skim latte made with milk.

• Make a delicious smoothie
with milk, your favorite fruit and
ice.

• Have a glass of milk at bed-
time (and sleep like a baby!).

• If you think you have symp-
toms of lactose intolerance, see
your doctor or dietitian to help
determine how much milk you can
drink with little discomfort.

• Try lactose-free or lactose-
reduced milk since they contain
all the same nutrients, including
calcium, as regular milk.

As a registered dietitian, I con-
stantly remind my patients of the
important nutritional and health
benefits of calcium. Choosing
three servings of foods naturally
high in calcium, such as milk and
other dairy foods, helps to meet
daily dietary requirements. Now,
with the added possibility of trim-
ming a stubborn waistline, enjoy-
ing milk provides an additional
“bonus.”

Milk—It Does a Body (And Your Waistline) Good
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Book Loved By Generations

(NAPSA)—C’est fantastique!
The 19 tongue-in-cheek tales
found in the French children’s
classic “Nicholas” (Phaidon Press,
$19.95) don’t just offer the smile-
provoking adventures of an only
child named Nicholas “often at
odds with adults in the world.”

They also give young readers an
insightful glimpse into everyday
French life and culture.

Written by René Goscinny with
illustrations by Jean-Jacques
Sempé, whose cartoons appear in
The New Yorker, the book has
been a best-seller since it was first
released in 1959, elevating this
fictional “every boy” to a literary
cult figure. It’s the first time the
book is available in English for an
American audience.

The young hero is easy to
relate to, making this reading
primer a great gift for yet another
generation of young readers.
“Nicholas Again,” the second of
the American series, will be avail-
able at all major bookstores in
Spring 2006. For more informa-
tion, visit www.phaidon.com. 

Considered a classic children’s
reading primer, “Nicholas” is
about an energetic schoolboy
who is forever finding himself in
some kind of trouble.

***
The test for whether or not
you can hold a job should not
be the arrangement of your
chromosomes.

—Bella Abzug
***

***
Great necessities call out great
virtues.

—Abigail Adams
***

***
Show me the books he loves and
I shall know the man far better
than through mortal friends.

—Dawn Brooks
***

***
The penalty of success is to be
bored by people who used to
snub you.

—Nancy Astor
***




