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(NAPSA)—Diabetes, one of the
most common chronic diseases in
school-aged children, is now afflict-
ing more children than ever before. 

Each year, more than 13,000
children are diagnosed with type 1
diabetes in the U.S. In addition,
the percentage of children diag-
nosed with type 2 diabetes in the
U.S. has increased. Before 1994, it
accounted for less than 5 percent of
all newly diagnosed diabetes cases
in children, but subsequently it
has come to represent 30-50 per-
cent. Fortunately, there are a vari-
ety of resources, tips and tools to
help make diabetes management
easier for kids and their families. 

A Team Effort 
One of the most important tips

is for parents to view the manage-
ment of their child’s diabetes as a
team effort. Everyone who has a
potential impact on the manage-
ment of the child’s diabetes has a
role to play, including the child,
parents, doctors, diabetes educa-
tors and even nonmedical profes-
sionals, such as coaches and
schoolteachers. It’s important for
these people to simply know that
your child has diabetes. They also
need to understand any special
needs the child may have for man-
aging it, such as the need for a
snack, or an opportunity to check
their blood sugar during the school
day, or at a game or practice, etc. 

Resources to Help
A great resource for kids with

diabetes is diabetes camp. These
camps, located across the country,
are a great way for kids with dia-
betes to enjoy all of the regular
fun of summer camp, while meet-
ing other kids with diabetes and
learning how to better manage
the disease. Diabetes camps also
offer parents some much-needed
time off from their own duties in
the daily management of their
child’s condition, as many of the
camp counselors and personnel

are trained diabetes health care
professionals. 

There are also annual diabetes
conferences and Web sites. For
example, the nonprofit organiza-
tion Taking Control of Your Dia-
betes and the online community
ChildrenwithDiabetes.com offer
conferences that provide opportu-
nities for parents and their chil-
dren to meet and hear from top
physicians, educators, celebrities
and others to learn about the latest
in diabetes care and research in an
environment that’s fun for both the
kids and their families. 

Web sites can offer helpful infor-
mation for parents and kids. On
ChildrenwithDiabetes.com, for
example, there are also online
forums and chat rooms where par-
ents, and their kids with diabetes,
can share ideas and information
with each other. 

New Tools Available
In addition to the resources and

communities available to people
with diabetes, it’s important for
parents and kids to take advantage
of the technology that’s available to
help ease some of the burdens of
diabetes management. 

“It’s really important to have a
good blood glucose meter, and
thanks to technological advances,
blood sugar testing has become
easy and convenient,” says Lance

Porter, editor in chief of the maga-
zine Diabetes Positive!

Porter notes that parents
should consider a small, simple
blood glucose meter for their child.
One example he cites is the One-
Touch® UltraMini™ System. “This
meter provides an accurate result
in just five seconds, and its small
size makes it easy for kids to han-
dle and take with them in their
pocket or school backpack.” 

The meter now also comes in a
variety of colors, which may be fun
for kids. 

For kids who need insulin, liv-
ing with diabetes does not have to
mean a lifetime of injections,
scheduled meals and prearranged
activities. An insulin pump, an
alternative to daily injections, has
been shown to provide better blood
glucose control—plus a freer, more
flexible life. With insulin pump
therapy, kids can sleep late, eat
when they want and play on their
schedule. 

“Again, technology has come to
our aid here,” says Porter. “Pumps
are great because they eliminate
the need to inject yourself with a
syringe multiple times a day and
they offer the user flexibility with
their schedule.” 

One of the newest devices, the
Animas® 2020 Insulin Pump, has
a number of features, including a
color screen and customized 500-
food database right in the pump.
This makes it easier to dose
insulin more accurately, right on
the spot, to compensate for what-
ever food is eaten. This is great
news for kids, whose eating
habits are not always very struc-
tured. The pump is also water-
proof, making it easy for kids to
enjoy swimming and other water
activities. 

For more resources to help kids
and their families manage dia-
betes, visit www.DiabetesAnd
Kids.com. 

Tips To Help You And Your Child Better Manage Diabetes

A variety of resources and tools
are available to help make dia-
betes management easier for
kids and their families. 

(NAPSA)—When it comes to
your all-terrain vehicle (ATV), it
pays to keep your feet on the
ground when it comes to insuring
it. You may think it’s covered by
your homeowners policy, but are
you really protected? Your “toy”
wasn’t cheap, and lacking the right
type of insurance coverage could
lead to a sticky financial situation.

“Owners should think of ATVs
the same way they think of motor-
cycles,” said Rick Stern, product
manager, The Progressive Group
of Insurance Companies. “You’d
never consider getting on a motor-
cycle without the proper insur-
ance, and you shouldn’t ride an
ATV without the right coverage
either.”

If you’re not sure what to do
about your ATV insurance needs,
here are a few things to consider: 

Your homeowners policy
might not be enough. Most
likely, your homeowners policy
only covers your ATV if trouble
occurs on your property. Anywhere
else and you’ll be exposed. Look
for an affordable ATV insurance
policy that offers coverage no mat-
ter where you are. Trail riders
should be aware that many states
require ATV insurance for vehicles
operated on state-owned land.

What about theft? ATVs are
portable and can be easy targets
for thieves. You should consider
ATV insurance that provides cover-
age for things such as theft, fire
and vandalism—just like the kind
you can get for a motorcycle. Theft,
fire and vandalism are covered by
Comprehensive coverage, an

optional physical damage coverage.
Consider uninsured and

underinsured coverage. You
never know what can happen in
the great outdoors. This relatively
inexpensive coverage protects you
if another rider causes damage to
you and he or she lacks adequate
coverage. 

Keep your rates low. You can
do a number of things to save
money on your ATV insurance,
including maintaining a clean
driving record, staying free of
claims or choosing a less “sporty”
ATV. In addition, most insurers
offer a discount if you insure more
than one vehicle on your policy, or
have more than one policy with
the company. This could mean
additional savings on your car,
motorcycle, boat or RV insurance. 

For more information about
ATV insurance or to find an inde-
pendent agent, visit the Web site
at progressiveagent.com. 

Tips To Ensure Your ATV Is Properly Covered

ATVs are fun to own, but a home-
owners policy only covers you if
trouble happens on your property. 

(NAPSA)—It’s 5:00 p.m. Do you
know where your dinner is? Most
moms would admit they don’t and
so begins the weekday kitchen
“rush hour.” 

Use these tips to introduce fun
and organized ways to eat as a
family. With the following tips,
time-management tricks and tech-
nology aids, easier meal prepara-
tion can help the whole family get
a great dinner report card. 

Breakfast For Dinner
A leisurely breakfast of

omelets, pancakes and sausage is
more often seen in the movies
than at your busy breakfast table.
Try these as a dinner dish when
family has time to enjoy them.

Finger Foods
Make appetizer trays of fruit,

vegetables, cheese and crackers,
mini sandwiches, hot dogs on
sticks—anything that can be tack-
led by hand...literally. Mimic your
favorite family restaurant’s best
appetizers as a starting place. 

Pasta Presto
Let your kids pick the pasta

shape; you pick the sauce and,
presto, you can check a weeknight
off your list.

Some Assembly Required
Whether it’s pizza, tacos or

baked potatoes, set up a topping
bar where family members can
create their own version of each.
Meal assembly franchises such as
Dream Dinners give families the
ability to prepare a month’s worth
of healthy meals in advance. Try
this at home by setting up your
own little assembly line by load-

ing up ordinary plastic storage
containers with all of the neces-
sary ingredients. This way every-
one can pitch in.

Soup & Sandwich
So many restaurants offer a

soup and sandwich special—it’s a
hearty, healthy and wholesome
combo. Brands such as Campbell’s
offer nutritious soups and recipes
on the back of the can, making
dinner a snap.  

Sunday Expressway
Sunday, Sunday, Sunday. Treat

Sunday like the main event and
make as many meals as you can
in one afternoon to fulfill an entire
week’s menu. It may sound ambi-
tious, but it’s amazing how cook-
ing when you’re relaxed is a great
deal more enjoyable than during
the midst of a weekday “rush
hour.” Prepare two, three or even
five meals in one afternoon in
between watching the kids play in
the backyard, reading the Sunday
paper and cleaning the house. 

Kids Cook
Place your kids’ 10 favorite

meal menus in a clearly marked
folder and let them choose what to
make. Making life even easier, the
appliance you trust most for chil-
dren to use—the microwave—has
received an update to cook like an
oven, only faster. The Whirlpool
Gold® Velos™ oven has a no-
brainer kid’s menu with prepro-
grammed menu items such as
chicken nuggets, pizza and hot
dogs. Ask an appliance retailer to
demonstrate the Velos™ or visit
www.whirlpool.com.

Learn To Avoid The Dinner Time Crunch

(NAPSA)—Increasingly, cruise
lines are expanding their
embarkation ports to include
those easily accessible by dri-
ving—such as Philadelphia.
Ports such as Philadelphia also
offer exclusive packages for
cruise passengers. To learn more
about cruising from Philadel-
phia, call (856) 968-2052 or visit
www.cruisephilly.com. 

**  **  **
Cooler weather means pests

may be targeting your house for a
warm hideout. Pest-proofing your
home now can prevent these
unwanted guests from settling in
for the winter. To learn more pest-
proofing tips, visit www.orkin.com
or call (800) 800-ORKIN. 

**  **  **
The FINRA Investor Education

Foundation launched the Military
Financial Education Campaign to
provide service members and
their families with unbiased
financial education information
and tools. For additional informa-
tion, visit the Web site at
www.SaveAndInvest.org.

**  **  **
If you’re in debt, you may want

to consult a credit counselor about
a Debt Management Program
such as those offered by InCharge
Debt Solutions, a nonprofit credit
counseling organization. In these
programs, the counselor works
directly with creditors on your
behalf. For information, visit
www.incharge.org or call 877-599-
0082.

**  **  **
A poster contest asking stu-

dents to show the many faces of
chemistry is getting a good reac-
tion from kindergartners to 12th
graders across the nation. To
learn more about the contest, con-

tact the American Chemical Soci-
ety at (800) 227-5558, ext. 6097. 

**  **  **
A new study shows that an

over-the-counter, topical fluid
called Zestra could help women
deal with sexual arousal prob-
lems and a lack of desire. To
learn more, visit the Web site
www.zestra.com. 

**  **  **
An entire new generation of

online sellers is freeing itself from
the office, the commute and its
bosses thanks to a creative way to
sell merchandise online. To learn
more, visit www.zippi.com.

**  **  **
A recent review of research in

the Journal of the American Col-
lege of Nutrition suggests that
children who eat meals with their
families consume healthier foods.
To help kids learn more about
making healthy food choices, send
them to www.oliville.com.

**  **  **
Motorized Doorglass Blinds

from ODL meet Americans with
Disabilities Act requirements,
adding a measure of convenience
for homes that must accommodate
aging adults or disabled individu-
als. For more information or to
locate an nearby dealer, visit
www.odl.com.

***
Always be nice to those younger
than you, because they are the
ones who will be writing about
you.

Cyril Connolly
***

***
The most aggravating thing
about the younger generation
is that I no longer belong to it.

—Albert Einstein
***

***
Youth is the best time to be rich,
and the best time to be poor.

—Euripides
***

***
You are only young once, and if
you work it right, once is
enough.

—Joe E. Lewis
***




